

BID 2023-09
Pavement Marking
OPENING: 4/13/23, 2:00 p.m.
“Unofficial Results”

GROUP A – WATERBORNE ACRYLIC - REFLECTORIZED

		OH Striping	Seneca Pavement	Accent Stripe
CENTERLINE (YELLOW)	Per Mile	400.00	458.00	495.00
EDGE LINE (WHITE)	Per Centerline Mile(x2)	460.00	676.00	690.00
TOTAL PER MILE APPLICATION		860.00	1,134.00	1,185.00
RAILROAD MARKINGS	Each	550.00	375.00	850.00
HAZARD MARKING	LF	2.00	2.50	2.75
LETTERING/ARROWS	Each	120.00	200.00	175.00
STOP/YIELD BARS	Each	55.00	75.00	95.00

GROUP B – AIRPORT MARKINGS

		OH Striping	Seneca Pavement	Accent Stripe
LUMP SUM APPLICATION				
WATERBORNE ACRYLIC PAINT TAXIWAY LINES (YELLOW)		6,600.00	10,130.00	No Bid
WATERBORNE ACRYLIC PAINT RUNWAY MARKINGS (WHITE)		22,750.00	68,688.00	No Bid

GROUP C – EPOXY - REFLECTORIZED

		OH Striping	Seneca Pavement	Accent Stripe
Yellow Epoxy ReflectORIZED Centerline - 20 mils Thickness, Without Layout	Per Center Mile	2,534.00	2,750.00	3,369.00
White Epoxy ReflectORIZED Edgeline - 20 mils Thickness, Without Layout	Per Side Mile	1,953.00	1,950.00	2,121.00
White Epoxy ReflectORIZED Pavement Letters - 20 mils Thickness, Without Layout	Each	120.00	200.00	75.00
White Epoxy ReflectORIZED Pavement Symbols – 20 mils Thickness, Without Layout	Each	200.00	350.00	250.00

3M ALL WEATHER PAINT

		OH Striping	Seneca Pavement	Accent Stripe
3M All-Weather Paint 20 (White) ReflectORIZED Pavement Stripes – 20 mils Wet Thickness Without Layout	Linear Foot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3M All-Weather Paint 20 (Yellow) ReflectORIZED Pavement Stripes – 20 mils Wet Thickness Without Layout	Linear Foot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3M All-Weather Paint 20 (White) ReflectORIZED Pavement Letters – 20 mils mm Wet Thickness	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3M All-Weather Paint 20 (White) ReflectORIZED Pavement Symbols – 20 mils Wet Thickness	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid