

ARCHITECTURE

850 NORTH CROOKS, SUITE 200
CLAWSON, MICHIGAN 48017-1311

248-658-7777 P H O N E

248-658-7781 F A X

mail@straubpettityaste.com

www.straubpettityaste.com

PLANNING

INTERIOR DESIGN



**Straub
Pettitt
Yaste**

In account with

File No. 2015.09
Invoice No. 21
April 1, 2017

Mr. Edgar Roy III
Kuhn Rogers PLC
412 South Union Street
P.O. Box 987
Traverse City, MI 49685-0987

RE: THE MAPLES, BENZIE COUNTY MEDICAL CARE FACILITY

Professional services rendered on the above-referenced project for the month of March, 2017 in accordance with our proposal letter dated July 2, 2015.

ARCHITECTURAL/ENGINEERING SERVICES:

March 1, 2017 – Review Steve Girard letter. Email exchange with Tom Longenbach and multiple other emails. Principal/Architect – 1.0 hour x \$150.00 =	\$ 150.00
March 3, 2017 – Two calls from Nadine Renbauger (CMS) and follow-up with emails. Principal/Architect – 2.0 hour x \$150.00 =	300.00
March 6, 2017 – Call from Bruce Wexelberg (CMS). Principal/Architect – 1.0 hour x \$150.00 =	150.00
March 7, 2017 – Review two Ed Roy emails. Revise and email New ELA claims summary. Principal/Architect – 4.0 hours x \$150.00 =	600.00
March 8, 2017 – Multiple email exchanges with Ed Roy. Principal/Architect – 1.0 hour x \$150.00 =	150.00
March 9, 2017 – Receive and review email from Bruce Wexelberg. Principal/Architect – 3.0 hours x \$150.00 =	450.00
March 10, 2017 – Review email from Bruce Wexelberg and respond with two emails. Email to Kathy Dube. Principal/Architect – 2.0 hours x \$150.00 =	300.00

Page 2
April 1, 2017
Invoice #21
RE: The Maples

March 16, 2017 – Email to Bruce Wexelberg. Call from Jan Suzuki (CMS). Principal/Architect – 2.0 hours x \$150.00 =	\$ 300.00
March 17, 2017 – Emails to Kathy Dube, Ed Hale, Jan Suzuki. Multiple emails to Ed Roy. Principal/Architect – 3.0 hours x \$150.00 =	450.00
March 20, 2017 – Email to Ed Hale and Larry Horvath. Principal/Architect – 2.0 hours x \$150.00 =	300.00
March 21, 2017 – Email to Larry Horvath. Call to Ed Roy. Principal/Architect – 2.0 hours x \$150.00 =	300.00
March 23, 2017 – Emails to Michelle Thompson, Tom Longanbach, Larry Horvath, multiple Ed Roy. Principal/Architect – 3.0 hours x \$150.00 =	450.00
March 27, 2017 – Review email from Larry Horvath. Email report to Ed Roy. Principal/Architect – 1.0 hour x \$150.00 =	150.00
March 28, 2017 – Review and respond to emails from Ed Roy. Principal/Architect – 1.0 hour x \$150.00 =	150.00
March 30, 2017 – Review email from Bruce Wexelberg to Tom Hart. Email to Ed Roy, Mitch Deisch, Tom Loganbach, Corry Carland. Email exchange with Kathy Dube. Principal/Architect – 1.0 hour x \$150.00 =	<u>150.00</u>
TOTAL 29 HOURS =	<u>\$ 4,350.00</u>