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Morristown City Council 
Agenda Item Summary 

 
Date:  July 26, 2019 
 
Agenda Item:  Police and Fire Uniform Bid 
 
Prepared by:  Joey Barnard 
 
Subject:  Awarding of Bid – Uniforms 
  
Background/History:  The City of Morristown provides uniforms for the Fire and Police 
Departments.  The uniforms are purchased on an as-needed basis with officers and 
firefighters receiving uniforms on an annual basis.  This bid is for two years.  
 
Findings/Current Activity:  The bid for these uniforms were solicited.  The bids were 
advertised in the Citizen Tribune on June 27, 2019 and on June 30, 2019.  Additionally, the 
bid was posted to the City of Morristown’s website, and on Vendor Registry, an on-line bid 
facilitation website.  The bid deadline was on Tuesday July 16, 2019.   Three (3) bids were 
received.   
 
Financial Impact: Funds have been appropriated in the budget for uniforms for the Police 
and Fire Departments.  
  
Action options/Recommendations: It is Police Departments’ recommendation to accept 
the best and lowest bid from Summit Uniforms for all uniform items for the Police 
Department.  It should be noted that BK Graphics bid a cheaper polo shirt option, item 
number (23) twenty-three on the bid tabulation; however, these shirts are for 
administration and minimal quantities will be ordered. Also, Summit Uniforms has 
majority of staff sizes on file from previous year purchases and purchasing these from 
Summit Uniforms will allow the department to keep the same style as prior year uniforms.  
It is Fire Departments’ recommendation to split the bid amongst two vendors and to accept 
the best and lowest bid from BK Graphics on Tee Shirts, item number (5) five on the bid 
tabulation, and all other uniform items to Summit Uniforms.  It should be noted that 
Summit Uniforms does not meet specifications on tee shirts, item number (5) five on the bid 
tabulation.        
 
Attachments:  Bid Tabulations 
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Bidder Summit Uniforms BKT Uniforms BK Graphics

Police

1 Police Uniform - Class A Style Trousers No Bid

Blauer 66.74$                            

Elbeco 73.56$                            84.92$                            

Flying Cross 92.85$                            

2 Police Shirts (long & short sleeve) No Bid

a. Short Sleeve

Elbeco 55.13$                            65.07$                            

Blauer Super Shirt 62.98$                            

Blauer Class Act 58.94$                            

Flying Corss Justice 60.17$                            

b. Long Sleeve

Elbeco 57.69$                            68.15$                            

Blauer Super Shirt 71.10$                            

Blauer Class Act 65.87$                            

Flying Cross Justice 65.87$                            

3 Jackets No Bid

Blauer 220.37$                          

Elbeco 241.81$                          

511 185.90$                          

Spiewalk 228.95$                          299.00$                          

4 Ball Caps

Elbeco 32.00$                            

Blauer 14.11$                            

Pacific 13.92$                            

5 Blackinton B720 RHO GLO hat badge w/screw back and full color state seal 80.94$                            120.00$                          No Bid

6 Blackinton B720 HI GLO hat badge w/screw back and full color state seal 80.94$                            120.00$                          No Bid

7 Blackinton B899 RHO Glo breast badge w/safety catch and full color state seal 93.75$                            120.00$                          No Bid

8 Blackinton B899 RHO GLO breast badge w/wallet clip and full color state seal 93.75$                            120.00$                          No Bid

9 Blackinton B899 HI GLO breast badge w/safety catch and full color state seal 93.75$                            120.00$                          No Bid

10 Blackinton B899 HI GLO breat badge with wallet clip and full color state seal 93.75$                            120.00$                          No Bid

11 Morristown Police Dept collar brass - 1/2" silver 8.44$                              36.99$                            No Bid

12 Morristown Police Dept collar brass - 1/2" gold 8.44$                              36.99$                            No Bid

City of Morristown

Police Uniform Bid

Tuesday, July 16, 2019; 2:00 PM
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Bidder Summit Uniforms BKT Uniforms BK Graphics

13 1/2 brushed silver w/black lettering nameplate with serving since bar (2pc) pin back 13.99$                            14.99$                            No Bid

14 1/2" brushed gold w/black lettering nameplate with serving since bar (2pc) pin back 13.99$                            14.99$                            No Bid

15 1/2" brushed silver w/black lettering nameplate w/servcing since bar (1pc) pin back 17.00$                            14.99$                            No Bid

16 1/2" brushed gold w/black lettering namelate w/servicing since bar (1pc) pin back 17.00$                            14.99$                            No Bid

17 Small rank color brass - Corp & Sgt in gold or silver 4.56$                              8.99$                              No Bid

18 Large rank color brass - Corp & Sgt in gold or silver 4.56$                              8.99$                              No Bid

19 Small rank color brass - Lt, Capt & Maj in gold 4.56$                              8.99$                              No Bid

20 Large rank color brass - Lt, Capt & Maj in gold 4.56$                              8.99$                              No Bid

21 Trousers No Bid

Blauer 44.40$                            

511 37.08$                            

Propper 28.48$                            42.99$                            

Flying Cross 42.57$                            

22 Shirts No Bid

Blauer Long Sleeve 60.70$                            

Blauer Short Sleeve 57.21$                            

511 Long Sleeve 58.75$                            

511 Short Sleeve 55.43$                            

Propper Long Sleeve 46.68$                            

Propper Short Sleeve 45.54$                            

Flying Cross 57.42$                            

Flying Cross 57.42$                            

Propper Short Sleeve and Long Sleeve* 39.99$                            

*Additional cost for badge, collar and name plate 25.00$                            

K-9, Codes Enforcement & Litter Crew Accessories & Alterations

23 Polo Shirts

Corner Stone Short Sleeve 29.38$                            

511 Short Sleeve 40.01$                            

Port Authority Short Sleeve S - XL 24.48$                            

Port Authority Short Sleeve 2X 26.48$                            

Port Authority Short Sleeve 3X 27.48$                            

Port Authority Short Sleeve 4X 28.48$                            

Port Authority Long Sleeve S - XL 36.38$                            

Port Authority Long Sleeve 2X 38.38$                            

Port Authority Long Sleeve 3X 39.38$                            

Port Authority Long Sleeve 4X 40.38$                            

Propper Short Sleeve and Long Sleeve 42.99$                            

24 Single Breasted Dress Coat - Navy in Color No Bid

Flying Cross 150.90$                          
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Bidder Summit Uniforms BKT Uniforms BK Graphics

Elbeco 160.00$                          

Additional cost for braid 12.00$                            

Additional cost for stripe 12.00$                            

25 Trousers - Navy in color - Match to Dress Coat No Bid

Flying Cross 40.99$                            

Elbeco 40.00$                            

26 Long Sleeve White Shirts No Bid

Flying Cross 38.29$                            

Elbeco 68.05$                            

27 Rank epaulets - Corp, Sgt, Lt & Capt No Bid

$10 roll 10.00$                            

Rank 24.99$                            

Braid 12.00$                            

28 Collar brass - Corp, Sgt, Lt & Capt 8.44$                              8.99$                              No Bid

29 Collar brass - 1/2" M.P.D. in gold 8.44$                              8.99$                              No Bid
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Bidder Summit Uniforms BKT Uniforms BK Graphics

FIRE

1 Fire Uniform - Short and Long Sleeve Shirts No Bid

a. short sleeve

Southeastern 39.99$                      

Flying Cross 33.82$                                

b. long sleeve

Southeastern 42.99$                      

Flying Cross 38.26$                                

2 Fire Uniform - Trousers No Bid

Southeastern 42.99$                                

Horace Small 31.72$                                

3 Polo Shirts

Bodeck 46.99$                      

Port Authority Short Sleeve 14.99$                                

Port Authority Long Sleeve 17.49$                                

Port Authority Short Sleeve K500* 22.80$                      

Port Authority Long Sleeve K500* 25.80$                      

Port Authority Short Sleeve K500P* 24.82$                      

Port Authority Long Sleeve K500P* 27.82$                      

Optional: Cornerstone Tactical Polo* 35.72$                      

*2X add $2.00; 3X add $3.00; 4X-6X add $4.00

4 Cargo Trousers No BId

Propper 28.48$                                44.99$                      

Horace

5 Tee Shirts

Gildan Short Sleeve 8.50$                                  

Gildan Long Sleeve 10.50$                                

Bodeck 32.99$                      

Port & Company PC55 Short Sleeve* 6.62$                        

Port & Company PC55P Short Sleeve* 9.42$                        

Port & Company PC55 Long Sleeve* 9.62$                        

Port & Company PC61 Long Sleeve* 12.22$                      

*2X add $2.00; 3X add $3.00; 4X-6X add $4.00

6 Blackinton B-21 Hi-Glow - A3028 Insignia 64.38$                                89.00$                      No Bid

7 Blackinton B523 Rho-Glow - FD Insignia 64.38$                                No Bid No Bid

8 Blackinton B-21 Hi-Glow - A3317 Insignia 64.38$                                89.00$                      No Bid

9 Blackinton B-21 hi-Glow - A2997 Insignia 64.38$                                89.00$                      No Bid

10 Silver Nameplate w/black engraving 8.99$                                  14.99$                      No Bid

11 Gold Nameplate w/black engraving 8.99$                                  14.99$                      No Bid

12 Silver Serving Since w/black engraving 10.99$                                14.99$                      No Bid

13 Gold Serving Since w/black engraving 10.99$                                14.99$                      No Bid

City of Morristown

Fire Uniform Bid

Tuesday, July 16, 2019; 2:00 PM
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