
Finance Committee 
December 7, 2021 

3:30 p.m. 
 

Pre-Meeting WORK SESSION 
December 7, 2021 

4:00 p.m. 
 

AGENDA 
CITY OF MORRISTOWN, TENNESSEE 

CITY COUNCIL MEETING 
December 7, 2021 

5:00 p.m. 
 
 

1. CALL TO ORDER 
 
 Mayor Gary Chesney 
 
2. INVOCATION 
 
3. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
 
4. ROLL CALL 
 
5. APPROVAL OF MINUTES 
 

1. November 16, 2021 
 

6. PROCLAMATIONS/PRESENTATIONS 
 
7. CITIZEN COMMENTS ABOUT AGENDA ITEMS ONLY 
 (Other than items scheduled for public hearing.) 
 
8. OLD BUSINESS 
 
8-a. Public Hearings & Adoption of Ordinances/Resolutions 
 

1. Ordinance No. 3689.04 
To amend Ordinance Number 3689, The City of Morristown, Tennessee 
Annual Budget for Fiscal Year 2021-2022 Totaling $23,000; Necessary to 
appropriate additional funds for the FY2022 FAA Airports Coronavirus 
Response Grant in the amount of $23,000 to be used for ongoing and routine 
maintenance. 
 

9. NEW BUSINESS 
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9-a. Resolutions 

1. Resolution No. 13-22  
A Resolution of the City Council of the City of Morristown, Tennessee 
Approving an Economic Impact Plan for the Bellwood Farms Development 
Area. 
 

2. Resolution No. 14-22 
A Resolution of the City Council of the City of Morristown supporting 
Hamblen County wishing to pursue the Tennessee Department of 
Transportation (TDOT) Urban Transportation Planning Grant (UTPG) for 
the SR160 Corridor Study. 
 

3. Resolution 15-22 
A Resolution of the City Council of the City of Morristown authorizing the 
City of Morristown to join the State of Tennessee and other local 
Governments as participants in the Tennessee State-Subdivision Opioid 
Abatement Agreement and approving the related settlement agreements.  

9-b. Introduction and First Reading of Ordinances 

9-c. Awarding of Bids/Contracts 

1. Approval of Change Order No. 1 for the Brights Pike Bridge Replacement 
Project to extend the time of final completion.  

 
2. Acceptance of bids for five Surplus Properties to Various Bidders totaling 

$15,321.   
 
3. Approval to award the best and lowest bid for Fire Department uniforms to 

BK Graphics for tee-shirts and award all other uniform items to Summit 
Uniforms. 

 
4. Approval to award the best and lowest bid for Police Department uniforms to 

CMS Uniforms. 
 
5. Approval of Quitclaim Deed for the conveyance of a portion of an abandoned 

roadway to Morristown Signs. 
 
9-d. Board/Commission Appointments 
 
9-e. New Issues 
 

1. Approval of Promotion to Patrol Captain, Morristown Police Department. 
 

2. Approval of Promotion to Patrol Lieutenant, Morristown Police Department. 
 

3. Approval of Promotions (2) to Patrol Sergeant, Morristown Police 
Department. 
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4. Approval of Promotion to Patrol Corporal, Morristown Police Department. 

 
5. Approval of Promotion to Support Services Corporal, Morristown Police 

Department. 
 
10. CITY ADMINISTRATOR’S REPORT 
 
11. COMMUNICATIONS/PETITIONS 

This is the portion of the meeting where members of the audience may 
speak subject to the guidelines provided. 
 

12. COMMENTS FROM MAYOR/COUNCILMEMBERS/COMMITTEES 
 
13. ADJOURN 
 
 
 

WORK SESSION 
Post-Meeting Work Session 

December 7, 2021 

 

1. City Center Renovation Project 

 

 

City Council Meeting/Holiday Schedule.  

 

December 7, 2021 Tuesday 3:30 p.m. Finance Committee Meeting 
December 7, 2021 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
December 7, 2021 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
December 17, 2021 Friday 9:00 a.m. City Council Work Session – P.W. Facility 4360 Durham Landing  
December 21, 2021 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
December 21, 2021 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
December 24 & 27, 2021 Friday  City Center Closed – Observance of Christmas Holiday 

 December 31, 2021 Friday  City Center Closed – Observance of New Year’s Day 
January 4, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
January 4, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
January 17, 2022 Monday  City Center Closed – Observance of Martin Luther King Day 
January 18, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
January 18, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
February 1, 2022 Tuesday 3:30 p.m. Finance Committee Meeting 
February 1, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
February 1, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
February 15, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
February 15, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
March 1, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
March 1, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
March 15, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
March 15, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
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Ordinance Number: 3689.04

REVENUE FUND BALANCE
Increase Decrease Increase Decrease

General (#110) Revenue TDOT Airport Grants $23,000

General (#110) Airport General Operating Supplies 23,000$         

Totals 23,000$         -$                            23,000$         -$                

PASSED ON FIRST READING THIS 16th  DAY OF NOVEMBER 2021

Mayor Signature
ATTEST:

City Administrator Signature

PASSED ON SECOND READING THIS 7th DAY OF DECEMBER 2021

Mayor Signature

ATTEST:

City Administrator Signature

APPROPRIATION ORDINANCE

TO AMEND ORDINANCE NUMBER 3689, THE CITY OF MORRISTOWN, TENNESSEE ANNUAL BUDGET FOR FISCAL YEAR 2021-2022 TOTALING $23,000; NECESSARY TO APPROPRIATE ADDITIONAL 
FUNDS FOR THE FY2022 FAA AIRPORTS CORONAVIRUS RESPONSE GRANT PROGRAM (ACRGP). FUNDS WILL BE USED FOR ONGOING AND ROUTINE MAINTENANCE.

Be it ordained by the Council of the City of Morristown Tennessee that Ordinance Number 3689 identifying the revenue and expenditure accounts of the City of Morristown contained in the annual budget for the
fiscal year 2021-2022 is hereby amended and funds are herewith appropriated or adjusted as presented.

FUND DEPARTMENT CODE ACCOUNT DESCRIPTION
EXPENDITURES

110.33585

48100.429
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RESOLUTION NO. 13-22 
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MORRISTOWN, 
TENNESSEE APPROVING AN ECONOMIC IMPACT PLAN FOR THE 
BELLWOOD FARMS DEVELOPMENT AREA 
 
WHEREAS, The Industrial Development Board of the City of Morristown, Tennessee (the 

"Board") has submitted to the City of Morristown, Tennessee (the "City") an economic impact plan (the 
"Economic Impact Plan") regarding the development of an area generally located at the intersection of W. 
Andrew Johnson Highway and S. Bellwood Road, in the City of Morristown, Hamblen County, 
Tennessee (the "Plan Area"); and 

 
WHEREAS, the development of the Plan Area is expected to include a retail shopping center 

with retail shops and restaurants (the "Project"); and 
 
WHEREAS, the Economic Impact Plan would permit certain tax increment financing ("Tax 

Increment Financing") to be provided through the issuance of the Board's bonds, notes and other 
obligations in the total amount not to exceed $2,500,000 pursuant to Chapter 53, Title 7 of the Tennessee 
Code Annotated (the "Act"); and 

 
WHEREAS, the Board has approved the submission to the City of the Economic Impact Plan at a 

meeting on November 22, 2021; and  
 
WHEREAS, the proceeds of the Tax Increment Financing would be used to pay or finance 

eligible costs under the Act (the "TIF Eligible Costs") relating to the development of the Plan Area; and 
 
WHEREAS, certain incremental property tax revenues (the "TIF Revenues") that result from the 

development of the Plan Area under the Economic Impact Plan will be allocated to the Board as provided 
in the Economic Impact Plan to be used to pay debt service of the Tax Increment Financing; and 

 
WHEREAS, in accordance with the Economic Impact Plan, the Board would issue the Tax 

Increment Financing to a lender or lenders to finance the TIF Eligible Costs and would pledge the TIF 
Revenues to such lender or lenders to apply to the debt service on the Tax Increment Financing; and 

 
WHEREAS, the Tax Increment Financing shall not represent or constitute a debt or pledge of the 

faith and credit or the taxing power of the Board, the City or Hamblen County, Tennessee; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Board of Directors of the Board has approved and submitted the Economic 

Impact Plan to the City Council of the City of Morristown, Tennessee for approval in accordance with 
Tennessee Code Annotated § 7-53-312; and 

 
WHEREAS, the Board of Directors of the Board held a public hearing related to the Economic 

Impact Plan, and a summary of that public hearing has been provided to the City Council of the City.  
 
BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MORRISTOWN, TENNESSEE:  
 
That (i) the Economic Impact Plan, in the form attached hereto as Exhibit A, being in the interests of the 
citizens of the City of Morristown, Tennessee, is hereby approved by the City Council, and (ii) the 
officers of the City are authorized to take all appropriate action to carry out the terms of the Economic 
Impact Plan. 

 

8 Return to Agenda



Adopted the 21st day of December, 2021.  
 
 
 
              
        Mayor 
 
ATTEST:  
 
 
 
      
 City Administrator 
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Exhibit A 
 

Economic Impact Plan 
 
 

(see attached) 
 
 

31818460.1 
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THE INDUSTRIAL DEVELOPMENT BOARD OF  

THE CITY OF MORRISTOWN, TENNESSEE 

 

ECONOMIC IMPACT PLAN 

FOR 

BELLWOOD FARMS DEVELOPMENT AREA 

 

 

I.  Authority for Economic Impact Plan 

 

Industrial development corporations ("IDBs") are authorized under Tenn. Code Ann. § 7-

53-312 to prepare and submit to cities and counties an economic impact plan with respect to an 

area that includes a project within the meaning of Tenn. Code Ann. § 7-53-101 and such other 

properties that the IDB determines will be directly improved or benefited due to the undertaking 

of a project.  Tennessee Code Annotated § 7-53-312 also authorizes cities and counties to 

allocate new incremental tax revenues, which arise from the area subject to the economic impact 

plan, to the IDB to promote economic development, to pay the cost of projects or to pay debt 

service on bonds or other obligations issued by the IDB to pay the costs of projects. 

 

II.  The Project 

Bellwood Farms, LLC, a Tennessee limited liability company, or an affiliate thereof 

(collectively, the "Developer") has purchased and/ or contracted for the purchase of certain tracts 

of real property comprising approximately 42 acres in Hamblen County, Tennessee.  All but 

approximately 1 acre of the property is within the city limits of the City of Morristown, 

Tennessee.  The property, located approximately at 4185 W. Andrew Johnson Highway, is 

bounded to the north by W. Andrew Johnson Highway and bounded to the west by S. Bellwood 

Road.  The property consists of eight parcels which have been identified as tax parcels 040 

041.00, 040 041.01, 040 045.02, 040 045.00, 040 045.01, 040 045.03, 040 LE 001.00, and 040 

LE 002.00 (collectively, the "Developer Parcel"). 

 

The Developer Parcel is ideally situated for commercial development.  The Developer 

desires to undertake a significant multi-use development on the Developer Parcel.  This 

development, which is expected to be undertaken in two phases, is expected to include a retail 

shopping center comprised of retail shops and restaurants.  The development is collectively 

referred to herein as the "Project."  Each component of the Project is expected to be an eligible 

project within the meaning of Tenn. Code Ann. § 7-53-101(15).   

 

In order to make the Project financially feasible, the Developer has requested that 

Hamblen County, Tennessee (the "County") and the City of Morristown, Tennessee (the "City") 

approve, as part of this Economic Impact Plan, a plan for tax increment financing through The 

Industrial Development Board of the City of Morristown, Tennessee (the "Board") pursuant to 

Title 7, Chapter 53 of Tennessee Code Annotated to provide funds to pay a portion of the costs 

of the improvements that are needed to permit the construction and operation of the Project. The 

proceeds of the tax increment financing would be used to pay eligible costs, in accordance with 

the Tax Increment Act (as defined below), relating to the Project. 
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III.  Boundaries of Plan Area 

The Project is generally located southeast of the intersection of W. Andrew Johnson 

Highway and S. Bellwood Road, across W. Andrew Johnson Highway from Honda Morristown.  

The Project is located within the City and the County, with the exception of one parcel, Parcel 

No. 040 LE 002.00, which is outside City limits.  The area that would be subject to this 

Economic Impact Plan, and to the tax increment financing provisions described below, includes 

only the property on which the Project will be located.  The area that will be subject to this 

Economic Impact Plan (the "Plan Area") is shown on Exhibit A attached hereto.  A list of the 

parcels included in the Plan Area is also attached as part of Exhibit A.  The Plan Area is hereby 

declared to be subject to this Economic Impact Plan, and the Project is hereby identified as the 

project that will be located within the Plan Area. 

 

IV.  Financial Assistance to Project 

 

The Board will provide financial assistance to the Project by applying the proceeds of the 

tax increment financing described herein to pay or reimburse all or a portion of eligible costs that 

will be incurred by the Developer in connection with the development of the Project. These 

eligible costs include the costs of public infrastructure, which is defined under Tenn. Code Ann. 

§ 9-23-102(16) as roads, streets, publicly-owned or privately-owned parking lots, facilities or 

garages, traffic signals, sidewalks or other public improvements that are available for public use, 

utility improvements and storm water and drainage improvements, whether or not located on 

public property or a publicly-dedicated easement.   

 

 Tenn. Code Ann. § 9-23-108 does not permit the application of incremental tax revenues 

to pay costs other than the costs of public infrastructure without first receiving a written 

determination from the Comptroller of the State of Tennessee (the "State") and the 

Commissioner of Economic and Community Development of the State that the use of tax 

increment revenues for such purposes is in the best interest of the State.  The Developer shall not 

seek a written determination from the State without the prior approval of the Board by resolution 

of the Board.  The Board will not apply the proceeds of the tax increment financing authorized 

hereunder to pay costs as to which such a written determination is required without first 

obtaining such written determination. 

 

The Board will pay and/or reimburse the Developer for all or a portion of the eligible 

costs, including any costs approved by a written determination of the State, upon receipt of 

adequate documentation of such costs but only with the proceeds of the tax increment financing 

provided herein.  In connection with the issuance of any tax increment financing, the Board and 

the Developer will enter into a development agreement specifying the scope and the cost of the 

improvements and fees to be paid and/or reimbursed.   

 

V.  Expected Benefits to City and County 

 

Numerous benefits will accrue to the City and the County as a result of the development 

of the Plan Area.  The development of retail shopping centers and restaurants, such as the 

Project, will assist the City, the County and the Board in promoting economic development.  
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When companies select locations for manufacturing, distribution and office facilities, a 

significant factor that is considered by site selection firms is the quality of life for the companies' 

employees in each community being considered as a possible location.  By providing a wider 

array of retail shopping and dining choices, the Project will assist the Board with economic 

development recruiting and help expand the economic base of the City and County. 

 

Both the City and the County are also expected to receive substantial additional taxes as a 

result of the development of the Plan Area.  The ad valorem real property taxes for the Plan Area 

for the year 2020 were $9,521.79 for the City and $12,334.00 for the County, which are the base 

taxes relating to the Plan Area.  Development of the Plan Area will increase the value of the real 

property within the Plan Area, leading to an increase in ad valorem real property taxes.  

Following the reappraisal of the Project after construction is completed, the annual real property 

taxes payable are expected to be approximately $220,779 to the City and approximately 

$278,386 to the County, for a total of $499,165 in annual real property taxes. Of this total, the 

base taxes described above plus approximately $152,650 in taxes that are allocable to paying 

debt service on the City's and the County's general obligation debt will be retained by the City 

and the County.  These additional taxes for debt service will immediately benefit the City and the 

County.  After the tax increment financing described below is paid, the remaining incremental 

property tax revenues will be payable to the City and the County, and the City and the County 

will benefit from those incremental taxes at that point and for years to come.  The City and the 

County will also benefit from additional personal property taxes to the extent not allocated to pay 

debt service on the tax increment financing described below.  

 

Furthermore, the City and the County are expected to receive substantial additional sales 

tax revenues as a result of the development of the Project.  All of the retailers and restaurants that 

are expected to locate in the Project are new to the City and the County, which should result in 

additional sales that may otherwise occur outside of the County and in new local sales tax 

revenues for both the City and the County. When the retail and restaurant operations in the 

Project are at full projected sales volumes, the annual local sales tax revenue generated is 

projected to be $976,250.  

 

Additionally, during the construction of the Project, 50 to 75 direct construction jobs are 

anticipated. After construction is complete, the retail and restaurant operations are expected to 

support a total of 450 to 470 new full time jobs. The wages from these jobs will result in new 

local tax revenues. 

 

VI.  Distribution of Property Taxes and Tax Increment Financing 

 

a. Distribution of Taxes.  Property taxes, including personal property taxes, imposed on 

the property located within the Plan Area shall be allocated and distributed as provided in this 

subsection.  The taxes assessed by the County and the City on the real and personal property 

within the Plan Area will be divided and distributed as follows in accordance with Tenn. Code 

Ann. § 7-53-312(c) and Title 9, Chapter 23 of the Tennessee Code Annotated, being the 

Uniformity in Tax Increment Financing Act of 2012 (the "Tax Increment Act"): 

 

i. The portion of the real and personal property taxes payable with respect to the 
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Plan Area equal to the year prior to the date of approval of this Economic Impact Plan 

(the "Base Tax Amount") shall be allocated to and, as collected, paid to the County and 

the City as all other taxes levied by the County and the City on all other properties; 

provided, however, that in any year in which the taxes on the property within the Plan 

Area are less than the Base Tax Amount, there shall be allocated and paid to the County 

and the City only the taxes actually imposed. 

 

ii. 75% of the excess of real and personal property taxes over the Base Tax 

Amount (the "TIF Revenues") shall be allocated and, as collected, paid into a separate 

fund of the Board, created to hold such payments until the tax proceeds in the fund are to 

be applied to pay debt service on the obligations expected to be issued by the Board that 

are described to pay eligible costs, as described above. 

 

This allocation is subject to the provisions of Tenn. Code Ann. §7-53-312(j) and the Tax 

Increment Act, which requires that taxes levied upon property within the Plan Area for the 

payment of debt service of the County and the City shall not be allocated to the Board. 

Furthermore, in accordance with the Board's TIF Policies, for each year that TIF Revenues are 

allocated to the Board, the Board is authorized to retain an annual Administrative Fee in the 

amount of $500.00 (the "Annual Administrative Fee"); provided, however, that in accordance 

with Tenn. Code Ann. § 9-23-105, the Annual Administrative Fee in any year shall not exceed 

5% of the TIF Revenues for such year. 

 

The Developer expects to resubdivide the Developer Parcel into multiple parcels in order 

to facilitate the phased development of the Plan Area.  The base taxes with respect to the 

Developer Parcel shall be allocated to each parcel created by the Developer on a pro-rated basis 

using the acreage of each subdivided parcel as a percentage of the total acreage of the original 

Developer Parcel. 

 

The Board is authorized to make all calculations of TIF Revenues on the basis of each 

parcel within in the Plan Area instead of on an aggregate basis as permitted by the Tax Increment 

Act.  If the Board opts to have such calculations made based upon each parcel, the Board shall 

give notice to the City and the County that such methodology will be used prior to the first 

allocation date of any TIF Revenues.   

 

 As permitted by the Tax Increment Act, the Board is hereby authorized to separately 

group one or more parcels with the Plan Area for purposes of calculating and allocating the TIF 

Revenues, and in such case, the allocation of TIF Revenues shall be calculated and made based 

upon each such parcel or group of parcels, and not the entire Plan Area.  The Board is 

specifically authorized to undertake such grouping of parcels at any time that this Plan is 

effective as of the beginning of any year (but not later than the fifth full year commencing after 

the execution of the initial development agreement with the Developer, provided that the Board 

may extend such grouping deadline by not to exceed an additional five years without the further 

approval of the City and County), and the Board may reserve the right in any development 

agreement with the Developer to regroup one or more parcels for purposes of making the 

calculations of TIF Revenues hereunder.  The Board shall give notice of any such grouping of 

parcels to the City and the County. 
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The Board is also authorized to designate that the allocation of TIF Revenues from any 

parcel or group of parcels shall begin in different years in order to match TIF Revenues with the 

application of TIF Revenues for the purposes provided herein, subject to the maximum allocation 

period as to any parcel provided below, provided that allocation of TIF Revenues as to any 

parcel in the Plan Area must commence no later than the fifth full year after the execution of the 

initial development agreement with the Developer, provided that the Board may extend such 

commencement deadline by not to exceed an additional five years without the further approval of 

the City and County. The Board shall give notice of any such designation to the City and the 

County. 

 

Allocations of TIF Revenues collected by the City and the County that are not delinquent 

shall be made as to each tax year no later than sixty (60) days after the date such taxes would be 

delinquent in payment, allocations of TIF Revenues relating to delinquent taxes shall be made 

not later than sixty (60) days from when such TIF Revenues are collected by the City or the 

County. 

 

b. TIF Obligations.  In order to pay for or reimburse eligible costs, as described above, 

needed for the Project, the Board intends to use the incremental tax revenues that it would 

receive as a result of the adoption of the Economic Impact Plan to pay debt service on 

obligations incurred to finance such costs.  This tax increment financing will be structured as 

follows: 

 

i. The Board will borrow not to exceed $2,500,000 (not including refinancings) 

through the issuance and sale of notes, bonds or other obligations of the Board in multiple 

series from time to time as each component of the Project is undertaken.  The Board shall 

pledge any and all TIF Revenues allocated to the Board pursuant to this Economic Impact 

Plan to the payment of such notes, bonds or other obligations, including, without 

limitation, principal and interest thereon.  In no event will the obligations issued by the 

Board be considered a debt or obligation of the County or the City in any manner 

whatsoever, and the source of the funds to satisfy the Board's payment obligations 

thereunder shall be limited solely to the TIF Revenues and shall otherwise be non-

recourse to the Board.  As each series of the notes, bonds or other obligations are issued, 

the Developer shall apply to the Board, under the applicable policies of the Board, for the 

issuance of the applicable series of notes, bonds or other obligations and demonstrate, at 

such time, that the TIF Revenues to be realized from such component of the Project will 

be sufficient to pay debt service on the notes, bonds or other obligations requested to be 

issued by the Developer. 

 

ii. The proceeds of the notes, bonds or obligations shall be used to pay eligible 

costs relating to the Project as described above together with expenses of the Board in 

connection with the Project and the tax increment financing and capitalized interest on 

the notes, bonds or other obligations for a maximum period of two (2) years from the date 

of completion of the Project.   

 

Any development agreement with the Developer shall provide for such portion of the tax 
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increment revenues as the Board, the County and/or the City require under any applicable 

policies to be withheld for administrative expenses to be so withheld, which amount shall not 

exceed the amount permitted by the Tax Increment Act, and for such withheld amounts to be 

applied as required by such policies. 

 

c. Time Period.  Taxes on the real and personal property within the Plan Area will be 

divided and distributed as provided in this Plan for a period, as to each parcel in the Plan Area, 

not in excess of ten (10) tax years as to any parcel, but, in any event, such allocations shall cease 

when there are not eligible costs, including debt service, to be paid from the TIF Revenues.   

 

d. Finding of Economic Benefit.  The Board, the County and the City, by the adoption 

of this Economic Impact Plan, find that the use of the TIF Revenues as described herein, is in 

furtherance of promoting economic development in the City and County and that costs to be 

financed as described herein are costs of the Project. 

 

VII.  Approval Process 

 

 Pursuant to Tenn. Code Ann. § 7-53-312, the process for the approval of this Economic 

Impact Plan is as follows: 

 

a. The Board holds a public hearing relating to the proposed Economic Impact Plan 

after publishing notice of such hearing in a newspaper of general circulation in the County and 

the City at least two (2) weeks prior to the date of the public hearing.  The notice must include 

the time, place and purpose of the hearing as well as notice of how a map of the subject area may 

be viewed by the public.  Following such public hearing, the Board may submit the Economic 

Impact Plan to the County and the City for their approval. 

 

b. The governing bodies of the County and the City must approve the Economic Impact 

Plan.  The Economic Impact Plan may be approved by resolution of the County Commission or 

the City Council, whether or not the local charter provisions of the governing bodies provide 

otherwise.  If either the County or the City make any changes to this Economic Impact Plan in 

connection with their approval hereof, such changes must be approved by the Board and the 

governing body of the City or County that did not make such change for the Plan to be effective. 

 

c. Once the Economic Impact Plan has been approved by the governing bodies of the 

County and the City, the Plan and related documentation shall be filed with the local taxing 

officials and the Comptroller of the State as required by the Tax Increment Act and annual 

statements of incremental tax revenues allocated to the Board shall be filed with the State Board 

of Equalization as required by the Tax Increment Act.  The Board will also comply with all other 

procedural requirements of the Tax Increment Act and other applicable laws. 
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Exhibit A 

(to Economic Impact Plan) 

 

Parcels comprising the Plan Area 

 

Tax ID Number 2020 City Taxes 2020 County 

Taxes 

Total Base 

Taxes 

040 041.00 $ 1,338.57 $ 1,688.00 $ 3,026.57 

040 041.01 $ 128.76 $ 162.00 $ 290.76 

040 045.02 $ 829.80 $ 1,046.00 $ 1,875.80 

040 045.00 $ 1,782.16 $ 2,247.00 $ 4,029.16 

040 045.01 $ 3,639.69 $ 4,589.00 $ 8,228.69 

040 045.03 $ 581.21 $ 733.00 $ 1,314.21 

040L E 001.00 $ 1,221.60 $ 1,540.00 $ 2,761.60 

040L E 002.00 $ 0.00 $ 329.00 $ 329.00 

TOTAL $9,521.79  

  

$12,334.00 $21,855.79 

 

*Note: The base taxes referenced above will be the base taxes if this Economic Impact Plan is 

approved during calendar year 2021. Pursuant to Tenn. Code Ann. § 7-53-312(c)(1) and 9-23-

102(1), the base taxes are the property taxes that were levied and payable for the Plan Area for 

the year prior to the date this Economic Impact Plan is approved. Thus, if this Economic Impact 

Plan is not approved until 2022, then the base taxes will be based on the property taxes for the 

Plan Area that were levied and payable in 2021. 
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Map of Plan Area 
 

 
 

 

 

 
31816554.3 
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RESOLUTION 14-22 
A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MORRISTOWN 
SUPPORTING HAMBLEN COUNTY WISHING TO PURSUE THE TENNESSEE 
DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION (TDOT) URBAN TRANSPORTATION 
PLANNING GRANT (UTPG) FOR THE SR160 CORRIDOR STUDY. 

 
 WHEREAS, The City of Morristown seeks to continually develop comprehensive 
plan elements which serve as guidelines for the maintenance and improvement of 
community public facilities and infrastructure, and 
 
 WHEREAS, the people of Morristown are afforded a continuous process whereby 
the transportation network within the area is maintained in an efficient and orderly 
manner while plans for future growth in traffic volumes, recreational and land uses are 
considered, and 
 
 WHEREAS, The City of Morristown desires to improve the safety, security, and 
aesthetics of its roadways; and 
 
 WHEREAS, Hamblen County desires to apply for the FFY2022 Urban 
Transportation Planning Grant (UTPG), where state funds will pay for 90 percent of the 
grant and localities will share the 10 percent (10%) local match UP FRONT, if awarded; 
and  
 
 WHEREAS, the total amount of the shall not exceed $200,000.00, and the grant 
applications are due by December 30, 2021; and  
 
 WHEREAS, The City of Morristown wishes to participate in a corridor study 
done for SR160; from W Andrew Johnson Hwy to McClister Rd; and  
   
 NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council for the City of 
Morristown supports Hamblen County pursuing the FFY2022 TDOT Urban 
Transportation Planning Grant for the purpose of the SR 160 Corridor Study. 
 
Resolved this the 7th day of December 2021. 
 
 

_____________________________ 
Mayor 

 
ATTEST: 
 
 
________________________________ 
City Administrator   
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CHANGE IN CONTRACT PRICE: 

Original Contract Price 

 
$ 

Net Increase (decrease) from previous Change Orders No. 0 to No. 0 

 
$ 

Contract Price prior to this Change Order 

 
$ 

Net Increase (decrease) of this Change Order 

 
$ 

Contract Price with all approved Change Orders 

 
$ 

CHANGE IN CONTRACT TIMES: 

Original Contract Times:  

Substantial Completion: 12/20/2021 

Ready for final 
payment: 

01/20/2022 
(days or dates) 

Net changes from previous Change Orders No. 0 to No. 0: 

Substantial Completion:  

Ready for final 
payment: 

 
(days) 

Contract Times prior to this Change Order 

Substantial Completion:  

Ready for final 
payment: 

 
(days or dates) 

Net Increase (decrease) of this Change Order 

Substantial Completion:  

Ready for final 
payment: 

 
(days) 

Contract Times with all approved Change Orders 

Substantial Completion:  

Ready for final 
payment: 

 
(days or dates) 

CHANGE ORDER 

   No. 1 
 

DATE OF ISSUANCE   EFFECTIVE DATE    

OWNER THE CITY OF MORRISTOWN 

CONTRACTOR                                                                ADAMS CONTRACTING, LLC 

Contract:                P.O. # 21002299-00 
 

Project:              BRIGHTS PIKE BRIDGE REPLACEMENT 

OWNER's Contract No. P.O. # 21002299-00 ENGINEER's Contract No. MRC031 
  

ENGINEER LDA ENGINEERING 
 

You are directed to make the following changes in the Contract Documents. 

Description: Contract time extension 

 
Reason for Change Order: Wet weather and high water conditions in creek; reinforcing steel discrepancy 

 
Attachments: (List documents supporting change) 

 

 

RECOMMENDED: 

BY:  

 APPROVED: 

BY: 

 ACCEPTED: 

BY: 

ENGINEER (Authorized Signature) 
 

DATE: 11/14/2021 

 OWNER (Authorized Signature) 
 

DATE: 

 CONTRACTOR (Authorized Signature) 
 

DATE: 

 

 
  00640 - 1 
EJCDC No.1910-8-B (1996 Edition) 

Prepared by the Engineers Joint Contract Documents Committee and endorsed by The Associated General Contractors of America and the Construction Specification. 
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Property Address Bill Wadlington Scott Trent Marshall Ramsey Habitat for Humanity
Tracey Dillon Parker / 

Christian Green Melissa King April Bowen Worsley

425 Hedrick Street 1,100.00$                1,102.00$                507.47$                   10,000.00$              2,221.00$                        2,000.00$                5.01$                       

313 Montrose Avenue 1,100.00$                102.00$                   257.24$                   501.00$                   

423 Macarthur Street 1,100.00$                102.00$                   347.89$                   

416 South Daisy Street 1,100.00$                102.00$                   2,021.00$                        1,001.00$                

1437 Shields Ferry Road 2.00$                       

1535 Old Liberty Road 1,100.00$                2.00$                       447.79$                   1,000.00$                10.01$                     

Total

Total of highest bids: $15,323.00

City of Morristown
Property Sale Bid Opening

Tuesday, November 30, 2021; 2:00 PM
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 CMS 
UNIFORMS 

 BK 
GRAPHICS 

 SUMMIT UNIFORMS 

Fire Uniform - Short and Long Sleeve Shirts
a. Short sleeve
Elbeco 20.40$        
Fechheimer #65R525;#65R5400 32.00$              
Flying Cross  F1 85R54 30.85$                         
b. Long Sleeve
Fechheimer #35W5435; #35W5400 (white) 37.00$              
Fying Cross F1 35W54 35.15$                         
Fire Uniform - Trousers
Elbeco E2804
Fechheimer #47400 48.35$              
FlyIng Cross  F1 47400 56.70$                         
Polo Shirts
a. Short sleeve
Elbeco   (50 min order)
Blauer #8362 (Navy Only) 48.00$              42.67$                         
b. Long Sleeve
Blauer #8361 (Navy Only) 52.00$              47.86$                         
Polo Shirts

a. Short Sleeve     
 (50min 
order) 51.07$        

Blauer #8372  (Navy Only) 44.00$              42.17$                         
Blauer Baseshirt
b. Long Sleeve
Blauer #8371 48.00$              
Blauer Baseshirt
Cargo Trousers 46.07$        
Blauer 8613T
FLEXRS Pant

CITY OF MORRISTOWN
FIRE UNIFORM BID

THURSDAY, NOVEMBER 11, 2021; 3:00 PM

NO BID

NO BID

3
53.84$                             

57.76$                             

57.86$              58.51$                         

4

39.93$                         
55.00$                             

5

44.57$                             

ITEM DESCRIPTION BKT UNIFORMS

SUPPLIERS BID PRICE

1

31.33$                             

2

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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 CMS 
UNIFORMS 

 BK 
GRAPHICS 

 SUMMIT UNIFORMS 
ITEM DESCRIPTION BKT UNIFORMS

SUPPLIERS BID PRICE

Tee Shirts
a. Short Sleeve
#2000; #2300 w/pkt 14.00$              
S-XL            (PC55 NAVY - BK GRAPHICS) 8.19$           
2X-5X
PC55 Navy        2XL 10.19$        
                             3XL 11.19$        
                             4XL  12.19$        
                             5XL-6XL 13.19$        
                             S-XL W/pocket 10.85$        
                             2XL w/pocket 12.85$        
                             3XL w/pocket 13.85$        
                             4XL w/pocket 14.85$        
                             5XL- 6XL W/POCKET  15.85$        
Hanes (min of 24) 14.00$                         
B. Long Sleeve
#G2400; #2410 w/pkt 16.00$              
S-XL                    (PC55LS- *BK GRAPHICS) 11.19$        
2X - 3XL
PC55LS NAVY           2XL 13.19$        
                                      3XL 14.19$        
                                      4XL 15.19$        
                                      5XL-6XL 16.19$        
PC61LSP                    S-XL W/POCKET 13.85$        
                                     2XL W/POCKET 15.85$        
                                    3XL w/pocket 16.85$        
                                   4XL w/pocket 17.85$        
                                   5XL- 6XL W/POCKET 18.85$        
Hanes (min of 24) 16.00$                         

HI/ GLOW  GOLD & 
Nickle 

88.46$     70.13$        
8 Blackinton B523 Rho-Glow breast badge with FD 88.46$     51.10$        81.00$              NO BID 87.71$                         

6

19.84$                             
27.00$                             

29.00$                             

87.71$                         7 Blackinton B-21 Hi-Glow breast badge with 
A3028 insigna

83.00$              NO BID

25.68$                             
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 CMS 
UNIFORMS 

 BK 
GRAPHICS 

 SUMMIT UNIFORMS 
ITEM DESCRIPTION BKT UNIFORMS

SUPPLIERS BID PRICE

9 Blackinton B-21 Hi-Glow breast badge with 
A3317 insigna 88.46$     70.13$        83.00$              NO BID 87.71$                         

10 Blackinton B-21 Hi-Glow breast badge with 
A2997 insigna 88.46$     70.13$        83.00$              NO BID 87.71$                         
Silver name plate with black engraving 12.99$                         
#50
Gold name plate with black engraving 12.99$                         
#50
Silver serving since with black engraving 14.99$                         
#YS
Gold serving since with black engraving 14.99$                         
#YS

NO BID

NO BID

14.99$                             

13

14

12.00$              

12.00$              

12.00$              

12.00$              

14.99$                             

14.99$                             

11

12

NO BID

NO BID

14.99$                             
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 CMS 
UNIFORMS  

B.K. 
GRAPHICS

 SUMMIT 
UNIFORMS 

Police Uniform - Class A Style Trousers
Blauer Class Act
Blauer #8650T    (4 pkt) 40.38$           
Blauer #8657 (6 pkt) 50.03$           54.63$          
Elbeco 58.84$           
Flying Cross

Police Uniform - Class A Style Shirts (long & short sleeve)
 a. Short Sleeve:                                                                               
 Blauer Class Act 
 Blauer #8610Z 37.37$           46.64$          
 Blauer #8675 44.77$           
 Blauer #8676 51.00$           
 Blauer Supershirt Class Act 
 Elbeco CX360 50.30$           
 FlexRS Supershirt 
 Flying Cross Justice Power Stretch 
b. Long Sleeve
 Blauer Class Act 
 Blauer #8600Z 41.00$           44.15$          
 Blauer #8670 49.50$           
 Blauer #8671 56.05$           
 Blauer Supershirt Class Act 
 Elbeco CX360 54.23$           
 FlexRS Supershirt 
 Flying Cross Justice Power Stretch 

2

CITY OF MORRISTOWN
POLICE UNIFORM BID

THURSDAY, NOVEMBER 11, 2021; 3:00 PM

DESCRIPTIONITEM BKT UNIFORMS

SUPPLIERS BID PRICE

NO BID

1

NO BID

NO BID
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 CMS 
UNIFORMS  

B.K. 
GRAPHICS

 SUMMIT 
UNIFORMS DESCRIPTIONITEM BKT UNIFORMS

SUPPLIERS BID PRICE

Police Uniform - Class A Style Shirts for Outer Carrier Vests  
a. Short Sleeve
Blauer #8372 35.05$           44.87$          
Blauer #8362 42.20$           
Blauer Polyester Armorskin Base Shirt
Blauer FlexRS Armorskin Base Shirt
Blauer Armorskin Winter Base Shirt
Elbeco UV1 CX360 Undervest Shirt 42.07$           
b. Long Sleeve
Blauer #8371 38.60$           42.63$          
Blauer #8361 47.32$           
Blauer #8373 51.85$           
Blauer Polyester Armorskin Base Shirt
Blauer FlexRS Armorskin Base Shirt
Blauer Armorskin Winter Base Shirt
Elbeco UV1 CX360 Undervest Shirt 45.38$           

Propper F5252-50 36.30$           30.00$           NO BID 31.06$          
Police Uniform - Class B Style Shirt for K9 and Litter Crew
a. Short Sleeve
Propper 46.35$           
Propper F5311-50 38.10$           36.56$          
b. Long Sleeve
Propper 47.70$           
Propper F5312-50 40.75$           37.81$          

Jackets
Blauer B-Dry Cruiser Jacket 9810Z 177.12$       
Blauer #9820-60 310.00$        
Elbeco Genersis Shield 256.00$        
Polo Shirts - Special Teams
Cornerstone C5410 31.00$           
5.11 71049 36.00$           
XS-XL 38.60$           

5

6

7

3

Police Uniform - Class B Style Trouser for K9 and Litter Crew4

 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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 CMS 
UNIFORMS  

B.K. 
GRAPHICS

 SUMMIT 
UNIFORMS DESCRIPTIONITEM BKT UNIFORMS

SUPPLIERS BID PRICE

2XL 41.13$           
3XL 44.21$           
4XL-5XL 48.83$           
SANMAR CS410 33.60$          
Ballcaps
Elbeco 17.30$           
Blauer #197 16.50$           
Blauer #182 18.09$          
Pacific

Additional Uniform Items HI/RHO  Nickle/ Gold
9 Blackinton B720 RHO GLO hat badge with screw back and full 

color state seal  $    104.66 76.00$           94.00$           NO BID 104.09$       
10 Blackinton B720 HI GLO hat badge with screw back and full 

color state seal 104.66$    76.00$           94.00$           NO BID 104.09$       
11 Blackinton B899 RHO GLO breast badge with saftey catch and 

full color state seal 121.15$    106.23$        106.00$        NO BID 120.46$       
12 Blackinton B899 RHO GLO  breast badge with wallet clip and 

full color state seal 121.15$    88.46$           106.00$        NO BID 120.46$       
13 Blackinton B899 HI GLO breast badge with safety catch and 

full color state seal 121.15$    106.23$        106.00$        NO BID 120.46$       
14 Blackinton B899 HI GLO breast badge with wallet clip and full 

color state seal 121.15$    106.23$        106.00$        NO BID 120.46$       
15 Morristown Police Department collar bras - 3/8" silver 21.00$           11.50$           NO BID 8.51$            
16 Morristown Police Department collar brass-3/8" gold 28.00$           11.50$           NO BID 8.51$            

17 1/2" brushed silver with black lettering nameplate with 
serving since bar (2pc) pin back 28.00$           22.75$           

NO BID
14.16$          

18 1/2" brushed gold with black lettering nameplate with 
serving since bar (2pc) pin back 28.00$           22.75$           NO BID 14.16$          

19 1/2" brushed silver with black lettering nameplate with 
serving since bar (1 pc) pin back 36.00$           22.75$           NO BID 15.58$          

8

7 (CON'T) NO BID

NO BID
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UNIFORMS  

B.K. 
GRAPHICS

 SUMMIT 
UNIFORMS DESCRIPTIONITEM BKT UNIFORMS

SUPPLIERS BID PRICE

Small Rank Collar Brass - Cpl, Sgt, Lt, Capt, Deputy Chief & 
Chief - Silver and Gold 6.07$             8.51$            
Cpl #P302; Sgt. #P304; Lt.#P1300, Capt.#P1302 4.90$             
Deputy Chief #P1602; Chief #P1604 8.90$             
Larg Rank collar Bras - Cpl. Sgt, Lt, Capt, Deputy Chief & Chief - 
Silver & Gold 6.07$             9.92$            
Cpl.#P402; Sgt.#P404;Lt. #P900; Capt. #P902 4.90$             
Deputy Chief #P1602; Chief #P1604 8.90$             
Polo Shirts with Embroidered Badge and/or Special Assignment
Cornerstone C5410 31.00$           
XS-XL 38.60$           
2XL 41.13$           
3XL 44.21$           
4-5XL 49.83$           
SANMAR CS410 33.60$          
Dress Uniform Single Breast Coat
Fechheimer #38800 160.00$        
Elbeco 110.61$        
Flying Cross Style F1 38800 147.93$       
                Additional cost for braid 12.00$           
Long Sleeve White Dress Shirt for Dress Uniform 44.22$           
Fechheimer #35W5400 38.25$           
Flying Cross Style F1 35W54-00 41.90$          

Dress Uniform Trousers 50.14$           
Flying Cross Justice no stripe 43.74$          
Flying Cross Justice w/stripe 71.42$          
Fechheimer #47280 62.95$           
Fechheimer #38200 38.50$           
Feccheimer Stripe 6.00$             
Honor Guard Class A Uniform Shirt 44.42$           
Flying Cross Justice 37.85$          
Fechheimer #07W84862 60.90$           

26

NO BID

NO BID

21

22

23

24

25

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

20

NO BID
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