
5/17/2022 
 

Pre-Meeting WORK SESSION 
May 17, 2022 

4:00 p.m. 

AGENDA 
CITY OF MORRISTOWN, TENNESSEE 

CITY COUNCIL MEETING 
May 17, 2022 

5:00 p.m. 

1. CALL TO ORDER

Mayor Gary Chesney

2. INVOCATION

3. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

4. ROLL CALL

5. APPROVAL OF MINUTES

1. May 3, 2022

6. PROCLAMATIONS/PRESENTATIONS

7. CITIZEN COMMENTS ABOUT AGENDA ITEMS ONLY
(Other than items scheduled for public hearing.)

8. OLD BUSINESS

8-a. Public Hearings & Adoption of Ordinances/Resolutions

1. Ordinance No. 4711
Being an Ordinance of The City Council of Morristown, Tennessee
amending Title 2 (Boards and Commissions, Etc.); Title 12 (Fire and
Construction Codes); and Title 13 (General Property Maintenance).

9. NEW BUSINESS

9-a. Resolutions

1. Resolution No. 2022-13
A Resolution of the City Council of the City of Morristown, Tennessee
Approving the Civil Service Board’s Amendments to its Public Safety
Qualifications and Standards for the Entry Level Green Book.

1 Return to Agenda



 

9-b. Introduction and First Reading of Ordinance

1. Ordinance No. _____
Entitled an Ordinance to Close and Vacate Certain Rights-of-Ways within
the City of Morristown {Portion of Tennessee Avenue right-of-way just
east of the intersection of York Avenue, the general location being shown
on the attached Exhibit A}.
{Public Hearing June 7, 2022}

9-c. Awarding of Bids/Contracts

1. Approval of the Jolley Park Donation Acceptance Agreement and
Quitclaim Deed for the conveyance of Jolley Park.

2. Approval of Change Order No. 6 with PATH Construction in the amount
of $253,105.99 for Morristown Landing.

3. Acknowledge receipt of qualifications for Engineering Services on April 5,
2022 and Authorize the Administration to negotiate and execute Master
Service Agreements with all seven submitters.

4. Approval of Proposal from Telics to provide Right-of-Way Acquisition
Services for the Thompson Creek Road Reconstruction – Phase 2 in the
amount of $22,500.

9-d. Board/Commission Appointments

1. Mayor or Mayor’s Designee to the Morristown-Hamblen Humane Society
(appointed annually) term to expire on May 15, 2023; term expiring Willie
Santana.

2. City Council appointment or reappointment to the Morristown-Hamblen
Humane Society Board for a three (3) year term to expire on May 15,
2025; term expiring; Carrie Boley.

3. City Council appointment(s) or reappointment(s) to the Parks and
Recreation Advisory Board for a three (3) year term to expire on June 1,
2025; terms expiring Joe Frye, Randall Jolley, Chad McCoige.

4. City Council appointments to the Property Maintenance Board of Appeals.
The five (5) member board to be appointed as follows:

⋅ two (2) members for a one (1) year term to expire June 1, 2023 
⋅ two (2) members for a two (2) year term to expire June 1, 2024 
⋅ one (1) member for a three (3) year term to expire June 1, 2025 

9-e. New Issues

10. CITY ADMINISTRATOR’S REPORT

5/17/2022 
2 Return to Agenda



5/17/2022 
 

11. COMMUNICATIONS/PETITIONS
This is the portion of the meeting where members of the audience
may speak subject to the guidelines provided.

12. COMMENTS FROM MAYOR/COUNCILMEMBERS/COMMITTEES

13. ADJOURN

WORK SESSION 
May 17, 2022 

1. FY 22/23 Budget
2. Parks and Recreation Master Plan

City Council Meeting/Holiday Schedule. 
May 17, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
May 17, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
May 30, 2022 Monday City Center Closed – Observance of Memorial Day 
June 7, 2022 Tuesday 3:30 p.m. Finance Committee Meeting 
June 7, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
June 7, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
June 21, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
June 21, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
July 4, 2022 Monday City Center Closed – Observance of Independence Day 
July 5, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
July 5, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
July 19, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
July 19, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
August 2, 2022 Tuesday 3:30 p.m. Finance Committee Meeting 
August 2, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
August 2, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
August 16, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
August 16, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
September 5, 2022 Monday City Center Closed – Observance of Labor Day 
September 6, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
September 6, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
September 20, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
September 20, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
October 4, 2022 Tuesday 3:30 p.m. Finance Committee Meeting 
October 4, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
October 4, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
October 18, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
October 18, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
November 1, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
November 1, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
November 15, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
November 15, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
November 24-25, 

 
Thurs/Fri City Center Closed – Observance of Thanksgiving Holiday 

December 6, 2022 Tuesday 3:30 p.m. Finance Committee Meeting 
December 6, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
December 6, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
December 20, 2022 Tuesday 4:00 p.m. Work Session – Council Agenda Review 
December 20, 2022 Tuesday 5:00 p.m. Regular City Council Meeting with Work Session 
December 26, 2022 Monday City Center Closed – Observance of Christmas Day 

 

3 Return to Agenda



4 Return to Agenda



5 Return to Agenda



6 Return to Agenda



7 Return to Agenda



8 Return to Agenda



ORDINANCE NO. 4711 
 
 

BEING AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF MORRISTOWN, 
TENNESSEE AMENDING TITLE 2 (BOARDS AND COMMISSIONS, ETC.); 
TITLE 12 (FIRE AND CONSTRUCTION CODES); AND TITLE 13 (GENERAL 
PROPERTY MAINTENANCE). 

_________________________________________________________________________ 
 
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL of the City of Morristown that the text of Title 2 
(Boards and Commissions, etc.); Title 12 (Fire and Construction Codes); and Title 13 (General 
Property Maintenance) shall be to include or replaced in their entirety the following:  
 
 
TITLE 2 – BOARDS AND COMMISSIONS, ETC. 
CHAPTER 3. – CONSTRUCTION BOARD OF APPEALS 
 
Sec. 3-301- Purpose of the board 

The board shall have the authority to hear appeals of decisions and interpretations of the 
building, plumbing, gas, electrical, mechanical and fire inspectors. 

Sec. 3-302 – Membership and terms of office: 
 

(1) The Construction Board of Appeals for the city is hereby reorganized as set forth 
herein below: 
 
a. The Construction Board of Appeals shall consist of nine members appointed 

by the governing body. 
 

b. The terms of office of the board members shall be staggered so that no more 
than one-third of the board is appointed or replaced in any 12-month period. 
 

c. Vacancies shall be filled for an unexpired term in the manner in which 
original appointments are required to be made. Continued absence of any 
member from board meetings shall, at the discretion of the governing body, 
render such member subject to removal from office. 
 

d. A simple majority of the board shall constitute a quorum. A decision by the 
board shall require an affirmative vote by a majority of the members present. 
 

e. The board shall be composed of individuals with knowledge and experience 
in the technical codes, such as design professionals, contractors or building 
industry representatives. No board member shall act in a case in which that 
member has a personal or financial interest and shall recuse themselves or 
abstain from the decision. 
 

(2) The Construction Board of Appeals members shall also serve as the Board of 
Neglected Structures in accordance with 2018 IRC Section R101.2 (Scope); 
2018 IPMC Section 108 (Unsafe structures and equipment) & Section 110 
(Demolition); City Ordinance Chapter 2 (Slum Clearance); and TCA 13-6-103.  

9 Return to Agenda



 
a. The Board of Neglected Structures shall meet as needed for the transaction 

of business.  
 

b. The Board of Neglected Structures shall hear appeals of decisions of the 
building official regarding dilapidation hearings that have occurred in 
accordance with 2018 IRC Section R101.2 (Scope); 2018 IPMC Section 108 
(Unsafe structures and equipment) & Section 110 (Demolition); City 
Ordinance Chapter 2 (Slum Clearance); and TCA 13-6-103.  

 
 
CHAPTER 4. – PROPERTY MAINTENANCE BOARD OF APPEALS 
 
Sec. 4-401- Purpose of the board: 

The board shall have the authority to hear appeals of Code Enforcement Officers’ 
decisions and interpretations of the Municipal Property Maintenance Code as well as the 
ICC International Property Maintenance Code (IPMC) as adopted in Section 12-302 
pursuant to Section 111 of the IPMC.  

Sec. 4-402- Appeals: 

Any appeal to this board shall be made within the 20-day time period as required and 
stated on the Notice of Violation.  The board shall meet to hear the appeal upon notice of 
the chairman, within 20 days of the filing of the appeal, or at stated periodic meetings. 

Sec. 4-403 – Membership and terms of office: 
 

a. The Property Maintenance Board of Appeals shall consist of five members 
appointed by the governing body. 
 

b. The board shall be composed of residents of the jurisdiction who are qualified 
by experience and training to pass on matters pertaining to property 
maintenance and who are not employees of the city government. The code 
official shall be an ex-officio member but shall not vote on any matter before 
the board.  No board member shall act in a case in which that member has a 
personal or financial interest and shall recuse themselves or abstain from the 
decision. 

 
c. The terms of office of the board members shall be three-year terms 

staggered so that no more than one-third of the board is appointed or 
replaced in any 12-month period. 

 
d. Vacancies shall be filled for an unexpired term in the manner in which 

original appointments are required to be made. Continued absence of any 
member from board meetings shall, at the discretion of City Council, render 
such member subject to removal from office. 

 
e. A simple majority of the board shall constitute a quorum. A decision by the 

board shall require an affirmative vote by a majority of the members present. 
 

10 Return to Agenda



TITLE 12 - FIRE AND CONSTRUCTION CODES 

CHAPTER 9 - CONSTRUCTION BOARD OF APPEALS 

Sec. 12-901. - Construction Board of Appeals  

As created and defined in 2-301, The Construction Board of Appeals shall meet as 
needed for the transaction of business. The board shall have the authority to hear 
appeals of decisions and interpretations of the building, plumbing, gas, electrical, 
mechanical and fire inspectors. 

The Construction Board of Appeals members shall also serve as the Board of 
Neglected Structures in accordance with 2018 IRC Section R101.2 (Scope); 2018 IPMC 
Section 108 (Unsafe structures and equipment) & Section 110 (Demolition); City 
Ordinance Chapter 2 (Slum Clearance); and TCA 13-6-103.  

Sec. 12-902. – Property Maintenance Board of Appeals  

As created and defined in Section 2-501, The Property Maintenance Board of Appeals 
shall meet as needed for the transaction of business. The board shall have the authority to 
hear appeals of Code Enforcement Officers’ decisions and interpretations of the Municipal 
Property Maintenance Code as well as the ICC International Property Maintenance Code 
(IPMC) as adopted in Section 12-302 pursuant to Section 111 of the IPMC. Any appeal to 
this board shall be made within the 20-day time period as required and stated on the Notice 
of Violation.  The board shall meet to hear the appeal upon notice of the chairman, within 20 
days of the filing of the appeal, or at stated periodic meetings. 

TITLE 13 - PROPERTY MAINTENANCE REGULATIONS 
CHAPTER 1 - GENERAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE 

Sec. 13-105. - Removal of vegetation and debris from certain lots. 

c) Appeals. Any person directly affected by a decision of the code official, or a notice or 
order issued under this code shall have the right to appeal to the Property 
Maintenance Board of Appeals, provided that a written application for appeal is filed 
within 20 days after the day the decision or legal notice. An application for appeal 
shall be based on a claim that the true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted 
thereunder have been incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of this code do not fully 
apply, or the requirements of this code are adequately satisfied by other means. 

Sec. 13-110. – Property Maintenance Board of Appeals  

As created and defined in Section 2-501, The Property Maintenance Board of 
Appeals shall meet as needed for the transaction of business. The board shall have the 
authority to hear appeals of Code Enforcement Officers’ decisions and interpretations 
of the Municipal Property Maintenance Code as well as the ICC International Property 
Maintenance Code (IPMC) as adopted in Section 12-302 pursuant to Section 111 of 
the IPMC. Any appeal to this board shall be made within the 20-day time period as 

11 Return to Agenda



required and stated on the Notice of Violation.  The board shall meet to hear the appeal 
upon notice of the chairman, within 20 days of the filing of the appeal, or at stated 
periodic meetings. 

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that this ordinance shall take effect from and after the date of its final 
passage, the public welfare requiring it. 

 
Passed on first reading the 3rd day of May 2022. 
 
 ___________________________________ 
 Mayor      
                
ATTEST: 
 
___________________________________                                    
City Administrator 
                
 
Passed on second and final reading the 17th day of May 2022. 
 

 
 ___________________________________                   
 Mayor  
                            
ATTEST: 
 
 
____________________________________ 
City Administrator 
 

12 Return to Agenda



Amendments to Civil Service Board Green Book                                                                                                           
Resolution 2022-13 

RESOLUTION NO. 2022-13 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MORRISTOWN, TN 
APPROVING THE CIVIL SERVICE BOARD’S AMENDMENTS TO ITS PUBLIC 
SAFETY QUALIFICATIONS AND STANDARDS FOR ENTRY LEVEL GREEN BOOK. 

 
WHEREAS, the Civil Service Act of the City of Morristown requires that the City 

Council for the City of Morristown approve any and all amendments made to the Public Safety 
Qualifications and Standards for Entry Level (Green Book); and 

WHEREAS, the Civil Service Board for the City of Morristown is requesting approval 
of amendments to its Public Safety Qualifications and Standards for Entry Level (Green Book); 
and 

WHEREAS, at its’ February 8, 2022 meeting the Civil Service Board unanimously 
approved the recommended amendments to the Green Book. 

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of 
Morristown, TN that the following amendments to the Green Book as defined above are hereby 
adopted: 
 

SECTION 1:  GREEN BOOK – Public Safety Qualifications and Standards for Entry-
Level: 
 

I. Remove existing language from Exhibit 1F – Physical Test and replace with the 
following: 

 
Physical Testing Requirements for the Fire Department: 
 
Candidate shall complete eight stations in the allotted time given.  
 
Candidate should wear appropriate clothing for test. (pants will get 
stained/dirty; no open toe or open heel footwear; no loose or restrictive 
jewelry; t-shirt/sweatshirt; gloves optional)  
 
Candidate will wear a weighted vest, approximately 60 pounds.  
 
Candidate time will start when the stair climber starts, and time will stop 
when candidate completes the last station.  
 
Candidate time will be kept by multiple observers.  
 
Candidate will have MFD personnel shadowing them through this process 
if any questions arise during test.  
 
Candidate will have an opportunity to see the course and ask any questions 
on the day of exam.  
 

13 Return to Agenda



Amendments to Civil Service Board Green Book                                                                                                           
Resolution 2022-13 

Candidate will have 10:20 to complete all eight stations. This is a pass or 
fail test. 
 

− Candidate will have a 20 second warm-up on the stair climber and 
then will climb at a rate of 60 steps per minute for 3 minutes. 

 
85 foot cool down 

 
− Candidate will drag a 200 foot 1 ¾ hose line 100 feet, then turn, 

drop to one knee, and pull the other 100 foot of hose hand over 
hand to a designated point. 

 
85 foot cool down 

 
− Candidate will bend at the knees and pick up two 25-pound 

weights. Candidate will carry the two weights in a straight line 75 
feet around a cone and back 75 feet to the original starting point. 

 
85 foot cool down 

 
− Candidate will take 10 controlled strikes with a sledgehammer at a 

waist high rubber plate simulating a door breach. 
 

85 foot cool down 
 

− Candidate will drag 165-pound dummy 40 feet around a cone and 
back 40 feet to the original starting point for a total of 80 feet. 

 
85 foot cool down 

 
− Candidate will raise a 24-foot extension ladder while making 

contact with each rung while raising. Then the candidate will fully 
extend a 24-foot extension ladder while using a hand over hand-
controlled motion and lowering the ladder in the same manner. If 
the candidate loses control of the ladder or let the rope slide 
through their hands, the station must be started over from the 
beginning.  

 
85 foot cool down 

 
− Candidate will crawl on hands and knees 65 feet to simulate 

conducting a search in a structure. 
 

85 foot cool down 
 

14 Return to Agenda



Amendments to Civil Service Board Green Book                                                                                                           
Resolution 2022-13 

− Candidate, while using a 6-foot pike pole, will fully push a 60-
pound weighted plate until it stops and lower until it stops 3 times. 
Then the candidate will pull an 80-pound weighted handle down 
fully and release it fully 5 times. This will count as one set, with a 
total of 4 sets to be completed. 

 
SECTION 2:  This resolution shall become effective upon passage, the public welfare 

requiring it. 
 
PASSED ON THIS THE 17th DAY OF MAY 2022. 
 
 
              

MAYOR 
 
ATTEST:  
 
 
 
_______________________________________ 
CITY ADMINISTRATOR 

15 Return to Agenda



16 Return to Agenda



ORDINANCE NO. ______ 
 
ENTITLED AN ORDINANCE TO CLOSE AND VACATE CERTAIN 
RIGHTS-OF-WAYS WITHIN THE CITY OF MORRISTOWN  
{Portion of Tennessee Avenue right-of-way just east of the intersection of York 
Avenue, the general location being shown on the attached Exhibit A} 
 

 
 Section I. WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Morristown has 
the power to, when expedient, close, vacate and abandon rights-of-way within 
the municipality; and 

 
 WHEREAS, the following action is deemed to be in the best interest of 
the municipality; 

 
 NOW THEREFORE: 
 
 Section II. BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
CITY OF MORRISTOWN that the following right-of-way is hereby closed, 
vacated and abandoned: 
 
 
 Beginning at the point of intersection of Lot 17 of the Mullins Addition 
as shown on a plat of the same which appears of record in the Register’s 
Office for Hamblen County, Tennessee in Plat Cabinet B Page 20, the 
southern boundary of the York Avenue right-of-way, and northern boundary 
of the Tennessee Avenue right-of-way and heading in a easterly direction 
57.5 feet; Thence in a southerly direction 40 feet along the easterly boundary 
of the Tennessee Avenue right-of-way to the point of intersection of said 
right-of-way and Lot 16 of the Mullins Addition; Thence heading in a 
westerly direction 57.5 feet along the southern boundary of Tennessee 
Avenue right-of-way; Thence heading in a northerly direction 40 feet across 
the Tennessee Avenue right-of-way to the point of beginning. 
 

 
 Section III. BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that all ordinances or parts of 
ordinances in conflict herewith be, and the same are, hereby repealed. 
 
 Section IV. BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that this ordinance takes effect from 
and after its passage, the public welfare requiring it. 
 
  
 Passed on first reading the 17th day of May 2022. 
 

17 Return to Agenda



        
 Mayor 
ATTEST: 
 
 
       
City Administrator 
 
 
 
 Passed on second and final reading this the 7th day of June 2022. 
 
 
             
      Mayor 
ATTEST: 
 
 
       
City Administrator 
 

 
 
 

18 Return to Agenda



Exhibit A: 
 

 
 

19 Return to Agenda



20 Return to Agenda



21 Return to Agenda



22 Return to Agenda



23 Return to Agenda



24 Return to Agenda



Document G701
Change Order

AIA Document G701 Copyright © 1979, 1987, 2000 , 2001 and 2017 by The American Institute of Architects. All rights reserved. The “American 
Institute of Architects,” “AIA,” the AIA Logo, and “AIA Contract Documents” are registered trademarks and may not be used without permission. This document 
was produced by AIA software at 09:51:49 ET on 05/10/2022 under Order No.2114318256 which expires on 05/03/2023, is not for resale, is licensed for one-time 
use only, and may only be used in accordance with the AIA Contract Documents® Terms of Service. To report copyright violations, e-mail copyright@aia.org.
User Notes:  (3B9ADA45)

1

PROJECT: (Name and address) CONTRACT INFORMATION: CHANGE ORDER INFORMATION:
17007-3 Morristown Community Center Contract For: General Construction Change Order Number: 006

Date: 12/01/2020 Date: 05/10/22

OWNER: (Name and address) ARCHITECT: (Name and address) CONTRACTOR: (Name and address)
City of Morristown
100 West First North St.
Morristown, TN 37814

Lose Design
2809 Foster Ave
Nashville, TN 37210

Path Construction Northeast
125 E. Algonquin RD
Arlington Heights, IL 60005

THE CONTRACT IS CHANGED AS FOLLOWS:
(Insert a detailed description of the change and, if applicable, attach or reference specific exhibits. Also include agreed upon adjustments 
attributable to executed Construction Change Directives.)
Construction Revisions
Project construction contingency items through the course of construction.

The original Contract Sum was $ 27,927,000.00 
The net change by previously authorized Change Orders $ 3,388,910.37 
The Contract Sum prior to this Change Order was $ 31,315,910.37
The Contract Sum will be increased by this Change Order in the amount of $ 253,105.99
The new Contract Sum including this Change Order will be $ 31,569,016.36 

The Contract Time will be increased by Zero (0) days.
The new date of Substantial Completion will be  unchanged.

NOTE: This Change Order does not include adjustments to the Contract Sum or Guaranteed Maximum Price, or the Contract 
Time, that have been authorized by Construction Change Directive until the cost and time have been agreed upon by both the 
Owner and Contractor, in which case a Change Order is executed to supersede the Construction Change Directive. 

NOT VALID UNTIL SIGNED BY THE ARCHITECT, CONTRACTOR AND OWNER.

Lose Design Path Construction City of Morristown
ARCHITECT (Firm name) CONTRACTOR (Firm name) OWNER (Firm name)

SIGNATURE SIGNATURE SIGNATURE

Sean Guth, Architect
PRINTED NAME AND TITLE PRINTED NAME AND TITLE PRINTED NAME AND TITLE

DATE DATE DATE

e DesignnDesignLose
TECECCECCCCCTTTTTTTTTTTTTARCHIT (F(F(F(F((( irm name)( ameeeeeeee))))))))))))))

SIGNATUREIGNA

05/10/22

Brian Leibham, PM

5/10/22

25 Return to Agenda



Path Construction Northeast
125 E. Algonquin Road

Arlington Heights, IL  60005
Tel:  847-398-7100
Fax:  847-398-7101

www.pathcc.com

March 1, 2022

Sean Guth
Lose Design
2809 Foster Avenue
Nashville, TN 37210

17007-3 Morristown Community Center
4355 Durham Landing
Morristown, TN 37813

Subject:  COR #06 – Structural Revisions

Dear Sean:

Per the request of the project team, the following costs are for the scope of additional work for
modifications made to meet the requirements of the changes made in Construction Revisions.

Scope for Proposed Work Subtotal

1. Concrete Guys of OH
a. Revision to rebar and shoring for elevated slab (RFI 145)  $             28,984.90

2. Creative
a. Revised parapet at West gym wall (RFI 174/181)  $               5,760.00

3. Fabricraft
a. Added angle under stairwell (RFI 163)  $              3,365.00
b. Storefront Support along Column C.2 to exterior wall (RFI 161)  $            22,325.00
c. HVAC Support at Area B (RFI 185)  $            61,430.00
d. Added roof deck and angle (RFI 189)  $              8,400.00
e.Tax for the above (9.75%)  $              9,313.20

4. Exel
a. Added angle under stairwell (RFI 163)  $              3,500.00
b. Storefront Support along Column C.2 to exterior wall (RFI 161)  $            27,000.00
c. HVAC Support at Area B (RFI 185)  $            18,200.00
d. Added roof deck and angle (RFI 189)  $              4,600.00
e. Weld added angles for RTU Support in Area D (RFI 186)  $              5,200.00
f.  Relocate joists for plumbing (RFI 166)  $                 420.00

5. MNM Drywall
a. Added layers of drywall on wall types (Revision 25)  $              7,351.50
b. Revised blocking at parapet around gym (RFI 162)  $            12,804.00

6. Path
a. Cross Creek Welding

i. Weld bolts to installed angle for revised parapet blocking (RFI 162)  $              2,990.00
b. Sunbelt

i. Manlift for revised parapet blocking (RFI 162)  $              3,255.60
c. Fastenal

26 Return to Agenda



i. Bolts for revised parapet blocking (RFI 162)  $                133.91

Subcontractor Subtotal $             225,033.11

7. Path Markup (10%) $               22,503.31
8. Bond / Insurance (2.25%) $                 5,569.57

TOTAL: $             253,105.99

This change order proposal is based solely on direct cost elements such as labor, material, and normal mark ups, and
does not include any amount for changes in the sequence of work, delays, disruption, cumulative impact of change orders,
rescheduling, extended overhead, acceleration, weather impacts, and/or impact costs which are not possible to assess at
the present time. Right is expressly reserved to make claim for any and all of these related items of compensable cost prior
to final settlement of this Contract. This proposal is based on conditions at the time of its preparation. Path Construction
reserves the right to modify or withdraw this proposal if it is not accepted within thirty (30) days.

Sincerely,

Brian Leibham
Path Construction Northeast
bleibham@pathcc.com
847-997-6495

27 Return to Agenda



THE CONCRETE GUYS OF OHIO, INC.
977 Gaynelle Ave DATE:

Streetsboro, Ohio 44241 CO #: 21009

330-842-9156

jimconcreteguys@gmail.com

Job: 40.022.20 Morristown Community Center

Path Construction Northeast

Attn: Brian Leibham

Description Labor Material Equipment O/H Profit Tax Amount

RFI 145 Answer drawing now showing additional

rebar, (2) beams, add area-south, connections. $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Formwork engineering/rev. drawings 2.00 $500.00 $60.25 $48.75 $711.50

Rebar not previously shown 3.80 TON 60.00 $5,654.95 $873.00 $551.36 $10,154.30

Concrete 3.6 CY $522.00 $52.20 $50.90 $625.10

Additonal Formwork, labor, lumber & rental                         180.00 $493.00 $6,141.94         $1,585.99 $48.07 $17,494.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00

SUBTOTALS                                                                                                                       $28,984.90

Bond premium auto add $0.00

CURRENT CHANGE ORDER $28,984.90

Acceptance Signature/Date

Labor rate=$51.25/hr, O/H Profit=10%, Tax Rate=9.75%

CHANGE ORDER
10/18/2021

28 Return to Agenda

mailto:jimconcreteguys@gmail.com


301 Bohannon Avenue Greeneville, TN 37745
Phone (423)-787-2087   Fax (423)-787-2167

cmiestimating@aol.com

Project:   Morristown Community Center

Project Location:

Attn: Brian Leibham

Description: Parapet at west gym wall

Base Bid: $5,760

29 Return to Agenda



30 Return to Agenda



 

21 3rd Street 

Bristol, TN 37620 

(423) 968-7747 
 

CHANGE ORDER #011 

FABRICRAFT JOB#21-01 

 

 

 

P a g e  1 | 1 

 

TO: PATH CONSTRUCTION  PROJECT:  MORRISTOWN COMMUNITY CENTER 

     MORRISTOWN, TN 

 

ATTN:    BRIAN LEIBHAM  DATE: NOVEMBER 8, 2021 

 

CHANGE ORDER DETAILS AS FOLLOWS:

o PROVIDE GALV. LINTELS PER RFI 161    $14,125 + TAX

TOTAL COST THIS CHANGE: $14,125 + TAX

 

 

RESPECTFULLY SUBMITTED, 
 

JOSH MCCROSKEY 
FABRICRAFT, INC 
423-968-7747 
joshmccroskey@fabricraft.us 

 

31 Return to Agenda

mailto:joshmccroskey@fabricraft.us
BLeibham
Callout
RFI 161 at Curtain Wall location (~column 111 to column 16)



 

21 3rd Street 

Bristol, TN 37620 

(423) 968-7747 
 

CHANGE ORDER #013 

FABRICRAFT JOB#21-01 

 

 

 

P a g e  1 | 1 

 

TO: PATH CONSTRUCTION  PROJECT:  MORRISTOWN COMMUNITY CENTER 

     MORRISTOWN, TN 

 

ATTN:    BRIAN LEIBHAM  DATE: JANUARY 14, 2022 

 

CHANGE ORDER DETAILS AS FOLLOWS:

o PROVIDE GALV. LINTELS PER CHRIS UNDERWOOD   $8,200 + TAX

TOTAL COST THIS CHANGE: $8,200 + TAX

 

 

RESPECTFULLY SUBMITTED, 
 

JOSH MCCROSKEY 
FABRICRAFT, INC 
423-968-7747 
joshmccroskey@fabricraft.us 

 

32 Return to Agenda

mailto:joshmccroskey@fabricraft.us
BLeibham
Callout
RFI 161 at Storefront location (~column 16 to exterior)



 

21 3rd Street 

Bristol, TN 37620 

(423) 968-7747 
 

CHANGE ORDER #012 

FABRICRAFT JOB#21-01 

 

 

 

P a g e  1 | 1 

 

TO: PATH CONSTRUCTION  PROJECT:  MORRISTOWN COMMUNITY CENTER 

     MORRISTOWN, TN 

 

ATTN:    BRIAN LEIBHAM  DATE: DECEMBER 3, 2021 

 

CHANGE ORDER DETAILS AS FOLLOWS:

o PROVIDE GALV. DUNNAGE FRAMES PER RFI# 185  $61,430 + TAX

o PROVIDE ANGLE AND ADDITIONAL DECK PER RFI# 189  $  8,400 + TAX

TOTAL COST THIS CHANGE: $69,830 + TAX

 

 

RESPECTFULLY SUBMITTED, 
 

JOSH MCCROSKEY 
FABRICRAFT, INC 
423-968-7747 
joshmccroskey@fabricraft.us 

 

33 Return to Agenda

mailto:joshmccroskey@fabricraft.us


                                               2400 North John B. Dennis Hwy. Kingsport, TN 37660
Phone: (423)817-2156

 QUOTATION

Bid Date:  12/22/21

Contractor: Path
Project Name: Morristown Community Center
Project Location: Morristown, TN
Addendums:

RFI 163 – Install added angle and channels

Total Price: $3,500.00

This proposal is valid for thirty (30) days from the bid date shown above and payment terms shall be Net 30 from the date of the
invoice.  If you have questions or need any additional information, please contact me at (423)817-2156.

Regards,

Landon Stallard
landon@exel-us.com

34 Return to Agenda



                                               2400 North John B. Dennis Hwy. Kingsport, TN 37660
Phone: (423)817-2156

 QUOTATION

Bid Date:  12/9/21

Contractor: Path
Project Name: Morristown Community Center
Project Location: Morristown, TN
Addendums:

RFI 185 – Cut down existing channels onsite to fit, install added storefront support and plate

Total Price: $27,000.00

This proposal is valid for thirty (30) days from the bid date shown above and payment terms shall be Net 30 from the date of the
invoice.  If you have questions or need any additional information, please contact me at (423)817-2156.

Regards,

Landon Stallard
landon@exel-us.com

35 Return to Agenda



                                               2400 North John B. Dennis Hwy. Kingsport, TN 37660
Phone: (423)817-2156

 QUOTATION

Bid Date:  12/6/21

Contractor: Path
Project Name: Morristown Community Center
Project Location: Morristown, TN
Addendums:

RFI 185 – Install added galvanized HVAC support in Area B

Total Price: $18,200.00

This proposal is valid for thirty (30) days from the bid date shown above and payment terms shall be Net 30 from the date of the
invoice.  If you have questions or need any additional information, please contact me at (423)817-2156.

Regards,

Landon Stallard
landon@exel-us.com

36 Return to Agenda



                                               2400 North John B. Dennis Hwy. Kingsport, TN 37660
Phone: (423)817-2156

 QUOTATION

Bid Date:  12/28/21

Contractor: Path
Project Name: Morristown Community Center
Project Location: Morristown, TN
Addendums:

RFI 189 – Install deck and support utilizing specialized scissor lift due to stairwell

Total Price: $4,600.00

This proposal is valid for thirty (30) days from the bid date shown above and payment terms shall be Net 30 from the date of the
invoice.  If you have questions or need any additional information, please contact me at (423)817-2156.

Regards,

Landon Stallard
landon@exel-us.com

37 Return to Agenda



                                               2400 North John B. Dennis Hwy. Kingsport, TN 37660
Phone: (423)817-2156

 QUOTATION

Bid Date:  12/6/21

Contractor: Path
Project Name: Morristown Community Center
Project Location: Morristown, TN
Addendums:

RFI 186 – Modify and weld new angle onto installed HVAC support in Area D

Total Price: $5,200.00

This proposal is valid for thirty (30) days from the bid date shown above and payment terms shall be Net 30 from the date of the
invoice.  If you have questions or need any additional information, please contact me at (423)817-2156.

Regards,

Landon Stallard
landon@exel-us.com

38 Return to Agenda



                                               2400 North John B. Dennis Hwy. Kingsport, TN 37660
Phone: (423)817-2156

 QUOTATION

Bid Date:  12/7/21

Contractor: Path
Project Name: Morristown Community Center
Project Location: Morristown, TN
Addendums:

Move joist for Plumbing conflict

Total Price: $420.00

This proposal is valid for thirty (30) days from the bid date shown above and payment terms shall be Net 30 from the date of the
invoice.  If you have questions or need any additional information, please contact me at (423)817-2156.

Regards,

Landon Stallard
landon@exel-us.com

39 Return to Agenda



WO # DATE

500004-500 01/12/2022

MNM Drywall Inc, Phone: (865)415-6776
2927 Essary Dr Suite 201, Knoxville, TN 37918

Page 1

BILL TO

125 E. Algonquin Road
Arlington Heights, IL 60005

CUSTOMER

Path Construction Northeast
125 E. Algonquin Road
Arlington Heights, IL 60005

PROJECT

Morristown Community Center
PROJECT #: 500004
4355 Durham Landing
Morristown, TN 37813

WORK DESCRIPTION
Revision #25.

This includes:

Adjustments to # of layers of type x gyp for 2-hour rated walls as discussed via recent phone call

Adjustments to mens toilets in A2062 to avoid the beam as discussed in RFI 183

Total Cost: $7,351.50

TERMS & CONDITIONS

All modifications / additions to the original Project, as stated above, are to be performed under the same Terms and
Conditions as the original contract, unless otherwise stipulated.

APPROVAL

This WO has been accepted on __________________ by _____________________

Signature: _________________________________________________________

40 Return to Agenda



                      MNM DRYWALL INC 
                                                              PROJECT QUOTE 

 
Company: PATH Construction 

Project: Morristown Community Center  

Contact: Brian Leibham 

Date: 12/09/2021 

             The following quote includes all equipment, materials, labor and a one-
year warranty and is based on RFI 181 and RFI 174 PARAPET WALL DETAIL on the 
gym’s north, south, east, and west walls. 

Total – $12,804.00 

                                                                                   Thank you, 

                                                                                   James Welsh 

                                                                                   MNM Drywall Inc 

 

P:865-254-8691 / F: 865-544-7365 

jwelsh@mnmdrywallinc.com 

Member HBAGK 

41 Return to Agenda



42 Return to Agenda

BLeibham
Text Box
owner CO



43 Return to Agenda

BLeibham
Text Box
owner CO



44 Return to Agenda

BLeibham
Text Box
owner CO



45 Return to Agenda

BLeibham
Text Box
owner CO



46 Return to Agenda



47 Return to Agenda



48 Return to Agenda



49 Return to Agenda


	1  cc agenda 5-17-2022
	5_1  Minutes 5-3-2021 Draft
	8a1  4711 Board of Appeals ORD Changes May
	9a1  2022-13 Resolution Civil Service Green Book
	9b1  First Reading ROW_TenneseeAve_Ord
	9c1  Jolley Park
	9c2  40.022.20 - Morristown Community Center - COR 06 - Structural Revision
	9c3  Engineering Services
	9c4  Telics



