III | City of Sikeston

. LENTATIVE AGENDA

““SPECIAL CITY COUNCIL MEETING
SIKESTON CITY HALL

Monday, August 25, 2014
11:30 A.M.

- . CALL TO ORDER

ll. RECORD OF ATTENDANCE
l. OPENING PRAYER
V. PUBLIC HEARING

Establishment of 2014 Municipal Real Estate Tax Rates

V. [TEMS OF BUSINESS

A 15t & 2" Reading Emergency Bill #5965, Establishing 2014 Municipal Real
Estate Tax Rates

B. 2nd Reading & Consideration of Emergency Bill #5964, Authorizing Increase

in Board of Municipal Utilities Electrical Rates

2" Reading & Consideration of Bill #5961, Amending City Code Chapter 405

Zoning, Manufactured Homes

Council Consideration of Resolution #14-08-01, Authorizing Preliminary

Funding Agreement

Council Consideration of Resolution #14-08-02, Authorizing the City to

Engage Gilmore & Bell and PGAV as Planning Consultants for Proposed TIF

Project

1%t Reading, Bill #5966, Authorizing Termination of Redevelopment Project

Area 3 of the 60/61 Tax Increment Finance District

. Authorization to Repair 1998 Vac-Con Sewer Truck

Authorization to Re-Appropriate Funding for Purchase of Used DPW Vehicle

Request to Bid Broker Services for Ancillary Employee Benefits

Briefing: Municipal Court Domestic Violence Shelter Surcharge Fee

Briefing: 2014 Boards & Commissions Appointments

Other ltems As May Be Determined During the Course of the Meeting

m o o

rRETI@ M

vi. ADJOURNMENT

Dated this 21% day of August 2014

/%7/._,
~
AWl

arroll Couch, City Clerk | i Javex
i
The City of Sikeston complies with ADA guidelines. Notify Linda Lowes at 471-2512 (TDD Available) to notify the Clty Bt
any reasonable accommodation needed to participate m the City Council's Meeting. i l !" '
: x‘l'

105 East Center Street  Sikeston, Missouri 63801




City of Sikeston

Council Letter

Date of Meeting: 14-08-25

Originating Department: Administrative Services

To the Mayor and City Council:
Subject: 1% & 2™ Reading, Bill # 5965, Approval of 2014 Tax Rate

Attachments:
1. Ordinance 5965
2. Notice of Public Hearing
3. State Auditor’s Office-Assessed Valuation Summary
4. State Auditor’s Office-Tax Rate Calculations

Action Options:
1. Approve Ordinance 5965
2. Other action Council may deem appropriate

Background:

In accordance with RSMO 67.110, all political subdivisions must establish their 2014,
property tax rates by September 1, after a public hearing. After receiving assessed valuation
data from both Scott and New Madrid Counties, the State Auditor's Office calculates rates
permitted in order to be in compliance with laws pertaining to revenue restrictions established

by the Hancock Amendment and those subdivisions with voluntary reduction restrictions

Due to the requirements of the State of Missouri, this is presented as an emergency
bill which upon approval, shall be forwarded to both Counties and the State Auditor’s office for

final approval.



BILL Number 5965 ORDINANCE Number 5965

AN EMERGENCY BILL, WHICH UPON ADOPTION AND PASSAGE, SHALL BECOME
ORDINANCE NUMBER 5965, AN ORDINANCE FIXING THE RATE OF TAXATION ON
ALL TAXABLE PROPERTY IN THE CITY OF SIKESTON, MISSOURI, FOR THE
FISCAL YEAR 2014-2015.

WHEREAS, the Sikeston City Council held a public hearing in accordance with Section
67.110 RSMO prior to the adoption of the City's 2014-2015 Tax Rate.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Sikeston,
Missouri, as follows:

Section I. This ordinance will not be codified in the Municipal Code Book of the City of
Sikeston.

Section Il. That for the purpose of maintaining a general fund, there is hereby levied a
tax rate of forty and two one-hundredth cents ($.4002) per one hundred dollars
($100.00) of assessed valuation on all taxable property in the City of Sikeston, Missouri,
for the year 2014-2015.

Section Ill. That for the purpose of maintaining a public library fund, there is hereby
levied a tax rate of seventeen and forty four one-hundredth cents ($.1744) per one
hundred dollars ($100.00) of assessed valuation on all taxable property in the City of
Sikeston, Missouri, for the year 2014-2015.

Section IV. That for the purpose of maintaining public parks, there is hereby levied a
tax rate of seventeen and forty four one-hundredth cents ($.1744) per one hundred
dollars ($100.00) of assessed valuation on all taxable property in the City of Sikeston,
Missouri, for the year 2014-2015.

Section V. General Repealer: Any other ordinance or parts thereof inconsistent
herewith, are hereby repealed.

Section VI. Severability: Should any part or parts of this Ordinance be found or held to
be invalid by any court of competent jurisdiction, the remaining part or parts shall be
severable and shall continue in full force and effect.

Section VII. Emergency Clause: Due to requirements of the State of Missouri, this
ordinance will become effective upon its passage.

Section VIII. Record of Passage:

A.  Bill Number 5965 was introduced to Council and read the first time this 25" day of
August 2014.

B. Bill Number 5965 was read the second time this 25" day of August 2014,
discussed and voted as follows:

Burch , Depro , Gilmore ,
Graham , Harris , Teachout :
and Pullen , thereby being

C. Ordinance 5965 shall be in full force and effect from and after Monday, August 25,
2014.

Jerry Pullen, Mayor



BILL NUMBER 5965

PAGE 2

Approved as to Form
Charles Leible, City Counselor

Seal/Attest:

Carroll L. Couch, City Clerk

BILL NUMBER 5965



NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

A hearing will be held at 11:30 a.m., August 25, 2014 in the City Council Chambers in the City
Administration Building, 105 East Center Street, Sikeston, Missouri, at which time citizens may
be heard on the property tax rates proposed to be set by the City of Sikeston. The tax rates shall
be set to produce the revenues for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 2014 subject to Article X,
Section 22 of the Missouri Constitution. The value of the new construction and improvements is
$2,069,990.00. '

2013 2014

Type of Assessed Assessed

Property Valuation Valuation*

Real Estate $137,495,434 $141,027,659

Personal 57,043,981 59,640,114

$194,539,415 $200,667,773%
2013-2014 2013-2014 2014-2015 2014-2015
Property Tax Property Tax Property Tax Property Tax
Revenue Rate Revenue Rate

$1,457,878 $0.7494 $1,503,078 $0.7490

General Iund - $0.4002; Park Fund - $0.1744; Library Fund $0.1744
(Expressed in cents per $100 valuation)

Carroll L. Couch, City Clerk
*Subject to certification by the State Auditor’s Office

To be published August 17, 2014.



l

0 0 , 0 066690'T STO'E09°01Z  99£'505°L9 679°L60°EPT [LIUA

0 0 0 OrT8TY'l 6TTO9T'09T  SOT'SHE'1S FZO'CTE'801T 195 001 ATeIqry 1

0 0 0 0SL'T%9 9BLTHI0S 197°099's STHTIL'FE PHPBIN AN TLO Arexqry Q1

0 0 0 066'690°C STO'EN9'0TT  99£°505°L9 69°L60°EP] [LALN )

0 0 0 orT'3Ty'l 6TTOIT0GT  SOT'SPRIS FEOSTER0T noog 001 UOHESIINY % S¥Bd 20

0 0 0 0SL'TF9 98L'CkE'08 191°099°¢1 CTYTRLFE PUPEIAl MON TLO UonearIey B sxied 70

0 ° 0 066690' STOE09°01T  99€S0S'L9  6b9'L60'EHT 107,

0 0 0 ObT'8TH'T 6TT'09T'09T  SOT'SPR'IS  PZO'STER01 #0§ 001 SMUSARY [BIAUSD 10

0 0 : 0 0SL'TP9 98LTIP'0S 191°099°¢1 STYTBLYE PUDET MaN TLO SMURAYY [EISUSH 1
Possassy aImg ATonuag, Alonnag, Ae1sy By [e10L Auadorg Ayadoxg resy Aoy agoding
01 [B207] WO pareredss AjmaN POpPY ATMoN sjuswaaorduzy pug JerosIod

pedueyy Auadorg

FI0Z/LO/30

UOTIOTLISHO) M3N

UOTIBUIE A Passassy UL

ATRUWILING UCHENR A POSSISSY 016y YB, $10T
803 $,I0IIPNY 2JBIS LINOSSTA

UOISSNIS JO AND  9100-001-60 - UOISIAIPANS [BonTj0d



PRO FORMA - STATE AUDITOR'S REVIEW OF DATA SUBMITTED
Tax Rate Form A

09-100-0016 General Revenue

City of Sikeston

8/5/2014
(2014)

For Political Subdivisions OTHER THAN SCHOOLS Levying a Single Rate on ALL PROPERTY

Name of Political Subdivision 7 Political Subdivision Code Purpose of Levy

The final version of this form MUST be sent to the County Clerk to forward to the State Anditor's Office.

Compufation of reassessment growth and rate for compliance with Article X, Section 22 and Section 137.073, RSMo.

1. (2014) Current Year Assessed Valuation

Include the current state and locally assessed valuation obtained from the County Clerk, County Assessor, or comparable office finalized

by the Jocal board of equalization.
(@) 143097649 + ()
{Real Estate)
2. Assessed Valuation of New Construction and Improvements
2(2) - Obtained from the County Clerk or County Assessor
2(b) - Increase in Personal Property. Use the formula listed under Line 2(b}.
® 7,865,252 =

Line 1(b} - 3(b) - 5(b} + 6(b) + 7(b)
H Line 2b is Negative, Enter Zero

67,505,366 =
(Personal Property)

(2) 2,069,990 +
(Real Estate)

3. Assessed Value of Newly Added Territory
Obtained from the County Clerk or County Assessor.

(@ 0 + (b)
(Real Estate)

4. Adjusted Current Year Assessed Valuation
[Line 1 (Total} - Line 2 (Total) - Line 3 (Total)

e e v we merm e — — — — At i ke e e o e men e e e e e e e e ey e R et e — — — — — — — — —

5. (2013) Prior Year Assessed Valuation

210,603,015

(Total)

9,935,242

(Total}

(T otal)

200,667,773

Include prior year locally assessed valuation obtained from the County Clerk, County Assessor, or comparable office finalized by the

Iocal board of equalization.

Note; If this is different than the amount on the Prior Year Form A, Line I, then revise the Prior Year tax rate form to re-calculate the

Prior Year Tax Rate Ceiling. Enter the revised Prior Year Tax Rate Ceiling on this year's Tax Rate Summary Page, Line A,

@ 137,966,854  + (®) 59,640,114 =
(Real Estate) (Personal Property)
6. Asscssed Vailue of Newly Separated Territory
Obtained from the County Clerk or County Assessor. _
@ o + ®) 0 =
{Real Estaic) (Personal Property)

7. Assessed Value of Property Locally Assessed in Prior Year, but State Assessed in Current Year
Obtained from the County Clerk or County Assessor,

(a) 0 + (b) 0 =
(Real Estate) (Personal Property)

8. Adjusted Prior Year Assessed Valuation
{Line 5 (Total) - Line 6 (Total) - Line 7 (Total)]

197,606,968

(Total)

(Total)

(Total)

197,606,968

(Form Revised 06-2014) Form A, Page 1 of 2



PRO FORMA - STATE AUDITOR'S REVIEW OF DATA SUBMITTED
Tax Rate Form A

City of Sikeston 09-100-0016 General Revenue

8/5/2014
(2014)

For Political Subdivisions OTHER THAN SCHOOLS Levying a Single Rate on ALL PROPERTY

Political Subdivision Code Purpose of Levy

Name of Political Subdivision

The final version of this forma MUST be sent to the County Clerk to forward to the State Auditor's Office.

Computation of reassessment growth and rate for compliance with Article X, Section 22 and Section 137.073, RSMo.

Information on this page takes into consideration amy voluntary reduction(s) taken in previous even numbered year(s). If in an even
mambered year, the political subdivision wishes to no longer use the lowered tax rate ceiling to calculate its tax rate, it can hold a public
hearing and pass a resolution, a policy statement, or an ordinance justifying its action prior to setting and certifying its tax rate. The
nformation on the Informational Tax Rate Data page at the end of these formsprowdesthem&c that would be allowed had there been no
previons voluntary reduction{s) taken in an even mnmbered year(s).

For Political
Subdivision Use in
Calculating its Tax

Rate

9. Percentage Increase in Adjusted Vatuation of existing property in the current year over the prior year's

assessed valuation.
[(Line 4 - Line 8) / Line 8 ] x 100

10. Increase in Consumer Price Index
as Certified by the State Tax Commission.

11. Adjusted Prior Year Assessed Valuation
(Line 8)

12, (2013) Tax Rate Ceiling From Prior Year
(Tax Rate Summary Page, Line A)

13. Maximum Prior Year Adjusted Revenue
from property that existed in both years {(Line 11 x Lime 12)/100]

14, Pernntted Reassessment Revenue Grnwth

A negative figare on Line 9 is treated as a zero for Line 14 purposes.
Do not enter less than 0, nor more than 5%.

15. Additional Reassessment Revenue Permitted
(Line 13 x Line 14)

16. Total Revenue Permitted in Current Year *
from property that existed in both years ( Line 13 + Line 15)

17. Adjasted Current Year Assessed Valuation
(Line 4)

18. Maximum Tax Rate Permitted by Article X, Section 22 and
Section 137.073 RSMo. [(Line 16 / Line 17) x 100]

Round a fraction to the nearest one/one hundreth of a cent.
Enter this rate on the Tax Rate Summary Page, Line B.

1.5489%

1.5000%

197,606,968

0.4004

791,218

1.5000%

11,868

803,086

200,667,773

04002

* To compute the fotal property tax revenues BILLED for the current year (including revenues from all new construction and improvements and annexed
property), multiply Line by the rate on Line 18 and divide by 100, The property tax revenues BILLED would be used in estimating budgeted revenues.

(Form Revised 06-2014) Form A, Page 2 0f2




PRO FORMA - STATE AUDITOR'S REVIEW OF DATA SUBMITTED 8/5/2014

Tax Rate Form A (2014)
For Political Subdivisions OTHER THAN SCHOOLS Levying a Single Rate on ALL PROPERTY

City of Sikeston 09-100-0016 Parks & Recreation

Name of Political Subdivision Political Subdivision Code Purpose of Levy

The final version of this form MUST be sent to the County Clerk to forward to the State Auditor's Office.
Computation of reassessment growth and rate for compliance with Article X, Secfion 22 and Section 137.073, KSMo.

1. (2014) Current Year Assessed Valuation
Inchude the current state and locally assessed valuation obtained from the County Clerk, County Assessor, or comparable office finalized
by the Jocal board of equalization.

@ 143,097,649 (b) 67,505,366 = 210,603,015
(Real Estate) {Personal Property) (Total)
2. Assessed Valuation of New Construction and Improvements
2(a) - Obtained from the County Clerk or County Assessor
2(b) - Increase in Personal Property. Use the formula listed under Line 2(b}).
(a) 2,069,990 + (b) 7,865,252 = 9,935,242
(Real Estate) Line 1(b) - 3(b) - 5(b} + 6(b) + 7(b) (Total)
If Line 2b is Negative, Enter Zero
3. Assessed Value of Newly Added Territory
Obtained from the County Clerk or County Assessor.
(a) 0 + (b) o = 0
(Real Estaic) (Personal Property) (Total)
4. Adjusted Current Year Assessed Valnation
[Line 1 (Total) - Line 2 (Total) - Line 3 (Total) 200,667,773

5. (2013) Prior Year Assessed Valuation

Include prior year locally assessed valuation obtained from the County Clerk, County Assessor, or comparable office finalized by the,
local board of equalization,
Note: If this is diffesent than the amount on the Prior Year Form A, Line 1, then revise the Prior Year tax rate form to re-calculate the

Prior Year Tax Rate Ceiling. Enter the revised Prior Year Tax Rate Ceiling on this year’s Tax Rate Summary Page, Line A.

@ 137,966,854 ®) 59,640,114 = 197,606,968
{Real Estate}’ (Personal Property) (Total)
6. Assessed] Value of Newly Separated Territory
Obtained from the County Clerk or County Assessor.
(@) 0o * () 0 = 0
(Real Estate) ' " (Personal Property) (Total)
7. Assessed Value of Property Locally Assessed in Prior Year, but State Assessed in Current Year
Obtained from the County Clerk or County Assessor.
(@ o + ®) 0 = 0
(Real Estate) (Personial Property) (Total)
8. Adjusted Prior Year Assessed Valuation
iLine 5 (Total) - Line 6 (Total) - Line 7 (Total)] 197,606,968
(Form Revised 06-2014) Form A, Page 1 of 2




PRO FORMA - STATE AUDITOR'S REVIEW OF DATA SUBMITTED
Tax Rate Form A

City of Sikeston 09-100-0016 Parks & Recreation

8/5/2014
(2014)

For Political Subdivisions OTHER THAN SCHOOLS Levying a Single Rate on ALL PROPERTY

Name of Pelitical Subdivision Political Subdiviston Code Purposc of Levy

The final version of this form MUST be sent to the County Clerk to forward to the State Anditer's Office.

Computation of reassessment growth and rate for compliance with Article X, Section 22 and Section 137.073, RSMo.

[ information on this page takes into consideration any voluntary reduction(s) taken in previous even aunbered year(s) If in an even
numbered year, the political subdivision wishes to no Jonger use the lowered tax raie ceiling te calculate its tax rate, it can hold a public
hearing and pass a resohution, a policy statement, or an. ordinance justifying its action prior to setting and certifying its tax rate. The
information on the Infornational Tax Rate Diata page at the end of these forms provides the rate that would be allowed had fheve been no
previons vohmtary reduction(s} taken in an even numbered year(s).

For Political
Subdivision Use in
Calculating ifs Tax

Rate

9. Percentage Increase in Adjusied Valuation of existing property in the current year over the prior year's

assessed valnation,
[(Line 4 - Line 8}/ Line 8 } x 100

10. Increase in Consumer Price Index
as Cestified by the State Tax Commission.

11. Adjusted Prior Year Assessed Valuatien
(Line 8)

12. (2013) Tax Rate Ceiling From Prior Year
(Tax Rate Summary Page, Line A)

13. Maximum Prior Year Adjusted Revenue
from property that existed in both years [(Line 11 x Line 12)/100]

14. Permitted Reassessment Revenue Growth

A negative figure on Line 9 is treated as a zero for Line 14 purposes.
Do not enter less than 0, nor more than 5%.

15. Additional Reassessment Revenne Permitted
" (Line 13 x Line 14)
16. Total Revenue Permitted in Current Year *
from property that existed in both years ( Line 13 + Line 15)
17. Adjusted Current Year Assessed Valuation
(Line 4)
18. Maximum Tax Rate Permitted by Article X, Section 22 and
Section 137.073 RSMo. [(Line 16/ Line 17} x 100]

Round a fraction to the nearest one/one hundreth of a cent.
Enter this rate on the Tax Rate Summary Page, Line B.

1.5489%

1.5000%

197,606,963

0.1745

344,824

1.5000%

5,172

349,996

200,667,773

0.1744

* To compute the total property tax revenues BILLED for the current year (including revenues from all new construction and itmprovements and annexed
property), multiply Line I by the rate on Line 18 and divide by 100. The property tax revenues BILLED wonld be used in estimating budgeted revenues.

{Form Revised 06-2014) Form A, Page 2 ¢f2




PRO FORMA - STATE AUDITOR'S REVIEW OF DATA SUBMITTED 8/5/2014
Tax Rate Form A (2014)
For Political Subdivisions OTHER THAN SCHOOLS Levying a Single Rate on ALL PROPERTY

City of Sikeston 09-100-0016 Library

Name of Political Subdivision Political Subdivision Code Purpose of Levy

The final version of this form MUST be sent te the County Clerk to forward to the State Aunditor's Office.

Compuiation of reassessment growth and rafc for compliance with Arficle X, Section 22 and Section 137.073, RSMo.

1. 2014) Current Year Assessed Valuation
Inclhude the current state and locally assessed valuation obtained from the County Clerk, County Assessor, or comparable office finalized

by the Jocal board of equalization.
(a) 143,097,649 . * (b) 67,505,366 = 210,603,015

(Real Estate) {Personal Property) (Total)
2. Assessed Valuation of New Construction and Improvements
2(a) ~ Obtained from the County Clerk or County Assessor
2(b) - Increase in Personal Property. Use the formula listed under Line 2(b).

(@) 2069990  + (b) 7,865,252 = 9,035,242
(Real Estate) Line 1(b) - 3(b) - 5(b) + 6(b) + 7(b) (Total)
If Line 2b is Negative, Enfer Zero
3. Assessed Value of Newly Added Territory
Obtained from the County Clerk or County Assessor.
@) 0 + ®) 0 = 0
(Real Estate) (Personal Property) (Total)
4. Adjusted Current Year Assessed Valuation
[Line 1 (Total) - Line 2 (Total) - Line 3 (Total) 200,667,773

5. (2013) Prior Year Assessed Valuation
Include prior year locally assessed valuation obtained from the County Clerk, County Assessor, or comparable office finalized by the

loca} board of equalization,
Note: If this is different than the amount on the Prior Year Form A, Line 1, then revise the Prior Year tax rate form to re-calculate the

Prior Year Tax Rate Ceiling. Enter the revised Prior Year Tax Rate Ceiling on this year's Tax Rate Summary Page, Line A.
@ 137,966,854  * ) 59,640,114 = 197,606,968
(Real Estate) {Personal Property) (Total)

6. Assessed Value of Newly Separated Territory
Obtained from the County Clerk or County Assessor.

@ 0 + (b) 0 = 0
(Real Estate) ~ {Personal Property) (Total)

7. Assessed Value of Property Locally Assessed in Prior Year, but State Assessed in Current Year
Obtained from the County Clerk or County Assessor.

(=) o t (®) 0 = 0
(Real Estate) {Personal Property) (Totat)
3. Adjusted Prior Year Assessed Valaation
[Line 5 (Total) - Line 6 (Total) - Line 7 (Total)} 197,606,968

(Fortn Revised 06-2014) Form A, Page 1 of 2



PRO FORMA - STATE AUDITOR'S REVIEW OF DATA SUBMITTED 8/5/2014

Tax Rate Form A

For Political Subdivisions OTHER THAN SCHOOLS Levying a Single Rate on ALL PROPERTY
City of Sikeston 09-100-0016 Library

Name of Political Subdivision Political Subdivision Code Purpose of Levy

The final version of this form MUST be sent to the County Clerk to forward to the State Anditor's Office.
Computation of reassessment growth and rate for compliance with Article X, Section 22 and Section 137.073, RSMo,

(2014)

Information on this page takes into consideration any vohmtary reduction(s} taken in previous ever numbered year(s). If in an even For Political

numbered year, the political subdivision wishes to no longer nse the lowered tax rate ceiling to calculate jts tax rate, t can hold a peblic " Sibdivision Use in

hearing and pass a resolution, a policy statement, or an endinance justifying its action prior to setting and certifying its tax rate. The Calculating its T

information on the Informational Tax Rate Data page at the end of these forms provides the rate that would be allowed had there been no g 15 Tax

previous vohmizry reduction(s) taken in an even numbered year(s). ) Rate

9. Percentage Increase in Adjusted Valwation of existing property in the current year over the prior year's

assessed valuation. '

[(Line 4 - Line 8) / Line 8 ] x 100 1.5489%
10. Increase in Consumer Price Index

as Cettified by the State Tax Commission. 1.5000%
11. Adjusted Prior Year Assessed Valuation

(Line 8) | 197,606,968
12. (2013) Tax Rate Ceiling From Prior Year

(Tax Rate Summary Page, Line A) 0.1745
13. Maximum Prior Year Adjusted Revenue

from property that existed in both years [(Line 11 x Line 12)/100] 344,824

A negative figure on Line 9 is treated as a zero for Line 14 purposes.

Do not enter less than 0, nor more than 5%.

1.5000%

15. Additional Reassessment Revenue Permitted

(Line 13 x Line 14y 5,172
16. Total Revenue Permitted in Current Year *

from property that existed in both years ( Line 13 + Line 15) 349,596
17. Adjnsted Current Year Assessed Valuation

(Linc 4) : 200,667,773
18. Maximum Tax Rate Permitied by Article X, Section 22 and

Section 137.073 RSMo. [(Line 16 / Line 17) x 100]

Round a fraction to the nearest onefone hundreth of 2 cent.

Enter this rate on the Tax Rate Summary Page, Line B. : 0.1744

* To compute the total property tax revenues BILLED for the current year (inchuling revenues from all new construction and improvements and annexed
properiy), multiply Line 1 by the rate on Line 18 and divide by 100. The property tax revenues BILLED would be used in estimating budgeted revenues.

{Form Revised 06-2014) Form A, Page 2 ¢f 2




City of Sikeston

Council Letter

Council Letter: 14-08-25

Originating Department: Board of Municipal Utilities

To the Mayor and City Council:

Subject: 2™ Reading Emergency Bill #5964, Authorizing Increase in Board of Municipal Utilities
Electrical Rates

Attachment:
1. Bill #5964
2. Electrical Rates for Fall 2014
3. Electrical Rate4s for Spring 2015

Action Options:
1. Adopt Bill #5964, Authorizing Increase in Board of Municipal Utilities Electrical Rates

2. Other action as Council may deem appropriate.

Background:
BMU is requesting approval from the City Council for an electric rate increase due to the

Sikeston Electric System not meeting the required Debt Service Coverage for fiscal year end 2014, and
the uncertain future of the wholesale power market. Also, Fitch Rating Service has put Sikeston on a
“negative outlook” basis, but retained currently the BBB+ rating. BMU General Manager, Ed Throop,
had previously informed the Sikeston City Council in 2012 that future rate increases would be necessary.
This rate increase proposal is a part of what was proposed in 2012, including the time frame to
implement such increase.

The proposal we are presenting is a composite 14.3% increase to be applied in two steps. The
first increase of 7.1% is applied on September 1, 2014 and the remainder is applied on April 1, 2015.
Based on average use, the increase will have the following impacts on residential customers:
beginning October 1%, a $5.20/month increase; and beginning May 1%, an additional $5.46/month
increase.

Staff asks for council consideration and approval of this bill. Because of the deadlines
established by the Board of Municipal Utilities Board of Commissioners, this is being presented as an
emergency bill which will become effective September 1, 2014.



BILL NUMBER 5964 ORDINANCE NUMBER 5964
A BILL, WHICH UPON ADOPTION AND PASSAGE SHALL BECOME EMERGENCY
ORDINANCE NUMBER 5964 AUTHORIZING AND ESTABLISHING ELECTRICAL CHARGES
AND RATES FOR THE CITY OF SIKESTON.

WHEREAS, the Board of Municipal Utilities has determined that electrical rate increases are
necessary and proper to maintain the economic viability of the municipal utility system, and

WHEREAS, the City Council believes an increase in rates is in the overall best interest of the
residents of Sikeston.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SIKESTON,
MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION I: This ordinance shall not be codified in the City Municipal Code.

SECTION II: The electric rates to be charged by the Board of Municipal Utilities from and after
September 1, 2014 shall be as set forth on Exhibit “A” which is attached hereto and
incorporated by reference.

SECTION lll: The Mayor and/or City Clerk are authorized to execute any and all documents
necessary to implement said rate changes.

SECTION 1V: This Ordinance is being considered as an emergency measure in order to comply
with certain refinancing requirements of City of Sikeston revenue bonds.

SECTION V: General Repealer Section. Any ordinance or parts thereof inconsistent herewith
are hereby repealed.

SECTION VI: Severability. Should any part or parts of this Ordinance be found or held to be
invalid by any court of competent jurisdiction, then the remaining part or parts shall be severable
and shall continue in full force and effect.

SECTION VII. Emergency Clause: Due to the deadlines established by the Board of Municipal
Utilities Board of Commissioners this bill will become effective September 1, 2014.

SECTION IX: Record of Passage:
A. Bill Number 5964 was introduced and read the first time this 4" day of August 2014.

B. Bill Number 5964 was read the second time and discussed on this 25" day of August 2014,
and was voted as follows:

Pullen , Harris , Gilmore , Teachout ,
Graham , Burch , Depro ,
thereby being , and becoming Ordinance 5964.

C. Ordinance 5964 shall be in full force and effect from and after September 1, 2014.

JERRY PULLEN, Mayor
Approved as to Form:

CHARLES LEIBLE, City Counselor

SEAL/ATTEST:

CARROLL COUCH, City Clerk



SIKESTON BOARD OF MUNICIPAL UTILITIES Date of Last
107 E. Malone Ave /PO Box 370 Rate Revision
Sikeston, Missouri 63801 SeDtember 01,2012

Section 1 - Availability

This rate is available to all residential customers at points on the Board of Municipal Utilities”
(hereinafter called BMU} existing secondary distribution lines within the area served by BMU.

Section 2 — Character of Service

Alternating current, 60 cycles, 120/240 volts, single-phase, or where available and at the option of BMU
120/240 volt three-phases, four wire delta of 120/208 volt three-phase, four wire wye. *

Section 3 - Application

To single-phase or three-phase service (if available) for ali domestic users in private residences, in
individual family apartments, supplied through one meter, where the BMU is the sole source of supply.
Not applicable for services to recognized rooming or boarding houses or establishments of a commercial
fature. Service is for fhe exclusive use of the customer and shall not be resold or shared with others.

Section 4 — Rate ‘ .
$4.45 per month

Customer Charge ~

Energy Charge .
First 1,000 kXWh .060 per kWh
Over 1,000 k<Wh .040 per kWh

Minimum bill — the minimum bill for any billing period shall be the customer charge.

Sechion 5 —Payment

Bills are rendered monthly and are due and payable within 10 days from the date of billing. Any
monthly bills not paid by the 20® of the month shall be assessed a 5% add-on penalty charge and be
subject to disconnection. The customer, in order to be reconnected, must pay all bills for eleciric service

together with any applicable reconnection charges.

Section 6 — Tax Clause

Bills computed under this rate are NOT subject fo any increase because of municipal taxes. Donations in
free street lighting, electricity and other services are made by the BMU to the City of Sikeston in lieu of

taxes.

Date Approved Date Effective September 1, 2014

Chairman

Mayor
Board of Municipal Utilities

City of Sikeston




SIKESTON BOARD OF MUNICIPAL UTILITIES Date of Last
107 E. Malone Ave / PO Box 370
Sikeston, Missouri 63801

Rate Revision
September 01, 2012

Section 1 - Availability

This rate is available to any commercial customers at points on the Board of Municipal Utilities”
(hereinafter called BMU) existing secondary distribution lines within the area served by BMU.

Section 2 — Character of Service

Alternating current, 60 cycles, 120/240 volts, single-phase, or where available and at the option of BMU
120/240 volt three-phases, four wire delta of 120/208 volt three-phase, four wire wye.

Section 3 - Application

To single-phase or three-phase service (if available) for all commercial establishments, including
churches, schools, and hospitals, where the BMU is the sole source of supply. Service is for the exclusive
use of the customer and shall not be resold or shared with others.

Section 4 — Rate

Customer Charge $6.80 per month
Energy Charge
First 1,000 kWh .071 per kWh
Over 1,000 kWh , .055 per kWh

Minimum bill - the minimum bill for any billing period shall be the customer charge.

Section 5 — Payment

Bills are rendered monthly and are due and payable within 10 days from the date of billing. Any
monthly bills not paid by the 20% of the month shall be assessed a 5% add-on penalty charge and be
subject to disconnection. The customer, in order to be reconnected, must pay all bills for electric service

together with any applicable reconnection charges.

“Section 6 — Tax Clause

NOT subject to any increase because of municipal taxes. Donations in

Bills computed under this rafe are
free street lighting, electricity and other services are made by the BMU to the City of Sikeston in liew of

taxes.

Date Effective September 1, 2014

Date Approved

Chairman

Mayor
Board of Municipal Utilities

City of Sikeston




SIKESTON BOARD OF MUNICIPAL UTILITIES Date of Last
107 E. Malone Ave /PO Box 370 Rate Revision
Sikeston, Missotri 63801

September 01, 2012

Section 1 - Availability

This rate is available to any large commercial customer using standard service for power or combined
power, lighting, heating and/or special equipment at points on the Board of Municipal Utilities
(hereinafter called BMU) existing distribution lines within the area served by BMU. No billing demand
shall be made for a maximum demand of less than one hundred kilowatts (100 KW). Any customer
pilled under this schedule must be willing to assume in each billing period a minimum demand of 100

KW,

Section 2 — Character of Service

BMU will specify and provide a standard single and/or three phase alternating current secondary service

voltage.

Section 3 Application

To single-phase or three-phase service for all large commercial uses where the BMU is the sole source of
supply. Service is for the exclusive use of the customer and shall not be resold or shared with others.

Section 4 —- Rate

De}nand Charge
per KW of billing demand - $6.07
- Energy Charge
First 180 kWh per KW Demand .050 per kWh
Next 180 kWh per KW Demand .040 per kWh
Over 360 kWh per KW Demand .035 per kWh
Minimum Charge: ‘

The monthly minimum charge shall be the billing demand charge, but not less than $607.00. This
schedule contemplates year around service with at least a minimum bill paid each month in the year.

Billing Demand: :

The billing demand shall be the maximum indicated kilowatt demand but not less than fifty percent
(50%) of the maximum indicated kilowatt demand recorded in the twelve month period ending with the
current month, except that no billing demand shall be less than one hundred kilowatts (100 kw).

Date Effective September 1, 2014

Date Approved

Chairman

Mayor
Board of Municipal Ulilities

City of Sikeston




Section 5 — Payment

days from the date of billing. Any
d a 5% add-on penalty charge and be
bills for electric service

Bills are rendered monthly and are due and payable within 10
T monthly bills not paid by the 20 of the month shall be assesse
subject to disconnection. The customer, in order fo be reconnected, must pay all

together with any applicable reconnection charges.

Seclion 6 —- Tax Clause

Bills computed under this rate are NOT subject to any increase because of municipal taxes. Donations in
free strect lighting, electricity and other services are made by the BMU to the City of Sikeston in Lieu of

taxes.

Section 7 — General

'Customers receiving service under this rate schedule shall sign a contract effective for at least one'year.

As far as practical, all energy should pass through one point of delivery and the BMU, at its option, may
meter at primary voltage.

Power Factor Clause
BMU will install a suitable demand meter(s) for determining the monthly maximum indicated demand.

The Customer will at all times maintain a power factor of not less than eighty-five percent (85%),
lagging. If the power factor is less than 85% and the customer does not expeditiously take corrective
action, the BMU shall adjust fhe customer’s billed demand in accordance with the following formula:

Bill Demand (KW) = Actual Demand (KW) x .85
Actual Power Factor

Continued failure to maintain an 85%
customer until such time the customer installs suifable
higher, or BMU may install necessary corrective equipment on its lines fo improve the custometr’s power
factor to at least 85% and will charge the customer for the fotal installed cost for same (including

material, labor and overhead costs).

power factor may result in discontinnance of service to the
devices to bring the power factor up to 85%, or

Date Approved

Chairman

Mayor
Board of Municipal Utilities

City of Sikeston

Date Effective September 1, 2014




SIKESTON BOARD OF MUNICIPAL UTILITIES Date of Last

107 E. Malone Ave / PO Box 370 Rate Revision
September 01, 2012

Sikeston, Missouri 63801

Section 1 - Availability

This rate is available to any customer using standard service for power or combined power, lighting,
heating and/or special equipment at points on the Board of Municipal Utilities (hereinafter called BMU)
existing distribution lines within the area served by BMU. No billing demand shall be made for a
maximum demand of less than five hundred kilowatts (300 KW). Any customer billed under this
schedule must be willing to assume in each billing period 2 minimum demand of 500 KW.

Section 2 — Character of Service

BMU will specify and provide a standard single and/or three phase alternating current secondary service
voltage.

Section 3 — Application

To single-phase or three-phase service for all large commercial uses where the BMU is the sole source of
supply. Service is for the exclusive use of the customer and shall not be resold or shared with others.

Section 4 — Rate

Demand Charge
per KW of billing demand $5.75
Energy Charge _
First 180 kWh per KW Demand .040 per kWh
Next 180 kWh per KW Demand .035 per kWh
Over 360 kWh per KW Demand .028 per kWh
Minimum Charge:

The monthly minimum charge shall be the billing démand charge, but not less than 52,875.00. This
schedule contemplates year around service with at least a minimum bill paid each month in the year.

Billing Demand:

The billing demand shall be the maximum indicated kilowatt demand but not less than fifty percent
(50%) of the maximum indicated kilowatt demand recorded in the twelve month period ending with the
current month, except that no billing demand shall be less than five hundred kilowatts (500 kW).

Section 5 — Payment

Bills are tendered monthly and are due and payable within 10 days from the date of billing. Any
monthly bills not paid by the 20% of the month shall be assessed a 5% add-on penalty charge and be
subject to disconnection. The cusiomer, in arder to be reconnected, must pay all bills for electric service

together with any applicable reconnection charges.




Seclion 6 ~ General

Customers receiving service under this rate schedule may be required to sign a contract effective for at

least one year.

As far as practical, all energy should pass through one point of delivery and the BMU, at its option, may

meter at primary voltage.

Power Factor Clause
BMU will install a suitable demand meter(s) for determining the monthly maximum indicated demand.

The Customer will at all imes maintain a power factor of not less than eighty-five percent (85%),
lagging. If the power factor is less than 85% and the customer does not expeditiously take corrective
action, the BMU shall adjust the customer’s billed demand in accordance with the following formula:

Bill Demand (KW) = Actual Demand (KW) x .85
Actual Power Factor

Continued failure to maintain an 85% power factor may result in discontinuance of service to the
customer until such time the customer installs suitable devices fo bring the power factor up to §5%, or
higher, or BMU may install necessary corrective equipment on its lines to improve the customer’s power
factor to at least 85% and will charge the customer for the total installed cost for same (including

material, labor arid overhead costs),

Date Approved

Chairman

Mayor
Board of Municipal Utilities

City of Sikeston

Date Effectivel éeptember 1, 2014




SIKESTON BOARD OF MUNICIPAL UTILITIES Date of Last
107 E. Malone Ave / PO Box 370 ~ Rate Revision
Sikeston, Missouri 63801 September 01, 2012

Section 1 - Availability

This rate is available to any large industrial customer using standard electric service for power or
combined power, lighting, heating and/or special equipment at points on the Board of Municipal
Utlities (hereinafter called BMU) exdsting distribution lines within the area served by BMU. No billing
ghall be made for a maximum demand of less than one hundred kilowatts (100 KW). Any customer
billed under this schedule must be willing to assume in each billing period a minimum demand of 100

Kw,

Sectign 2 — Character of Service

Alternating current, 60 cycle, 240 volt, 480 volt, or 2,400 volt, three-phase, for power loads, and 120/240
volis, single-phase for lighting and incidental loads.

Seclon 3 — Application

To single-phase or three-phase service for all industrial power uses in manufacturing and processing
establishments where BMU is the sole source of supply. Service is for the exclusive use of the customer
and shall not be rescld or shared with others. ’

Section 4 — Rate

Demand Charge
per kilowatt of billing demand $5.75
Energy Charge
First 180 kWh per KW Demand .0365 per kWh
Next 180 kWh per KW Demand .0315 per kWh
Over 360 kWh per KW Demand .0265 per kWh
Minimum Charge:

The monthly minimum charge shall be the billing demand charge, but not less than $575.00. This
schedule contemplates year around service with at least a minimum bill paid each month in the year.

Billing Demand:

The billing demand shall be the maximum indicated kilowatt demand but not less than fifty percent
(50%) of the maximum indicated kilowatt demand recorded in the twelve month period ending with the
current month, except that no billing demand shall be less than one hundred kilowatts (100 kw).

Date Effective September 1, 2014

Date Approved

Chairman

Mayor
Board of Municipal Utilities

City of Sikeston




Section 5 — Payment

within 10 days from the date of billing. Amny
be assessed a 5% add-on penalty charge and be
d, must pay all bills for electric service

Bills are rendered monthly and are due and payable
monthly bills not paid by the 20 of the month shall
subject to disconnection. The customer, in order to be reconnecte
together with any applicable reconnection charges.

Saction 6 — Tax Clanse

< rate are NOT subject to any increase because of municipal taxes. Donations in

Bills computed under thi
y the BMU to the City of Sikeston in lieu of

free street lighting, electricity and other services are made b
taxes.

Secton 6 — General

Customers receiving service under this rate schedule may be required to sign a contract effective for af

least one year or more.

As far as practical, all energy should pass through one point of delivery and the BMU, at its option, may

meter at primary voltage.

Power Factor Clause
BMU will install a snitable demand meter(s) for determining the monthly maximum indicated demand.

The Customer will at all times maintain a power factor of not less than eighty-five percent (85%),
lagging. If the power factor is less than 85% and the customer does not expeditiously take corrective
action, the BMU shall adjust the customer's billed demand in accordance with the following formula:

Bill Demand (KW) = Actual Demand {KW) x 85

Actual Power Factor

Continued failure to maintain an 85% power factor may result in discontinuance of service to the
customer until such time the customer installs suitable devices to bring the power factor up to 85%, or
higher, or BMU may install necessary corrective equipment on its lines to improve the customer’s powet
factor to at least 85% and will charge the customer for the total installed cost for same (including

material, labor and overhead costs).

Date Effective September 1, 2014

Date Approved

Chairman

Mayor
Board of Municipal Utilities

City of Sikeston




SIKESTON BOARD OF MUNICIPAL UTILITIES Date of Last
107 E. Malone Ave / PO Box 370 Rate Revision
Sikeston, Missouri 63801 September 01, 2014

Section 1. - Availability

This rafe is available to all residential customers at points on the Board of Municipal Utilities”
{hereinafter called BMU) existing secondary distribution lines within the area served by BMU.

Section. 2 — Character of Service

Alternating current, 60 cycles, 120/240 volis, single-phase, or where available and at the option of BMU
120/240 volt three-phases, four wire delta of 120/208 volt three-phase, four wire wye.

Section 3 — Application

To siiigle-phase or three-phase service (if available) for all domestic users in private residences, in
individual family apartments, supplied through one meter, where the BMU is the sole source of supply.
Not applicable for services to recognized rooming or boarding houses or establishments of a commercial
nature. Service is for the exclusive use of the customer and shall not be resold or shared with others.

Section 4 — Rate

Customer Charge $4.50 per month
Energy Charge :
First 1,000 kWh 063 per kWh
Over 1,000 kWh .045 per kWh

Minimum bill - the minimum bill for any billing period shall be the customer chai'gg.

Section 5 — Payment

Bills are rendered monthly and are due and payable within 10 days from the date of billing. Any
monthly bills not paid by the 20% of the month shall be assessed a 5% add-on penalty charge and be
subject to disconnection, The customer, in order to be reconnected, must pay all bills for electric service

together with any applicable reconnection charges.

Section 6 — Tax Clause

Bills computed under this rate are NOT subject to any increase because of municipal taxes. Donations in
free street lighting, electricity and other services are made by the BMU to the City of Sikeston in lieu of

taxes.

Date Effective March 1, 2015

Date Approved

Chairman

Mayor
Board of Municipal Utilities

City of Sikeston




SIKESTON BOARD OF MUNICIPAL UTILITIES Date of Last

107 E. Malone Ave/ PO Box 370 Rate Revisjon
September (M1, 2014

Sikeston, Missouri 63801

Section 1 - Availability

This rate is available fo any commercial customers at points on the Board of Munidpal Utilities’
(hereinafter called BMU) existing secondary distribution lines within the area served by BMU.

Section 2 — Character of Service

Alternating current, 60 cycles, 120/240 volts, single-phase, or where available and at the option of BMU
120/240 volt three-phases, four wire delta of 120/208 volt three-phase, four wire wye.

Section 3 — Application

To single-phase‘ or three-phase service (if available) for all commercial establishments, including
churches, schools, and hospitals, where the BMU is the sole source of supply. Serviceis for the exclusive
use of the customer and shall not be resold or shared with ofhers.

Sectiond — Rate

Customer Charge $7.00 per month
Energy Charge
First 1,000 kWh 073 per kWh
Over 1,000 kWh 065 per kWh

Minimum bill - the minimum bill for any billing period shall be the customer charge.

Section 5 — Payment

Bills are rendered monthly and are due and payable within 10 days from the date of billing. Any
monthly bills not paid by the 20% of the month shall be assessed a 5% add-on penalty charge and be
subject to disconnection, The custorher, in order to be reconnected, must pay all bills for electric service

together with any applicable reconnection charges.

Section 6 — Tax Clause

Bills computed under this rate are NOT subject to any increase because of municipal taxes. Donations in
free street lighting, electricity and other services are made by the BMU to the City of Sikeston in lieu of

{axes.

Date Effective 13rch 1, 2015

Date Approved

Chairman

Mayor
Board of Municipal Utilities

City of Sikeston




SIKESTON BOARD OF MUNICIPAL UTILITIES Date of Last
107 E. Malone Ave / PO Box 370 : Rate Revision
Sikeston, Missouri 63801 September 01, 2014

Section 1 - Availability

This rate is available to any large commercial customer using standard service for power or combined
power, lighting, heating and/or special equipment at points on the Board of Municipal Utilities
(hereinafter called BMU) existing distribution lines within the area served by BMU. No billing demand
shall be made for a maximum demand of less than one hundred kilowatts (100 KW). Any customer
billed under this schedule must be willing to assume in each billing period a minimum demand of 100

KW.

Section 2 — Character of Service

BMU will specify and provide a standard single and/or three phase alterna’fiﬂg current secondary service

voliage.

Section 3 — Application

-phase service for all large commercial uses where the BMU is the sole source of

To single-phase or three
d shall not be resold or shared with others.

supply. Service is for the exclusive use of the customer an

Section 4 — Rate

Demand Charge
per KW of billing demand $6.47
Energy Chérge
First 180 kWh per KW Demand .050 per kWh
Next 180 kWh per KW Demand 045 per kWh
Over 360 kWh per KW Demand 040 per kWh
Minimum Charge:

The monthly minimum charge shall be the billing demand charge, but not less than $647.00. This
schedule contemplates year around service with at least a minimum bill paid each month in the year.

Billing Demand:
The billing demand shall be the maximum indicated kilowatt demand but not less than fifty percent

(50%) of the maximum indicated kilowatt demand recorded in the twelve month period ending with the
current month, except that no billing demand shall be less than one hundred kilowatts (100 kW)

Date Effective March 1, 2015

Date Approved

Chairman

Mayor
Board of Municipal Utilities

City of Sikesten




Section 5 ~ Payment

the date of billing. Any

20% of the month shall be assessed a 5% add-on penalty charge and be
in order to be reconnected, must pay all bills for electric service

Bills are rendered monthly and are due and payable within 10 days from
meonthly bills not paid by the
subject to disconnection. The customer,
together with any applicable reconnection charges.

Section 6 — Tax Clause

NOT subject to any increase because of municipal taxes. Donations in

Bills computed under this rate are
of Sikeston in Heu of

free street lighting, electricity and other services are made by the BMU to the City
taxes.

Section 7 — General

" Customers receiving service under this rate schedule shall sign a contract effective for at least one year.

As far as practical, all energy should pass through one point of delivery and the BMU, at its option, may
meter at primary voltage.

Power Factor Clause
BMU will install a suitable demand meter(s) for determining the monthly maximum indicated demand.

The Customer will at all times maintain a power factor of not less than eighty-five percent (85%),
lagging. If the power factor is less than 85% and the customer does not expeditiously take corrective
action, the BMU shall adjust the customer’s billed demand in accordance with the following formula:

Bill Demand {(KW) = Actual Demand (KW) x .85
Actual Power Factor

Continued failure to maintain an 85% power factor may result in discontinuance of service to the
customer until such time the customer installs suitable devices to bring the power factor up to 85%, or
higher, or BMU may install necessary corrective equipment on its lines to improve the customer’s power
factor to at least 85% and will charge the customer for the total installed cost for same (inciuding

material, Iabor and overhead costs).

Date Effective March 1, 2015

Date Approved

Chairman

Mayor '
Board of Municipal Utilities

City of Sikesion




SIKESTON BOARD OF MUNICIPAL UTILITIES Date of Last
107 E. Malone Ave /PO Box 370 Rate Revision
Sikeston, Missouri 63801 September 01, 2014

Secton 1 - Availability

ailable to any customer using standard service for power ox combined power, lighting,

This rate is av
heating and/or $pecial equipment at points on the Board of Municipal Utilities (hereinafter called BMU)
BMU. No billing demand shall be made for a

existing distribution lines within the area served by
maximum demand of less than five hundred kilowatts (500 KW). Any customer billed under this

schedule must be willing to assume in each billing period a minimum demand of 500 KW.

Section 2 — Character of Service

| BMU will specify and provide a standard single and/or three phase alternating current secondary service

voltage.

Section 3 — Apphlcation

ommercial uses where the BMU is the sole source of

To single-phase or three-phase service for all large ¢
er and shall not be resold or shared with others,

supply. Service is for the exclusive use of the custom

¢

Section 4 — Rate

Demand Charge :
~ per KW of billing demand $6.00
Energy Charge
First 180 kWh per KW Demand © .045 per KkWh
Next 180 kWh per KW Demand .040 per kWh
Over 360 kWh per KW Demand {032 per KWh
Minimum Charge: -

The monthly minimum charge shall be the billing demand charge, but not less than $3,000.00. This
schedule contemplates year around service with at leasta minimum bill paid each month in the year.

Billing Demand:

The billing demand shall be the maximum indicated kilowatt demand but not less than fifty percent
(50%) of the maximum indicated kilowatt demand recorded in the twelve month period ending with the
current month, except that no billing demand shall be less than five hundred kilowatts (500 kW).

Section 5 — Payment

Bills are rendered monthly and are due and payable within 10 days from the date of billing. Any
monthly bills not paid by the 20* of the month shall be assessed a 5% add-on penalty charge and be
subject to disconnection. The customer, in order to be reconnected, must pay all bills for electric service

together with any applicable reconnection charges.




Section 6 — General

Customers receiving service under this rate schedule may be required to sign a contract effective for at

least one year.

As far as practical, all energy should pass through one point of delivery and the BMU, at its option, may
meter at primary voltage.

Power, Factor Clause
BMU will install a suitable demand meter(s) for determining the monthly maximum indicated demand.

The Customer will at all fmes maintain a power factor of not less than eighty-five percent (85%),
lagging. If the power factor is less than 85% and the customer does not expeditiously take corrective
action, the BMU shall adjust the customer’s billed demand in accordance with the following formula:

Bill Demand (KW) = Actual Demand (KW) x .85
Actual Power Factor

Continued failure to mainfain an 85% power factor may result in discontinuance of service to the
customer until such ime the customer installs suitable devices to bring the power factor up to 85%, or
higher, or BMU may install necessary cormrective equipment on its lines to improve the customer’s power
factor to at least 85% and will charge the customer for the total installed cost for same (including

material, labor and overhead costs).

Date Approved

Date Effect‘iveMafCh 1, 2015

Chairman

Mayor
Board of Municipal Utilities

City of Sikeston




SIKESTON BOARD OF MUNICIPAL UTILITIES Date of Last
107 E. Malone Ave / PO Box 370 Rate Revision
Sikeston, Missouri 63801 September 01, 2014

Section 1 - Availabilify

This rate is available to any large industrial customer using standard electric service for power or
combined power, lighting, heating and/or special equipment at points on the Board of Municipal
Utilities (hereinafter called BMU) existing distribution lines within the area served by BMU. No billing
shall be made for 2 maximum demand of less than one hundred kilowatts (100 KW). Any customer
billed under this schedule must be willing to assume in each billing period a minimum demand of 100

KW,

Section-z — Character of Service

Alternating current, 60 cycle, 240 volt, 480 volt, or 2,400 volt, three-phase, for power loads, and 120/240
volts, single-phase for lighting and incidental foads. '

Section 3 — Application

To single-phase or three-phase service for all industrial powef uses in manufacturing and processing
establishments where BMU is the sole source of supply. Service is for the exclusive use of the customer
and shall not be resold or shared with others.

Section 4 — Rate

Demand Charge
' per kilowatt of billing demand $5.95
Energy Charge
First 180 kWh per KW Demand 0375 per kWh
Next 180 kWh per KW Demand .0320 pexr kWh
Over 360 kWh per KW Demand 0275 per kWh
Minimum Charge:

The moﬁthly minimum charge shall be the billing demand charge, but not less than $595.00. This
schedule contemplates year around service with at Jeasta minimum bill paid each month in the year.

Billing Demand:

The billing demand shall be the maximum indicated kilowatt demand but not less than fifty percent
(50%) of the maximum indicated kilowatt demand recorded in the twelve month period ending with the
current month, except that no billing demand shall be less than one hundred kilowatts (100 kW).

Date Effective March 1, 2015

Date Approved

Chatrman

Mayor
Board of Municipal Utilities

City of Sikeston




Sechon 5 — Payment .

Bills are rendered monthly and are due and payable within 10 days from the date of billing. Any
monthly bills not paid by the 20% of the month shall be assessed a 5% add-on penalty charge and be
subject to disconnection. The customer, in order to be reconnected, must pay all bills for electric service

together with any applicable reconnection charges.

Section 6 — Tax Clause

Bills computed under this rate are NOT subject to any increase because of municipal taxes. Donations in
free street lighting, electricity and other services are made by the BMU to the City of Sikeston in lieu of

taxes.

Section 6 - General

Customers receiving service under this rate schedule may be required to sign a contract effective for at

least one year or more.

As far as practical, all energy should pass through one point of delivery and the BMU, at its option, may
meter at primary volfage.

Power Factor Clause
BMU will install a suitable demand meter(s) for determining the monthly maximum indicated demand.

The Customer will at all times maintain a powei factor of not less than eighty-five percent (85%),
lagging. 1f the power factor is less than 85% and the customer does not expeditiously take corrective
action, the BMU shall adjust the customer’s billed demand in accordance with the following formufa:

Bill Demand (KW) = Actual Demand (KW) x .83

Acfual Power Factor

Continued failure to maintain an 85% power factor may result in discontinuance of service to the
castomer until such time the customer installs suitable devices to bring the power factor up to 85%, or
higher, or BMU may install necessary corrective equipment on its lines to improve the customer’s power
factor to at least 85% and will charge the customer for the fotal installed cost for same (including

material, labor and overhead costs).

Date Effective March 1, 2015

Date Approved

Chalrman

Mayor
Board of Municipal Utilities

City of Sikeston




City of Sikeston

Council Letter

Date of Meeting: 14-08-25

Originating Department: Public Works Department

To the Mayor and City Council:

Subject: 2™ Reading and Consideration, Bill #5961, Authorization to amend Chapter 405
Zoning Regulations of the City Code of the City of Sikeston, Missouri regarding the
definition, permitted uses and conditional uses of manufactured housing units.

Attachment(s):

1. Bill#5961
2. Proposed Changes to Sikeston City Code Chapter 405 Zoning Regulations

Action Options:

1. Conduct 2™ Reading and approve amendment of Chapter 405 Zoning Regulations of the
City Code of Sikeston, Missouri regarding the definition, permitted uses and conditional
uses of manufactured housing units

2. Other action Council may deem appropriate

Background:
This is the request to amend Chapter 405 Zoning Regulations of the City Code of Sikeston,

Missouri regarding the definition, permitted uses and conditional uses of manufactured housing
units. Council read this the first time on August 4, 2014 and unless there are further questions
from the Council or the public, staff recommends approval on the second reading at this time.



BILL Number 5961 ORDINANCE Number 5961
THIS BILL AS APPROVED SHALL BECOME ORDINANCE NUMBER 5961 AND SHALL AMEND
CHAPTER 405 ZONING REGULATIONS OF THE CITY CODE OF THE CITY OF SIKESTON,
MISSOURI TO DEFINE MANUFACTURED HOUSING UNITS, THEIR PERMITTED AND
CONDITIONAL USES.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SIKESTON, MISSOURI AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION I:  This Ordinance shall be codified in Chapter 405 Zoning Regulations of the Sikeston
Municipal Code.

SECTION 1I: Chapter 405.050 Definitions shall be amended to read as follows:
A. Delete definition of “House Trailer” in its entirety.
B. Amend the definitions to read as follows:

‘MANUFACTURED HOME, CLASS A

A transportable structure intended for permanent occupancy as a residential unit, fabricated in a
factory in compliance with Federal Manufactured Home Construction and Safety Standards,
adopted June 15, 1976, as amended. It must carry the HUD seal of approval and comply with
minimum standards for tie-down systems published by the Missouri Public Service Commission,
and being fifteen (15) years old or newer at time of permit application for placement or relocation
of the manufactured home on an appropriately zoned lot, except as further provided for in this
Chapter.

MANUFACTURED HOME, CLASS B

A transportable structure intended for permanent occupancy as a residential unit, that does not
bear the HUD seal of approval or being 16 years or older at time of application. Said unit shall
comply with minimum standards for tie-down systems published by the Missouri Public Service
Commission.”

SECTION llI: Division 1: “R-1" and “R-2” Single Family Residential Districts, Section 405.450 Permitted
Uses, paragraph A (1) and A (2) are amended to read as follows:

“SECTION 405.450 PERMITTED USES.
[R.O. 2009 § 17.12.020]

A. In Districts "R-1" and "R-2", no building or land shall be used and no building shall hereafter
be erected, constructed, reconstructed or altered, except for one (1) or more of the following
uses:

1. In District "R-1" single-family dwellings, but not Class A or Class B manufactured homes.

2. In District "R-2" single-family dwellings, including Class A manufactured homes, subject to
the provisions and restrictions of Section 405.460 Conditional Uses of this Chapter.”

SECTION 1V: Division 1. “R-1” and “R-2” Single Family Residential Districts, Section 405.460
Conditional Uses, is amended as follows:

A. Paragraph “A” is amended to read as follows:

“SECTION 405.460 CONDITIONAL USES.
[R.O. 2009 § 17.12.030]

A. The following uses may be permitted in District "R-1" (but not Class A or Class B
manufactured homes), and District "R-2" after proper permit application for placement or
relocation of the manufactured home on an appropriately zoned lot, review and approval
pursuant to the provisions of this Section and Article V "Board of Adjustment” of this Chapter.”

B. Item A (5) shall read as follows:



5. In District "R-2", manufactured home class A units may be permitted as infill development
or unit replacement only subject to these additional provisions and restrictions:

a.

The usable square footage of the manufactured home shall be at least equal to the
average square footage of the conventionally built homes in the immediate area
(three hundred (300) feet).

Roofs will be constructed using composition materials and will have a minimum pitch
of the main roof of two and one-half (2¥%2) foot rise for each twelve (12) feet of
horizontal run and a minimum roof overhang of six (6) inches per side.

. The width can be no less than thirty percent (30%) of the length.

Exterior siding or covering shall be of a type, quality and appearance customarily
used on conventionally built homes.

. Have all wheels, axles, hitch and other mechanisms removed and placed on and

anchored to a permanent and complete foundation that has been constructed of
materials and in a manner approved by the building codes as currently adopted by
the City and the Missouri Public Service Commission.

f. Orientation of the manufactured housing unit on the lot will conform to the same

orientation as the majority of conventionally built structures in the immediate area
(three hundred (300) feet).

Example: Front door to front lot line, rear door to rear lot line.

. An apron or perimeter enclosure of solid masonry construction or other suitable

materials shall be installed in accordance with the building codes as currently adopted
by the City.

. Any such structure so installed shall conform to the appropriate zoning and

subdivision ordinances and any other pertinent ordinance in effect at the time of
installation or construction.

6. Zero lot line construction as provided for in Chapter 405, Article VI, Division 15.”

SECTION V: Section 405.471 Foundation, Anchoring and Underpinning (Skirting) Requirements, is
inserted into Division 1: “R-1” and” R-2” Single-family Residential Districts:

“SECTION 405.471 FOUNDATION, ANCHORING AND UNDERPINNING

(SKIRTING) REQUIREMENTS
[Ord. 5961 §V, 2014]

A. All manufactured homes located within the City of Sikeston shall be set upon a permanent
foundation properly designed and enclosed in accordance with the International Building Code.

1.

Manufactured homes shall be attached to a permanent footing, which manner of
placement shall be as stated on the building permit, and meet all manufacturers’
specifications for support.

a. Pier pads are not permitted.

b. All footings shall have reinforced steel, as dictated by appropriate building
code.

c. A minimum of eighteen (18) inches of crawl space must be maintained under
the entire manufactured unit.

B. Manufactured home anchors shall be imbedded in the footing or foundation to HUD,
Missouri Public Service Commission and manufacturer’s specifications.

C. Within ninety (90) days of the manufactured home’s setup, underpinning shall be installed in
such a way that all areas directly under the home are enclosed.



1. Underpinning shall be similar in appearance to materials used for the siding of the
manufactured home to which it is attached.

2. Said underpinning/foundation shall have permanently installed venting in accordance
with the manufacturer’s specifications. Deletions or omissions of vents are not allowed
and homes will not be approved for occupancy without appropriate venting.”

SECTION VI: Division 2: “R-3” Single Family Residential Manufactured Home District, Section 405.480
Purpose is amended to read as follows:

“SECTION 405.480 PURPOSE.
[R.O. 2009 § 17.14.010; Ord.5961 §V, 2014]

A. lItis the purpose and intent of this Chapter to allow the placement of Class A manufactured
homes within this district to increase the options available for low to moderate income
households in select residential areas of the City. The placement of manufactured housing
would be permitted subject to the requirements and procedures set forth herein. Single
ownership of the lot and manufactured housing unit must be demonstrated before a building
permit will be issued and in no case shall a manufactured home pad or lot be rented out in
this district. No manufactured home class B units shall be located in or relocated to an “R-3”
Single Family Residential Manufactured Home District.

B. Any manufactured home class B unit located within an “R-3” Single Family Residential
Manufactured Home District at the time of the adoption of this ordinance may remain until
said manufactured home is moved or relocated from its original lot and/or pad.”

SECTION VII: Division 2: “R-3” Single Family Residential Manufactured Home District, Section 405.490
Permitted Uses is amended to read as follows:

“‘SECTION 405.490 PERMITTED USES.
[R.O. 2009 § 17.14.020; Ord. 5961 §VII, 2014]

A. In District "R-3", no building, structure or premise shall hereafter be erected, constructed,
reconstructed or altered, located, or re-located except for one (1) or more of the following
uses:

1. Any use permitted in Districts "R-1" or "R-2".

2. Class A Manufactured Home unit as defined by this regulation, and installed per
regulations established by the City of Sikeston, and the Missouri Public Service
Commission.”

SECTION VIII: Section 405.500 Conditional Uses is amended, as follows:

“SECTION 405.500 CONDITIONAL USES.
[R.O. 2009 § 17.14.030; Ord. 5961 §VIIl, 2014]

All conditional uses permitted in Districts "R-1" and "R-2" are also permitted in this district
subject to the same provisions for application for placement or relocation of manufactured
housing on appropriately zoned lots, review and approval, except that the provisions for zero lot
line construction will not be permitted for the installation or construction of manufactured
housing.”

SECTION IX: Section 405.511 Foundation, Anchoring and Underpinning (Skirting) Requirements, is
inserted into Division 2: “R-3” Single-family Residential Manufactured Home District:

“SECTION 405.511 FOUNDATION, ANCHORING AND UNDERPINNING

(SKIRTING) REQUIREMENTS
[Ord. 5961 §IX, 2014]



A. All manufactured homes located within the City of Sikeston shall be set upon a permanent
foundation properly designed and enclosed in accordance with the International Building Code.

1. Manufactured homes shall be attached to a permanent footing, which manner of
placement shall be as stated on the building permit, and meet all manufacturers’
specifications for support.

a. Pier pads are not permitted.

b. All footings shall have reinforced steel, as dictated by appropriate building
code.

c. A minimum of eighteen (18) inches of crawl space must be maintained under
the entire manufactured unit.

B. Manufactured home anchors shall be imbedded in the footing or foundation to HUD,
Missouri Public Service Commission and manufacturer’s specifications.

C. Within ninety (90) days of the manufactured home’s setup, underpinning shall be installed in
such a way that all areas directly under the home are enclosed.

1. Underpinning shall be similar in appearance to materials used for the siding of the
manufactured home to which it is attached.

2. Said underpinning/foundation shall have permanently installed venting in accordance
with the manufacturer’s specifications. Deletions or omissions of vents are not allowed
and homes will not be approved for occupancy without appropriate venting.”

SECTION X Division 3: “R-4” Two-Family Residential District, Section 405.540 Conditional Uses is
amended to read as follows:

“SECTION 405.540 CONDITIONAL USES.
[R.O. 2009 § 17.16.030; Ord. 5961 §X, 2014]

A. The following uses may be permitted in District "R-4" after proper application for placement
or relocation of manufactured housing on appropriately zoned lots, review and approval
pursuant to the provisions of this Section and Article V "Board of Adjustment" of this Chapter:

1. Any conditional use provided for in Districts "R-1" and "R-2" except that the provision for
manufactured home class A units in District "R-2" shall be limited to the installation or
construction of single-family dwellings as infill development or unit replacement only.

2. Single-Family attached housing and zero lot line construction as provided for in Chapter
405, Article VII, Division 15.

3. Boarding and lodging houses.”

SECTION XI: Section 405.551 Foundation, Anchoring and Underpinning (Skirting) Requirements, is
inserted into Division 3: “R-4” Two-Family Residential District:

“SECTION 405.551 FOUNDATION, ANCHORING AND UNDERPINNING
(SKIRTING) REQUIREMENTS
[Ord. 5961 §XI, 2014]

A. All manufactured homes located within the City of Sikeston shall be set upon a permanent
foundation properly designed and enclosed in accordance with the International Building Code.

1. Manufactured homes shall be attached to a permanent footing, which manner of
placement shall be as stated on the building permit, and meet all manufacturers’
specifications for support.

a. Pier pads are not permitted.



b. All footings shall have reinforced steel, as dictated by appropriate building
code.

c. A minimum of eighteen (18) inches of crawl space must be maintained under
the entire manufactured unit.

B. Manufactured home anchors shall be imbedded in the footing or foundation to HUD,
Missouri Public Service Commission and manufacturer’s specifications.

C. Within ninety (90) days of the manufactured home’s setup, underpinning shall be installed in
such a way that all areas directly under the home are enclosed.

1. Underpinning shall be similar in appearance to materials used for the siding of the
manufactured home to which it is attached.

2. Said underpinning/foundation shall have permanently installed venting in accordance
with the manufacturer’s specifications. Deletions or omissions of vents are not allowed
and homes will not be approved for occupancy without appropriate venting.”

SECTION Xl Section 405.580 Conditional Uses is amended to read as follows:

“SECTION 405.580 CONDITIONAL USES.
[R.O. 2009 § 17.18.030; Ord. No. 5327 §llI, 5-18-2000; Ord. 5961 §XII, 2014]

A. The following uses may be permitted in District "R-5" after proper application for placement
or relocation of manufactured housing on appropriately zoned lots, review and approval
pursuant to the provisions of this Section and Article V "Board of Adjustment" of this Chapter:

1. Any conditional use provided for in Districts "R-1", "R-2" and "R-4" except that the
provisions for manufactured home class A units in District "R-2" shall be limited to the
installation or construction of single-family dwellings as infill development or unit
replacement only.

2. Single-family attached housing and zero lot line construction as provided for in
Chapter 405, Article VII, and Division 15.

3. Office buildings.”

SECTION XIII: Section 405.591 is inserted into Division 4: “R-5" Multiple-Family Residential District, as
follows:

“SECTION 405.591 FOUNDATION, ANCHORING AND UNDERPINNING

(SKIRTING) REQUIREMENTS
[Ord. 5961 §XIII, 2014]

A. All manufactured homes located within the City of Sikeston shall be set upon a permanent
foundation properly designed and enclosed in accordance with the International Building
Code.

1. Manufactured homes shall be attached to a permanent footing, which manner of
placement shall be as stated on the building permit, and meet all manufacturers’
specifications for support.

a. Pier pads are not permitted.

b. All footings shall have reinforced steel, as dictated by appropriate building
code.

c. A minimum of eighteen (18) inches of crawl space must be maintained under
the entire manufactured unit.

B. Manufactured home anchors shall be imbedded in the footing or foundation to HUD,
Missouri Public Service Commission and manufacturer’s specifications.



C. Within ninety (90) days of the manufactured home’s setup, underpinning shall be installed in
such a way that all areas directly under the home are enclosed.

1. Underpinning shall be similar in appearance to materials used for the siding of the
manufactured home to which it is attached.

2. Said underpinning/foundation shall have permanently installed venting in accordance
with the manufacturer’s specifications. Deletions or omissions of vents are not allowed
and homes will not be approved for occupancy without appropriate venting.”

SECTION XIV: Division 5: “R-6" Planned Manufactured Housing District General Conditions, Plans and
Approval, Section 405.610 Permitted Uses is amended to read as follows:

“SECTION 405.610 PERMITTED USES.
[R.O. 2009 § 17.20.020; Ord. 5961 §XIV, 2014]

A. In District "R-6", no manufactured home, building, land or premises shall be erected,
constructed, reconstructed, located, relocated or altered except in conformance with the final
development plan and one (1) or more of the following uses:

1. Single-family, manufactured home class A units for residential purposes.

2. Accessory buildings, clearly subordinate and incidental to the main buildings, any portion
of which is not located in a required front yard or within five (5) feet of any other lot line.

3. Churches and synagogues.

4. Customary home occupations, agricultural uses and signs subject to the restrictions
detailed in Section 405.450 for their uses.

5. Recreational uses for the exclusive use of the occupants of this district.”

SECTION XV: Division 5: “R-6” Planned Manufactured Housing District General Conditions, Plans and
Approval, Section 405.620 Conditional Uses is amended to read as follows:

“SECTION 405.620: CONDITIONAL USES.
[R.O. 2009 § 17.20.030’ Ord. 5961 §XV, 2014]
A. The following uses may be permitted in District "R-6" after proper application for placement

or relocation of manufactured housing on appropriately zoned lots, review and approval
pursuant to the provisions of this Section and Article V "Board of Adjustment"” of this Chapter:

1. Family day care homes subject to the provisions detailed in Section 405.450.
2. Private lakes.

3. Buildings and premises for public utility services or public service corporations,
whose buildings or uses the Board deems reasonably necessary for public
convenience or welfare.”

SECTION XVI: Division 5: “R-6" Planned Manufactured Housing District General Conditions, Plans and
Approval, Section 405.630 Height and Area Regulations is amended to read as follows:

“‘SECTION 405.630 HEIGHT AND AREA REGULATIONS
[R.O. 2009 § 17.20.040; Ord. 5961 §XVI, 2014]

A. In District "R-6", any building, dwelling or portion thereof hereafter erected, constructed,
reconstructed, altered, located or relocated shall be subject to the following regulation

1. Minimum tract size and location. Not less than five (5) acres in area and under single
ownership or unified control. Outer boundaries of the tract shall be not less than twenty-
five (25) feet from any public street and not less than fifteen (15) feet from all other
property lines.

2. Minimum lot area. Not less than four thousand (4,000) square feet.



3. Minimum lot width. Not less than forty-five (45) feet at the building line.
4. Minimum setback requirements.

a. Front yard. Twenty (20) feet.

b. Side yard. Five (5) feet.

c. Rear yard. Ten (10) feet.

5. Building height. In District "R-6", no building or manufactured housing unit shall
hereafter be erected or structurally altered to exceed one (1) story or sixteen (16) feet
in height.

6. Off-street parking. There shall be two (2) off-street parking spaces provided for each
lot. These spaces shall be constructed so as to be smooth, hard, dust-free and contain
at least one hundred sixty (160) square feet each.”

SECTION XVII: Section 405.631 Foundation, Anchoring and Underpinning (Skirting) Requirements is
inserted in Division 5: “R-6”" Planned Manufactured Housing District General Conditions, Plans and
Approval, as follows:

“SECTION 405.631 FOUNDATION, ANCHORING AND UNDERPINNING
(SKIRTING) REQUIREMENTS

[Ord. 5961 §XVII, 2014]

A. All manufactured homes located within the City of Sikeston shall be set upon a permanent
foundation properly designed and enclosed in accordance with the International Building Code.

1. Manufactured homes shall be attached to a permanent footing, which manner of
placement shall be as stated on the building permit, and meet all manufacturers’
specifications for support.

a. Pier pads are not permitted.

b. All footings shall have reinforced steel, as dictated by appropriate building
code.

c. A minimum of eighteen (18) inches of crawl space must be maintained under
the entire manufactured unit.

B. Manufactured home anchors shall be imbedded in the footing or foundation to HUD, Missouri
Public Service Commission and manufacturer’s specifications.

C. Within ninety (90) days of the manufactured home’s setup, underpinning shall be installed in
such a way that all areas directly under the home are enclosed.

1. Underpinning shall be similar in appearance to materials used for the siding of the
manufactured home to which it is attached.

2. Said underpinning/foundation shall have permanently installed venting in
accordance with the manufacturer’s specifications. Deletions or omissions of vents are
not allowed and homes will not be approved for occupancy without appropriate venting.”

SECTION XVIII: Division 8: Transitional District, Section 405.740 Permitted Uses is amended to read
as follows:

“SECTION 405.740 PERMITTED USES.
[R.O. 2009 § 17.24.020; Ord. 5961 §XVIII, 2014]

A. In District "TZ", no building or land shall be used, and no building shall hereafter be erected,
constructed, reconstructed or altered except for one (1) or more of the following uses as
reflected in the Transitional District "TZ" Table of Uses set out in Subsection (B) of this
Section.



B. Anydowntown district, as may be designated by ordinance of the Sikeston City Council and
located in whole or in part within a Transitional District "TZ", shall be subject to additional
use restrictions as set forth in the Transitional District "TZ" Table of Uses below and shall be
designated on City Zoning Maps as “TZ DT.”

“Transitional District "TZ" Table Of Permitted Uses
"DT" Downtown

Category/Use "TZ" Transitional District
Executive, administrative and P P
professional offices

Medical offices, including clinics and P P
medical laboratories

Facilities for human care, such as P P
convalescent and nursing home

Cosmetics and toiletries P P
(compounding only)

Libraries and government office P P

buildings and public utility offices, but

not storage yards or post offices

Private social or fraternal clubs or P P
lodges that do not provide for the sale

or consumption of alcoholic

beverages

Churches and related facilities P P
Nursery schools and day care P P
facilities

Photographic and interior decorating P P
studios

Funeral homes P P
Establishments that perform personal P P
services on the premises, such as

beauty parlors and barbershops

Facilities for private lessons in art, P P
music and dance

Accessory buildings or uses P P

customarily incidental to any of the

above permitted uses

Bed and breakfast homes and bed P P
and breakfast inns as defined in City

Code Section 405.860

Uses not listed above, but have CuU P
similar characteristics

Small, low volume retail sale facilities (a)

such as:

Book stores CuU P
Antique stores CuU P
Dress shops CuU P
Manufactured Home Class A Units, CuU

single-family

Veterinary clinics and hospitals, CuU

provided all activities are conducted
within a totally and permanently
enclosed building

(Transitional District “TZ” Table of Permitted Uses on following page)

P— Permitted as a matter of right
CU— May be permitted by the Board of Adjustment

(a) This does not include businesses that prepare food or food items for take out or on-premises consumption or provides
for the sale or consumption of alcoholic beverages.”

SECTION XIX: Division 8: Transitional District, Section 405.750 Conditional Uses is amended to read
as follows:



“SECTION 405.750 CONDITIONAL USES.
[R.O. 2009 § 17.24.030; Ord. 5961 §XIX, 2014)]

A. The following uses may be permitted in District "TZ" after proper application, review and
approval pursuant to the provisions of this Section and Article V "Board of Adjustment” of this
Chapter.

1. Uses not listed above, but have similar characteristics.

2. Small, low volume retail sale facilities such as bookstores, antique stores or dress
shops. This does not include businesses that prepare food or food items for take out
or on-premises consumption or provides for the sale or consumption of alcoholic
beverages.

3. Manufactured home class A units, single-family.

4. Veterinary clinics and hospitals provided all activities are conducted within a totally
and permanently enclosed building.”

SECTION XX: Division 11: “C-17, “C-2” and “C-3” Commercial Districts, Section 405.920 Tables — Use,
Height and Area Regulations, Table 1. Permitted Uses, footnote (a) is amended to read as follows:

“SECTION 405.920 TABLES - USE, HEIGHT AND AREA REGULATIONS

“(a@)Include all uses listed as permitted or conditional use in a residential district, except the
provision for Class A manufactured housing shall remain in a conditional use.”

SECTION XXI: General Repealer Section: Any ordinance or parts thereof inconsistent herewith are
hereby repealed.

SECTION XXII: Severability: Should any part or parts of this ordinance be found or held to be invalid by
any court of competent jurisdiction, then the remaining part or parts shall be severable and shall
continue in full force and effect.

SECTION XXIll: Record of Passage:

A. Bill Number 5961 was introduced and read the first time this 4th day of August 2014.
B. Bill Number 5961 was read the second time and discussed this 25th day of August, 2014,
and voted as follows:
Burch , Depro , Gilmore , Harris , Graham ,
Teachout , and Pullen , thereby being ,

and becoming Ordinance 5961.

C. Ordinance 5961shall be in full force and effect from and after September 24, 2014.

Jerry Pullen, Mayor

Approved as to form
Charles Leible, City Counselor

Seal / Attest:

Carroll Couch, City Clerk



PROPOSED CHANGES TO SIKESTON CITY CODE
CHAPTER 405 ZONING REGULATIONS

GENERAL PROVISIONS. Deleted Material -
SECTIONS 405.010 THROUGH 405.040.

No changes required New Insertion - CLASS B
ARTICLE Nl

SECTION 405.050 DEFINITITIONS.
[R.O. 2009 §§ 17.02.010—17.02.720; Prior Codes §§ 10-102(1—6) (8—9) (11—14) (18—19) (21--26) (28) (30—31) (33-41)

{44—A45) (47—55) (57—58), 10-120; Ord. No. 4888 § 2, 2-3-1992; Ord. No. 5883 §§li—i, 7-2-2012]

Generally for the purpose of this regulation, certain terms and words are to be used and interprefed as
defined herein. Words used in the present tense shall include the future tense; words in the singular
number include the plural and words in the plural number include the singular except where the natural
construction of the writing indicates otherwise. The word "shall” is mandatory and not directory.

ACCESSORY BUILDING OR USE

A subordinate building or use customarily incidental to the main building or use of the lot. The
accessory building or use shall not house a separate business nor involve the conduct of a separate
business. Such accessory building shall not be constructed in the required front or side yard of the
principal structure. These same restrictions shall apply to communication satellite dishes.

AGRICULTURE

The use of land for agricultural purposes, including farming, dairying, pasturage, agriculture,
horticulture, floriculture, viticufture, animal and poultry husbandry and the necessary accessory uses for
packing, treating or storing of the produce; provided however, that the operation of any such accessory
uses shall be secondary to that of the normal agricultural activities. The operation of commercial feed
pens, salés yards, auction yards and agricultural marketing and processing establishments shall be
deemed an industrial and not an agricultural use.

ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGES

Beverages controlled by the Bureau of Alcohol, Tobacco and Firearms.

ALLEY

A minor right-of-way, dedicated to public use, which affords a secondary means of vehicular access to
the back or side of properties otherwise abutting a street and which may be used for public utility
purposes. Usually less than twenty (20} feet in width.



APARTMENT
See "FAMILY UNIT".

APARTMENT HOTEL

A building containing both family units and non-family units in which services customarily furnished in
hotels are available to the tenants.

APARTMENT HOUSE

See "DWELLING, MULTIPLE".
AUTOMOBILE REPAIR, MAJOR

General repair, rebuilding or reconditioning of engines, collision services inciuding, body, frame or
fender repair, vehicle painting or steam cleaning.

AUTOMOBILE REPAIR, MINOR

Incidental replacement of parts and motor service to passenger cars and trucks not exceeding onhe and
one-half (1%%) ton capacity.

AUTOMOBILE WRECKING OR SALVAGE YARD

An area where motor vehicles are disassembled, dismantled, junked or wrecked or where motor
vehicles not in operable condition or used parts of motor vehicles are stored.

BASEMENT

A story having part but not more than half of its height below grade. A basement is counted as a story
when the distance from finished grade to the finished surface of the floor above the basement is more
than six (6) feet for more than fitty percent (50%) of the total perimeter or more than twelve (12) feet at

any point.

BOARDING HOUSE

A dwelling, other than a hotel, where, for compensation and prearrangement for definite periods, meals
or lodging and meals are provided for three (3) or more, but not exceeding twelve (12) persons on a

weekly or monthliy basis.

BUILDABLE WIDTH OR DEPTH

The width or depth respectively of that part of the lot not included within the open spaces required in
this Title.



BUILDING

Any structure having a roof supported by columns, piers or walls, designed and intended for the
support, enclosure, shelter or protection of persons, animals or chattels. When a structure is divided
into separate parts by unpierced walls extending from the ground up, each part is deemed a separate

building.
BUILDING LINE

A line established by law or on a plat between which line and the street right-of-way, no portion of the
building may be erected: nor shall a building extend past, subject, however, to the further requirements
of the zoning ordinance of the City of Sikeston, Missouri.

COURT

An unoccupied space, open and uncovered at the top, wholly or partially enclosed by the walls of a
building or group of buildings. It may begin at the grade level or at the level of any floor of an adjacent

building which it serves.

COURT, INNER

A court entirely within a building or surrounded by walls or by walls and an interior lot line. It shall be not
less than two and one-half (2%) inches in width or length for each foot of its height and in no case shall

its least dimension be less than five (5) feet.

COURT, QUTER

A court with at least one (1) side open to a street, alley or yard. It shall be not less than two (2} inches
in width or length for each foot of its height and in no case shall its least dimension be less than five (5)

feet.

CURB, LEVEL

The mean level of the curb in front of the lot or in the case of a corner lot, along that abutting street
where the mean curb level is the highest.

DAY CARE

Care of a child away from hisfher own home for any part of the twenty-four (24) hour day, for
compensation or otherwise. Day care is a voluntary supptement to parent responsibility for the child's
protection, development and supervision. Day care may be given in a day care home or day care

center.

DAY CARE CENTER

A facility, other than the providef's permanent residence or separate from the provider's living quarters,
where care is provided for children for any part of the twenty-four (24) hour day. Licensed by and
operated accerding to the rules established by the Missouri Division of Family Services. Not a

valid home occupation.



DAY CARE HOME

A family home, occupied as a permanent residence by the day care provider, in which family-like care
is given to no more than ten (10) children, not related to the day care provider, for any part of the
twenty-four (24) hour day. Must be licensed by a