


1 

 

Council Letter 

 

 
 
 
Date of Meeting:  14-08-25 
  
Originating Department:  Administrative Services   

 

To the Mayor and City Council: 
 

Subject:  1st & 2nd Reading, Bill # 5965, Approval of 2014 Tax Rate 
 
Attachments: 

1. Ordinance 5965 
2. Notice of Public Hearing 
3. State Auditor’s Office-Assessed Valuation Summary 
4. State Auditor’s Office-Tax Rate Calculations  

 
Action Options: 

1. Approve Ordinance 5965 
2. Other action Council may deem appropriate 
 

Background: 
In accordance with RSMO 67.110, all political subdivisions must establish their 2014, 

property tax rates by September 1, after a public hearing.  After receiving assessed valuation 

data from both Scott and New Madrid Counties, the State Auditor’s Office calculates rates 

permitted in order to be in compliance with laws pertaining to revenue restrictions established 

by the Hancock Amendment and those subdivisions with voluntary reduction restrictions 

 

Due to the requirements of the State of Missouri, this is presented as an emergency 

bill which upon approval, shall be forwarded to both Counties and the State Auditor’s office for 

final approval. 

     

 
 
  
 

  
 

City of Sikeston 



BILL Number 5965 ORDINANCE Number 5965 
 
AN EMERGENCY BILL, WHICH UPON ADOPTION AND PASSAGE, SHALL BECOME 
ORDINANCE NUMBER 5965, AN ORDINANCE FIXING THE RATE OF TAXATION ON 
ALL TAXABLE PROPERTY IN THE CITY OF SIKESTON, MISSOURI, FOR THE 
FISCAL YEAR 2014-2015. 
 
WHEREAS, the Sikeston City Council held a public hearing in accordance with Section 
67.110 RSMO prior to the adoption of the City's 2014-2015 Tax Rate. 
 
NOW THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Sikeston, 
Missouri, as follows: 
 
Section I.  This ordinance will not be codified in the Municipal Code Book of the City of 
Sikeston. 
 
Section II.  That for the purpose of maintaining a general fund, there is hereby levied a 
tax rate of forty and two one-hundredth cents ($.4002) per one hundred dollars 
($100.00) of assessed valuation on all taxable property in the City of Sikeston, Missouri, 
for the year 2014-2015. 
 
Section III.  That for the purpose of maintaining a public library fund, there is hereby 
levied a tax rate of seventeen and forty four one-hundredth cents ($.1744) per one 
hundred dollars ($100.00) of assessed valuation on all taxable property in the City of 
Sikeston, Missouri, for the year 2014-2015. 
 
Section IV.  That for the purpose of maintaining public parks, there is hereby levied a 
tax rate of seventeen and forty four one-hundredth cents ($.1744) per one hundred 
dollars ($100.00) of assessed valuation on all taxable property in the City of Sikeston, 
Missouri, for the year 2014-2015. 
 
Section V.  General Repealer:  Any other ordinance or parts thereof inconsistent 
herewith, are hereby repealed. 
 
Section VI.  Severability:  Should any part or parts of this Ordinance be found or held to 
be invalid by any court of competent jurisdiction, the remaining part or parts shall be 
severable and shall continue in full force and effect. 
 
Section VII.  Emergency Clause:  Due to requirements of the State of Missouri, this 
ordinance will become effective upon its passage.  
 
Section VIII.  Record of Passage: 
 
A. Bill Number 5965 was introduced to Council and read the first time this 25th day of 

August 2014. 
 

B. Bill Number 5965 was read the second time this 25th day of August 2014, 
discussed and voted as follows: 

 
Burch             , Depro             , Gilmore                    ,  

Graham            , Harris             , Teachout             ,  

and Pullen                   , thereby being                    . 

 
C. Ordinance 5965 shall be in full force and effect from and after Monday, August 25, 

2014. 
 
 
 
                
       Jerry Pullen, Mayor 
 



BILL NUMBER 5965 PAGE 2 BILL NUMBER 5965 

 
 
        
Approved as to Form 
Charles Leible, City Counselor 
 
 
Seal/Attest: 
 
 
 
        
Carroll L. Couch, City Clerk 
 
 



















1 

Council Letter 

 

Council Letter:  14-08-25 
  

Originating Department:  Board of Municipal Utilities 
 
To the Mayor and City Council: 
 
Subject:   2nd Reading Emergency Bill #5964, Authorizing Increase in Board of Municipal Utilities 

Electrical Rates 
 
Attachment: 

1. Bill #5964 
2. Electrical Rates for Fall 2014 
3. Electrical Rate4s for Spring 2015 

 
Action Options: 

1.  Adopt Bill #5964, Authorizing Increase in Board of Municipal Utilities Electrical Rates 
 2.  Other action as Council may deem appropriate. 
 
Background: 

BMU is requesting approval from the City Council for an electric rate increase due to the 
Sikeston Electric System not meeting the required Debt Service Coverage for fiscal year end 2014, and 
the uncertain future of the wholesale power market.  Also, Fitch Rating Service has put Sikeston on a 
“negative outlook” basis, but retained currently the BBB+ rating.  BMU General Manager, Ed Throop, 
had previously informed the Sikeston City Council in 2012 that future rate increases would be necessary.  
This rate increase proposal is a part of what was proposed in 2012, including the time frame to 
implement such increase. 
 

The proposal we are presenting is a composite 14.3% increase to be applied in two steps.  The 
first increase of 7.1% is applied on September 1, 2014 and the remainder is applied on April 1, 2015. 
Based on average use, the increase will have the following impacts on residential customers: 
beginning October 1st, a $5.20/month increase;  and beginning May 1st, an additional $5.46/month 
increase.   
 
 Staff asks for council consideration and approval of this bill.  Because of the deadlines 
established by the Board of Municipal Utilities Board of Commissioners, this is being presented as an 
emergency bill which will become effective September 1, 2014. 

  

City of Sikeston 



BILL NUMBER 5964                            ORDINANCE NUMBER 5964 
 
A BILL, WHICH UPON ADOPTION AND PASSAGE SHALL BECOME EMERGENCY 
ORDINANCE NUMBER 5964 AUTHORIZING AND ESTABLISHING ELECTRICAL CHARGES 
AND RATES FOR THE CITY OF SIKESTON. 
 
WHEREAS, the Board of Municipal Utilities has determined that electrical rate increases are 
necessary and proper to maintain the economic viability of the municipal utility system, and 
 
WHEREAS, the City Council believes an increase in rates is in the overall best interest of the 
residents of Sikeston. 
 
NOW THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SIKESTON, 
MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS: 
 
SECTION I:   This ordinance shall not be codified in the City Municipal Code. 
 
SECTION II:   The electric rates to be charged by the Board of Municipal Utilities from and after   
September 1, 2014 shall be as set forth on Exhibit “A” which is attached hereto and 
incorporated by reference. 
 
SECTION III:   The Mayor and/or City Clerk are authorized to execute any and all documents 
necessary to implement said rate changes. 
 
SECTION IV:  This Ordinance is being considered as an emergency measure in order to comply 
with certain refinancing requirements of City of Sikeston revenue bonds. 
 
SECTION V:   General Repealer Section.   Any ordinance or parts thereof inconsistent herewith 
are hereby repealed. 
 
SECTION VI:   Severability.  Should any part or parts of this Ordinance be found or held to be 
invalid by any court of competent jurisdiction, then the remaining part or parts shall be severable 
and shall continue in full force and effect. 
 
SECTION VII.  Emergency Clause:  Due to the deadlines established by the Board of Municipal 
Utilities Board of Commissioners this bill will become effective September 1, 2014.  
 
SECTION IX:   Record of Passage: 
 
A.   Bill Number 5964 was introduced and read the first time this 4th day of August 2014. 
 
B.   Bill Number 5964 was read the second time and discussed on this 25th day of August 2014, 
and was voted as follows: 
 
  Pullen ________,   Harris ________,   Gilmore _______,   Teachout _______, 
 
   Graham ________,   Burch ________,   Depro ________, 
 

thereby being _________, and becoming Ordinance 5964. 
 
C.   Ordinance 5964 shall be in full force and effect from and after September 1, 2014. 
 
 
 
       ___________________________________    

JERRY PULLEN, Mayor 
Approved as to Form: 
 
 
 ____________________________________ 
CHARLES LEIBLE, City Counselor 
 
 
SEAL/ATTEST: 
 
 
 ____________________________________  
CARROLL COUCH, City Clerk 



































1 

 

Council Letter 

 

 
Date of Meeting:   14-08-25 
  
Originating Department:  Public Works Department 
 
To the Mayor and City Council:   
 
Subject:   2nd Reading and Consideration, Bill #5961, Authorization to amend Chapter 405 

Zoning Regulations of the City Code of the City of Sikeston, Missouri regarding the 
definition, permitted uses and conditional uses of manufactured housing units. 

  
Attachment(s): 

 
1. Bill #5961 
 
2. Proposed Changes to Sikeston City Code Chapter 405 Zoning Regulations 

 
Action Options:     
 
1. Conduct 2nd Reading and approve amendment of Chapter 405 Zoning Regulations of the 

City Code of Sikeston, Missouri regarding the definition, permitted uses and conditional 
uses of manufactured housing units 

 
2. Other action Council may deem appropriate 
 
Background:     
This is the request to amend Chapter 405 Zoning Regulations of the City Code of Sikeston, 
Missouri regarding the definition, permitted uses and conditional uses of manufactured housing 
units. Council read this the first time on August 4, 2014 and unless there are further questions 
from the Council or the public, staff recommends approval on the second reading at this time. 
 

 
 

 

City of Sikeston 



 - 1 - 

BILL Number 5961                                                   ORDINANCE Number 5961   
 
THIS BILL AS APPROVED SHALL BECOME ORDINANCE NUMBER 5961 AND SHALL AMEND 
CHAPTER 405 ZONING REGULATIONS OF THE CITY CODE OF THE CITY OF SIKESTON, 
MISSOURI TO DEFINE MANUFACTURED HOUSING UNITS, THEIR PERMITTED AND 
CONDITIONAL USES.   
 
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SIKESTON, MISSOURI AS FOLLOWS: 
 
SECTION I:   This Ordinance shall be codified in Chapter 405 Zoning Regulations of the Sikeston 
Municipal Code. 
 
SECTION II:  Chapter 405.050 Definitions shall be amended to read as follows: 
 

A. Delete definition of “House Trailer” in its entirety. 
 

B. Amend the definitions to read as follows: 
 

“MANUFACTURED HOME, CLASS A 

A transportable structure intended for permanent occupancy as a residential unit, fabricated in a 

factory in compliance with Federal Manufactured Home Construction and Safety Standards, 

adopted June 15, 1976, as amended. It must carry the HUD seal of approval and comply with 

minimum standards for tie-down systems published by the Missouri Public Service Commission, 

and being fifteen (15) years old or newer at time of permit application for placement or relocation 

of the manufactured home on an appropriately zoned lot, except as further provided for in this 

Chapter. 

MANUFACTURED HOME, CLASS B 

A transportable structure intended for permanent occupancy as a residential unit, that does not 

bear the HUD seal of approval or being 16 years or older at time of application. Said unit shall 

comply with minimum standards for tie-down systems published by the Missouri Public Service 

Commission.” 

 
SECTION III:  Division 1:  “R-1” and “R-2” Single Family Residential Districts, Section 405.450 Permitted 
Uses, paragraph A (1) and A (2) are amended to read as follows: 

 

“SECTION 405.450 PERMITTED USES.  

[R.O. 2009 § 17.12.020] 

 
A.  In Districts "R-1" and "R-2", no building or land shall be used and no building shall hereafter 

be erected, constructed, reconstructed or altered, except for one (1) or more of the following 

uses: 

1. In District "R-1" single-family dwellings, but not Class A or Class B manufactured homes.  

2. In District "R-2" single-family dwellings, including Class A manufactured homes, subject to 

the provisions and restrictions of Section 405.460 Conditional Uses of this Chapter.” 

SECTION IV:  Division 1:  “R-1” and “R-2” Single Family Residential Districts, Section 405.460 
Conditional Uses, is amended as follows: 
 

A.  Paragraph “A” is amended to read as follows: 
 

“SECTION 405.460 CONDITIONAL USES. 

 [R.O. 2009 § 17.12.030] 
 

A. The following uses may be permitted in District "R-1" (but not Class A or Class B 

manufactured homes), and District "R-2" after proper permit application for placement or 

relocation of the manufactured home on an appropriately zoned lot, review and approval 

pursuant to the provisions of this Section and Article V "Board of Adjustment" of this Chapter.” 

B. Item A (5) shall read as follows: 



 - 2 - 

5. In District "R-2", manufactured home class A units may be permitted as infill development 

or unit replacement only subject to these additional provisions and restrictions: 

a. The usable square footage of the manufactured home shall be at least equal to the 

average square footage of the conventionally built homes in the immediate area 

(three hundred (300) feet). 

b.  Roofs will be constructed using composition materials and will have a minimum pitch 

of the main roof of two and one-half (2½) foot rise for each twelve (12) feet of 

horizontal run and a minimum roof overhang of six (6) inches per side. 

c.  The width can be no less than thirty percent (30%) of the length. 

d.  Exterior siding or covering shall be of a type, quality and appearance customarily 

used on conventionally built homes. 

e. Have all wheels, axles, hitch and other mechanisms removed and placed on and 

anchored to a permanent and complete foundation that has been constructed of 

materials and in a manner approved by the building codes as currently adopted by 

the City and the Missouri Public Service Commission. 

f. Orientation of the manufactured housing unit on the lot will conform to the same 

orientation as the majority of conventionally built structures in the immediate area 

(three hundred (300) feet). 

Example: Front door to front lot line, rear door to rear lot line. 

g. An apron or perimeter enclosure of solid masonry construction or other suitable 

materials shall be installed in accordance with the building codes as currently adopted 

by the City. 

h. Any such structure so installed shall conform to the appropriate zoning and 

subdivision ordinances and any other pertinent ordinance in effect at the time of 

installation or construction. 

6.  Zero lot line construction as provided for in Chapter 405, Article VII, Division 15.” 

 

SECTION V:   Section 405.471 Foundation, Anchoring and Underpinning (Skirting) Requirements, is 

inserted into Division 1:  “R-1” and” R-2” Single-family Residential Districts: 

“SECTION 405.471 FOUNDATION, ANCHORING AND UNDERPINNING 

(SKIRTING) REQUIREMENTS 

[Ord. 5961 §V, 2014] 
 

A. All manufactured homes located within the City of Sikeston shall be set upon a permanent 

foundation properly designed and enclosed in accordance with the International Building Code.  

1. Manufactured homes shall be attached to a permanent footing, which manner of 

placement shall be as stated on the building permit, and meet all manufacturers’ 

specifications for support. 

a. Pier pads are not permitted. 

b. All footings shall have reinforced steel, as dictated by appropriate building 

code. 

c. A minimum of eighteen (18) inches of crawl space must be maintained under 

the entire manufactured unit.  

B. Manufactured home anchors shall be imbedded in the footing or foundation to HUD, 

Missouri Public Service Commission and manufacturer’s specifications. 

C. Within ninety (90) days of the manufactured home’s setup, underpinning shall be installed in 

such a way that all areas directly under the home are enclosed.  



 - 3 - 

1. Underpinning shall be similar in appearance to materials used for the siding of the 

manufactured home to which it is attached.  

2. Said underpinning/foundation shall have permanently installed venting in accordance 

with the manufacturer’s specifications. Deletions or omissions of vents are not allowed 

and homes will not be approved for occupancy without appropriate venting.” 

 
SECTION VI:  Division 2: “R-3” Single Family Residential Manufactured Home District, Section 405.480 
Purpose is amended to read as follows: 

 

“SECTION 405.480 PURPOSE. 

[R.O. 2009 § 17.14.010; Ord.5961 §V, 2014] 
 

A.  It is the purpose and intent of this Chapter to allow the placement of Class A manufactured 

homes within this district to increase the options available for low to moderate income 

households in select residential areas of the City. The placement of manufactured housing 

would be permitted subject to the requirements and procedures set forth herein. Single 

ownership of the lot and manufactured housing unit must be demonstrated before a building 

permit will be issued and in no case shall a manufactured home pad or lot be rented out in 

this district. No manufactured home class B units shall be located in or relocated to an “R-3” 

Single Family Residential Manufactured Home District.  

B. Any manufactured home class B unit located within an “R-3” Single Family Residential 

Manufactured Home District at the time of the adoption of this ordinance may remain until 

said manufactured home is moved or relocated from its original lot and/or pad.”  

 
SECTION VII:  Division 2: “R-3” Single Family Residential Manufactured Home District, Section 405.490 
Permitted Uses is amended to read as follows: 
 

 “SECTION 405.490 PERMITTED USES. 

[R.O. 2009 § 17.14.020; Ord. 5961 §VII, 2014] 

 
A. In District "R-3", no building, structure or premise shall hereafter be erected, constructed, 

reconstructed or altered, located, or re-located except for one (1) or more of the following 

uses: 

1. Any use permitted in Districts "R-1" or "R-2". 

2.  Class A Manufactured Home unit as defined by this regulation, and installed per 

regulations established by the City of Sikeston, and the Missouri Public Service 

Commission.”  

 

SECTION VIII:   Section 405.500 Conditional Uses is amended, as follows: 

“SECTION 405.500 CONDITIONAL USES. 

[R.O. 2009 § 17.14.030; Ord. 5961 §VIII, 2014] 

 
All conditional uses permitted in Districts "R-1" and "R-2" are also permitted in this district 

subject to the same provisions for application for placement or relocation of manufactured 

housing on appropriately zoned lots, review and approval, except that the provisions for zero lot 

line construction will not be permitted for the installation or construction of manufactured 

housing.” 

 

SECTION IX:   Section 405.511 Foundation, Anchoring and Underpinning (Skirting) Requirements, is 

inserted into Division 2:  “R-3” Single-family Residential Manufactured Home District: 

“SECTION 405.511 FOUNDATION, ANCHORING AND UNDERPINNING 

(SKIRTING) REQUIREMENTS 

[Ord. 5961 §IX, 2014] 
 



 - 4 - 

A. All manufactured homes located within the City of Sikeston shall be set upon a permanent 

foundation properly designed and enclosed in accordance with the International Building Code.  

1. Manufactured homes shall be attached to a permanent footing, which manner of 

placement shall be as stated on the building permit, and meet all manufacturers’ 

specifications for support. 

a. Pier pads are not permitted. 

b. All footings shall have reinforced steel, as dictated by appropriate building 

code. 

c. A minimum of eighteen (18) inches of crawl space must be maintained under 
the entire manufactured unit. 
  

B. Manufactured home anchors shall be imbedded in the footing or foundation to HUD, 

Missouri Public Service Commission and manufacturer’s specifications. 

C. Within ninety (90) days of the manufactured home’s setup, underpinning shall be installed in 

such a way that all areas directly under the home are enclosed.  

1. Underpinning shall be similar in appearance to materials used for the siding of the 

manufactured home to which it is attached.  

2. Said underpinning/foundation shall have permanently installed venting in accordance 

with the manufacturer’s specifications. Deletions or omissions of vents are not allowed 

and homes will not be approved for occupancy without appropriate venting.” 

 
SECTION X  Division 3:  “R-4” Two-Family Residential District, Section 405.540 Conditional Uses is 
amended to read as follows: 
 

“SECTION 405.540 CONDITIONAL USES.  

[R.O. 2009 § 17.16.030; Ord. 5961 §X, 2014] 

 
A.  The following uses may be permitted in District "R-4" after proper application for placement 

or relocation of manufactured housing on appropriately zoned lots, review and approval 

pursuant to the provisions of this Section and Article V "Board of Adjustment" of this Chapter: 

1. Any conditional use provided for in Districts "R-1" and "R-2" except that the provision for 

manufactured home class A units in District "R-2" shall be limited to the installation or 

construction of single-family dwellings as infill development or unit replacement only. 

2. Single-Family attached housing and zero lot line construction as provided for in Chapter  

  405, Article VII, Division 15. 

3. Boarding and lodging houses.” 

 

SECTION XI:   Section 405.551  Foundation, Anchoring and Underpinning (Skirting) Requirements, is 

inserted into Division 3:  “R-4” Two-Family Residential District: 

“SECTION 405.551 FOUNDATION, ANCHORING AND UNDERPINNING 

(SKIRTING) REQUIREMENTS 

[Ord. 5961 §XI, 2014] 
 

A. All manufactured homes located within the City of Sikeston shall be set upon a permanent 

foundation properly designed and enclosed in accordance with the International Building Code.  

1. Manufactured homes shall be attached to a permanent footing, which manner of 

placement shall be as stated on the building permit, and meet all manufacturers’ 

specifications for support. 

a. Pier pads are not permitted. 



 - 5 - 

b. All footings shall have reinforced steel, as dictated by appropriate building 

code. 

c. A minimum of eighteen (18) inches of crawl space must be maintained under 

the entire manufactured unit.  

B. Manufactured home anchors shall be imbedded in the footing or foundation to HUD, 

Missouri Public Service Commission and manufacturer’s specifications. 

C.  Within ninety (90) days of the manufactured home’s setup, underpinning shall be installed in 

such a way that all areas directly under the home are enclosed.  

1. Underpinning shall be similar in appearance to materials used for the siding of the 

manufactured home to which it is attached.  

2. Said underpinning/foundation shall have permanently installed venting in accordance 

with the manufacturer’s specifications. Deletions or omissions of vents are not allowed 

and homes will not be approved for occupancy without appropriate venting.” 

 
SECTION XII  Section 405.580 Conditional Uses is amended to read as follows: 
 

“SECTION 405.580 CONDITIONAL USES.  

[R.O. 2009 § 17.18.030; Ord. No. 5327 §III, 5-18-2000; Ord. 5961 §XII, 2014] 

 
A.  The following uses may be permitted in District "R-5" after proper application for placement 

or relocation of manufactured housing on appropriately zoned lots, review and approval 

pursuant to the provisions of this Section and Article V "Board of Adjustment" of this Chapter: 

1.  Any conditional use provided for in Districts "R-1", "R-2" and "R-4" except that the 

provisions for manufactured home class A units in District "R-2" shall be limited to the 

installation or construction of single-family dwellings as infill development or unit 

replacement only. 

2.  Single-family attached housing and zero lot line construction as provided for in 

Chapter 405, Article VII, and Division 15. 

3.  Office buildings.” 

 
SECTION XIII:  Section 405.591 is inserted into Division 4:  “R-5” Multiple-Family Residential District, as 
follows: 
 

“SECTION 405.591 FOUNDATION, ANCHORING AND UNDERPINNING 

(SKIRTING) REQUIREMENTS 

[Ord. 5961 §XIII, 2014] 
 

A. All manufactured homes located within the City of Sikeston shall be set upon a permanent 

foundation properly designed and enclosed in accordance with the International Building 

Code.  

1. Manufactured homes shall be attached to a permanent footing, which manner of 

placement shall be as stated on the building permit, and meet all manufacturers’ 

specifications for support. 

a. Pier pads are not permitted. 

b. All footings shall have reinforced steel, as dictated by appropriate building 

code. 

c. A minimum of eighteen (18) inches of crawl space must be maintained under 

the entire manufactured unit.  

B. Manufactured home anchors shall be imbedded in the footing or foundation to HUD, 

Missouri Public Service Commission and manufacturer’s specifications. 



 - 6 - 

C.  Within ninety (90) days of the manufactured home’s setup, underpinning shall be installed in 

such a way that all areas directly under the home are enclosed.  

1. Underpinning shall be similar in appearance to materials used for the siding of the 

manufactured home to which it is attached.  

2. Said underpinning/foundation shall have permanently installed venting in accordance 

with the manufacturer’s specifications. Deletions or omissions of vents are not allowed 

and homes will not be approved for occupancy without appropriate venting.” 

 
SECTION XIV:  Division 5:  “R-6” Planned Manufactured Housing District General Conditions, Plans and 
Approval, Section 405.610 Permitted Uses is amended to read as follows: 

 

“SECTION 405.610 PERMITTED USES. 

[R.O. 2009 § 17.20.020; Ord. 5961 §XIV, 2014] 
 

A.  In District "R-6", no manufactured home, building, land or premises shall be erected, 

constructed, reconstructed, located, relocated or altered except in conformance with the final 

development plan and one (1) or more of the following uses: 

1. Single-family, manufactured home class A units for residential purposes. 

2. Accessory buildings, clearly subordinate and incidental to the main buildings, any portion 

of which is not located in a required front yard or within five (5) feet of any other lot line. 

3.  Churches and synagogues. 

4. Customary home occupations, agricultural uses and signs subject to the restrictions 

detailed in Section 405.450 for their uses. 

5. Recreational uses for the exclusive use of the occupants of this district.” 

 
SECTION XV:  Division 5:  “R-6” Planned Manufactured Housing District General Conditions, Plans and 
Approval, Section 405.620 Conditional Uses is amended to read as follows: 
 

“SECTION 405.620: CONDITIONAL USES. 

[R.O. 2009 § 17.20.030’ Ord. 5961 §XV, 2014] 

A.  The following uses may be permitted in District "R-6" after proper application for placement 

or relocation of manufactured housing on appropriately zoned lots, review and approval 

pursuant to the provisions of this Section and Article V "Board of Adjustment" of this Chapter: 

1. Family day care homes subject to the provisions detailed in Section 405.450. 

2. Private lakes. 

3. Buildings and premises for public utility services or public service corporations, 

whose buildings or uses the Board deems reasonably necessary for public 

convenience or welfare.” 

 
SECTION XVI:  Division 5:  “R-6” Planned Manufactured Housing District General Conditions, Plans and 
Approval, Section 405.630 Height and Area Regulations is amended to read as follows: 
 

“SECTION 405.630 HEIGHT AND AREA REGULATIONS 

[R.O. 2009 § 17.20.040; Ord. 5961 §XVI, 2014] 

A. In District "R-6", any building, dwelling or portion thereof hereafter erected, constructed, 

reconstructed, altered, located or relocated shall be subject to the following regulation 

1. Minimum tract size and location. Not less than five (5) acres in area and under single 

ownership or unified control. Outer boundaries of the tract shall be not less than twenty-

five (25) feet from any public street and not less than fifteen (15) feet from all other 

property lines. 

2. Minimum lot area. Not less than four thousand (4,000) square feet. 



 - 7 - 

3. Minimum lot width. Not less than forty-five (45) feet at the building line. 

4. Minimum setback requirements.  

a. Front yard. Twenty (20) feet. 

b. Side yard. Five (5) feet. 

c. Rear yard. Ten (10) feet. 

5. Building height. In District "R-6", no building or manufactured housing unit shall 

hereafter be erected or structurally altered to exceed one (1) story or sixteen (16) feet 

in height. 

6. Off-street parking. There shall be two (2) off-street parking spaces provided for each 

lot. These spaces shall be constructed so as to be smooth, hard, dust-free and contain 

at least one hundred sixty (160) square feet each.” 

 
SECTION XVII:  Section 405.631 Foundation, Anchoring and Underpinning (Skirting) Requirements is 
inserted in Division 5:  “R-6” Planned Manufactured Housing District General Conditions, Plans and 
Approval, as follows: 
 

“SECTION 405.631 FOUNDATION, ANCHORING AND UNDERPINNING 

(SKIRTING) REQUIREMENTS 

[Ord. 5961 §XVII, 2014] 
 

A.  All manufactured homes located within the City of Sikeston shall be set upon a permanent 

foundation properly designed and enclosed in accordance with the International Building Code.  

1. Manufactured homes shall be attached to a permanent footing, which manner of 

placement shall be as stated on the building permit, and meet all manufacturers’ 

specifications for support. 

  a.   Pier pads are not permitted. 

b. All footings shall have reinforced steel, as dictated by appropriate building 

code. 

c. A minimum of eighteen (18) inches of crawl space must be maintained under 

the entire manufactured unit.  

B. Manufactured home anchors shall be imbedded in the footing or foundation to HUD, Missouri 

Public Service Commission and manufacturer’s specifications. 

C.  Within ninety (90) days of the manufactured home’s setup, underpinning shall be installed in 

such a way that all areas directly under the home are enclosed.  

1. Underpinning shall be similar in appearance to materials used for the siding of the 

manufactured home to which it is attached.  

2. Said underpinning/foundation shall have permanently installed venting in 

accordance with the manufacturer’s specifications. Deletions or omissions of vents are 

not allowed and homes will not be approved for occupancy without appropriate venting.” 

 
SECTION XVIII:  Division 8: Transitional District, Section 405.740 Permitted Uses is amended to read 
as follows: 

 

“SECTION 405.740 PERMITTED USES.  
[R.O. 2009 § 17.24.020; Ord. 5961 §XVIII, 2014] 

A.  In District "TZ", no building or land shall be used, and no building shall hereafter be erected, 

constructed, reconstructed or altered except for one (1) or more of the following uses as 

reflected in the Transitional District "TZ" Table of Uses set out in Subsection (B) of this 

Section. 



 - 8 - 

B.   Any downtown district, as may be designated by ordinance of the Sikeston City Council and 

located in whole or in part within a Transitional District "TZ", shall be subject to additional 

use restrictions as set forth in the Transitional District "TZ" Table of Uses below and shall be 

designated on City Zoning Maps as “TZ DT.”  

 

(Transitional District “TZ” Table of Permitted Uses on following page) 

P— Permitted as a matter of right            

CU— May be permitted by the Board of Adjustment  

(a) This does not include businesses that prepare food or food items for take out or on-premises consumption or provides 
for the sale or consumption of alcoholic beverages.”  

SECTION XIX:  Division 8: Transitional District, Section 405.750 Conditional Uses is amended to read 
as follows: 
 

“Transitional District "TZ" Table Of Permitted Uses 

Category/Use  "TZ" Transitional  

"DT" Downtown 

District  

Executive, administrative and 
professional offices  

P  P  

Medical offices, including clinics and 
medical laboratories  

P  P  

Facilities for human care, such as 
convalescent and nursing home  

P  P  

Cosmetics and toiletries 
(compounding only)  

P  P  

Libraries and government office 
buildings and public utility offices, but 
not storage yards or post offices  

P  P  

Private social or fraternal clubs or 
lodges that do not provide for the sale 
or consumption of alcoholic 
beverages  

P  P  

Churches and related facilities  P  P  

Nursery schools and day care 
facilities  

P  P  

Photographic and interior decorating 
studios  

P  P  

Funeral homes  P  P  

Establishments that perform personal 
services on the premises, such as 
beauty parlors and barbershops  

P  P  

Facilities for private lessons in art, 
music and dance  

P  P  

Accessory buildings or uses 
customarily incidental to any of the 
above permitted uses  

P  P  

Bed and breakfast homes and bed 
and breakfast inns as defined in City 
Code Section 405.860  

P  P  

Uses not listed above, but have 
similar characteristics  

CU  P  

Small, low volume retail sale facilities (a)  
such as:  

 Book stores  CU  P  

 Antique stores  CU  P  

 Dress shops  CU  P  

Manufactured Home Class A Units, 
single-family  

CU   

Veterinary clinics and hospitals, 
provided all activities are conducted 
within a totally and permanently 
enclosed building  

CU   



 - 9 - 

“SECTION 405.750 CONDITIONAL USES.  

[R.O. 2009 § 17.24.030; Ord. 5961 §XIX, 2014)] 

A. The following uses may be permitted in District "TZ" after proper application, review and 

approval pursuant to the provisions of this Section and Article V "Board of Adjustment" of this 

Chapter. 

1. Uses not listed above, but have similar characteristics. 

2.   Small, low volume retail sale facilities such as bookstores, antique stores or dress 

shops. This does not include businesses that prepare food or food items for take out 

or on-premises consumption or provides for the sale or consumption of alcoholic 

beverages. 

3.  Manufactured home class A units, single-family. 

4.  Veterinary clinics and hospitals provided all activities are conducted within a totally 

and permanently enclosed building.” 

 
SECTION XX:  Division 11: “C-1”, “C-2” and “C-3” Commercial Districts, Section 405.920 Tables – Use, 
Height and Area Regulations, Table 1. Permitted Uses, footnote (a) is amended to read as follows:  
 

 “SECTION 405.920 TABLES – USE, HEIGHT AND AREA REGULATIONS 

  
 

 
 

SECTION XXI: General Repealer Section:  Any ordinance or parts thereof inconsistent herewith are 
hereby repealed. 
 
SECTION XXII:  Severability:  Should any part or parts of this ordinance be found or held to be invalid by 
any court of competent jurisdiction, then the remaining part or parts shall be severable and shall 
continue in full force and effect. 
 
SECTION XXIII:  Record of Passage: 
 
A. Bill Number 5961 was introduced and read the first time this 4th day of August 2014. 
 
B. Bill Number 5961 was read the second time and discussed this 25th day of August, 2014, 

and voted as follows: 
 

 
Burch   , Depro      , Gilmore   , Harris      , Graham _________, 

Teachout        , and Pullen       , thereby being ___________, 

and becoming Ordinance 5961. 

 
C. Ordinance 5961shall be in full force and effect from and after September 24, 2014. 
  

 
 
       
Jerry Pullen, Mayor 
 

 
 
       

Approved as to form    
 Charles Leible, City Counselor  
  
       Seal / Attest: 
 
              

   Carroll Couch, City Clerk  

“(a) Include all uses listed as permitted or conditional use in a residential district, except the 
provision for Class A manufactured housing shall remain in a conditional use.” 









































































































1 

 

Council Letter 

 

 
Date of Meeting:   14-08-25 
  
Originating Department:  General Government 
 
To the Mayor and City Council:   
 
Subject:  Consideration of Resolution 14-08-01, Authorizing a Preliminary Funding Agreement with 

Sikeston Development Co., LLC in Connection with a Proposed Tax Increment Finance (TIF) 
Project 

 

Attachment(s): 
1. Resolution 14-08-01 
2. Exhibit A - Preliminary Funding Agreement 

 
Action Options:     
1. Adopt Resolution 14-08-01 
2. Other action Council may deem appropriate 
 
Background:     
In early August Council was approached by representatives of Sikeston Development Co., LLC 
regarding a proposed TIF project in an area north of US 60 and west of the Sikeston Walmart, 
consisting of approximately 180 acres.  In order to move forward with the required studies to 
determine the feasibility of the project, Council must adopt Resolution 14-08-01. 
  
Adoption of Resolution 14-08-01 authorizes the Mayor to execute the Preliminary Funding 
Agreement; the City Clerk to deposit funds from Sikeston Development Co., LLC into a special 
escrow account; the City Manager to prepare and distribute a request for proposal for the 
proposed redevelopment area; and for the City Clerk to convene the City’s Tax Increment 
Financing Commission for New Madrid County.  

 
 

 

City of Sikeston 



RESOLUTION NO. 14-08-01 

 

 

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING A PRELIMINARY FUNDING 

AGREEMENT WITH SIKESTON DEVELOPMENT CO., LLC IN 

CONNECTION WITH A PROPOSED TAX INCREMENT 

FINANCING PROJECT; AUTHORIZING THE DISTRIBUTION 

OF A REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS ASSOCIATED WITH THE 

PROPOSED TAX INCREMENT FINANCING PROJECT; AND 

AUTHORIZING CERTAIN ACTIONS CONNECTED 

THEREWITH.   

 

 WHEREAS, Sikeston Development Co., LLC (the “Company”) desires to redevelop certain 

parcels generally located north of Highway 60 and west of the existing Wal-Mart Supercenter (the 

“Proposed Redevelopment Area”); and 

 

 WHEREAS, the Company has requested that the City explore the feasibility of financing a 

portion of the costs of redeveloping the Proposed Redevelopment Area through the use of tax increment 

financing and/or other economic development programs; and 

 

 WHEREAS, the Company has indicated a willingness to provide funds to defray the expenses 

expected to be incurred by the City in connection with the Company’s request, it being understood that 

the City is not obligated to approve tax increment financing or any other economic development incentive 

for the proposed project; and 

 

 WHEREAS, the City wishes to distribute requests for proposals for the Proposed Redevelopment 

Area in accordance with applicable City ordinances and the Real Property Tax Increment Allocation 

Redevelopment Act, Sections 99.800 to 99.865, RSMo. 

 

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

SIKESTON, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS: 

 

Section I.  Approval of Preliminary Funding Agreement.   

 

A.  The Mayor is hereby authorized and directed to enter into a Preliminary Funding Agreement 

(the “Agreement”) with the Company, said Agreement to be in substantially the form 

attached hereto as Exhibit A, for the purpose of establishing the Company’s obligation to 

fund certain costs anticipated to be incurred by the City in further considering the Company’s 

request relating to the redevelopment of the Proposed Redevelopment Area.  

  

B. The City Clerk is hereby authorized and directed to deposit any and all funds received 

pursuant to the Agreement into a special escrow account and to disburse such funds in 

accordance with the Agreement for such expenses as may be reasonably incurred and 

necessary for consideration of the adoption of tax increment financing and/or other economic 

development incentives. 

  

Section II.   Request for Proposals. The City Manager is hereby directed to prepare or cause to be 

prepared and distributed a request for proposals for the Proposed Redevelopment Area (the “RFP”) in 

accordance with Section 130.1070 of the Municipal Code.  The City Manager is hereby authorized, on 

behalf of the City, to determine the parties to whom the RFP shall be mailed. 

 

Section III.  Notice to Taxing Districts.  The City Clerk is hereby directed to provide notice to other 

taxing districts of the City’s desire to convene the Tax Increment Financing Commission of the City of 

Sikeston, Missouri, for the purpose of considering a redevelopment plan and redevelopment project. 

 

Section IV.  Severability.  The sections of this Resolution shall be severable.  If any section of this 

Resolution is found by a court of competent jurisdiction to be invalid, the remaining sections shall remain 

valid, unless the court finds that the valid sections are so essential to and inseparably connected with and 

dependent upon the void section that it cannot be presumed that the City Council has or would have 

enacted the valid sections without the void ones, unless the court finds that the valid sections, standing 

alone, are incomplete and are incapable of being executed in accordance with the legislative intent. 

 

Section V.  Record of Passage: 

 

 Read this 25
th
 day of August 2014, discussed and voted as follows: 

 

Gilmore , Burch  , Depro  ,  

 



- 2 - 

Teachout , Harris  , Graham ,  and Pullen  , 

 

Thereby being   .   

 

 

      _____________________________________________ 

      Jerry Pullen, Mayor 

 

 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

 

 

________________________________ 

Charles Leible, City Counselor 

 

 

Attest/Seal       

 

 

________________________________ 

Carroll L. Couch, City Clerk 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



- 3 - 

EXHIBIT A 

 

PRELIMINARY FUNDING AGREEMENT 

 

 
THIS PRELIMINARY FUNDING AGREEMENT (the “Agreement”) is made and entered 

into as of the _____ day of August, 2014, by and between the CITY OF SIKESTON, MISSOURI 
(the “City”) and SIKESTON DEVELOPMENT CO., LLC (the “Developer”). 
 

RECITALS 
 
 1. The Developer has advised the City of its desire to redevelop an area within the 
City generally located north of Highway 60 and west of the existing Wal-Mart Supercenter (the 
“Proposed Redevelopment Area”) by the potential use of economic development incentives. 

 2. The City is willing to explore the feasibility of financing a portion of the costs of 
redeveloping the Proposed Redevelopment Area through the use of economic development 
incentives, if the Developer advances funds to pay the City’s costs of exploring such incentives. 
 

NOW THEREFORE, in consideration of the foregoing and other good and valuable 
consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which are hereby acknowledged, the parties hereby 
agree as follows: 
 

1. Advance of Funds. 
 
(a) The Developer shall advance the City the sum of $75,000 upon execution of this 

Agreement (the “Preliminary Funds”).  The City shall use the Preliminary Funds to pay or 
reimburse the City for payment of actual out-of-pocket expenses incurred by the City and for the 
payment of actual costs incurred by the City for such consultants and advisors (including, but 
not limited to, attorneys, planners and financial consultants) as the City deems advisable from 
time to time, and for administrative costs and expenses, associated with the implementation of 
economic development incentives for the Developer’s proposed project, including preparation of 
a redevelopment plan, blight analysis and cost-benefit analysis and the negotiation of a 
redevelopment agreement (collectively, the “Work Program”).  The Work Program shall be 
performed by the consultants and attorneys selected by the City at their respective regular 
hourly rates and fees (the “Fees”) and the City shall pay for such work only in accordance with 
paragraph 2 below. 

 
(b) If the parties enter into a Redevelopment Agreement, the Redevelopment 

Agreement shall provide for the disbursement of any remaining Preliminary Funds in the 
manner specified in the Redevelopment Agreement. 

 
2. Disbursement.  Subject to the remaining provisions of this Agreement, the City 

shall disburse Preliminary Funds on a monthly basis for any month in which Fees and expenses 
are actually incurred or to reimburse the City for Fees and expenses previously paid by the City 
in connection with the redevelopment project upon receipt of: (a) invoices for work reasonably 
and actually performed by the selected consultants and attorneys in accordance with the Work 
Program and for administrative costs and expenses incurred by the City relating to the Work 
Program; (b) invoices and/or receipts for out-of-pocket expenses incurred by such parties in 
connection with such work; and (c) such other supporting documentation as may be requested 
by the City (collectively, a “Disbursement Request”).  A Disbursement Request by the City for 
reimbursement shall include an itemization of the Fees and expenses to be paid by the City and 
copies of the consultant’s invoices for the work performed, provided, however, that invoice 
entries that could compromise attorney-client privilege or confidentiality or other privileged 
information or communication may be redacted therefrom.  The City Manager shall use 
reasonable care in ascertaining that all amounts charged to the City pursuant to each 
Disbursement Request are fair and reasonable amounts for the work represented on each 
Disbursement Request. 

 
3. Copies of Disbursement Requests.  The City Clerk shall promptly forward a 

copy of each Disbursement Request to the Developer.  If the Developer has questions 
regarding any Disbursement Request, the Developer shall promptly direct such questions in 
writing to the City Manager.  If the Developer provides timely written questions regarding a 
Disbursement Request, the City and the Developer shall in good faith attempt to resolve any 
questions so raised as soon as reasonably possible, and to the extent necessary, communicate 
or negotiate with the appropriate third party submitting the payment request in order to do so.  If 
the parties nonetheless are unable to reach agreement upon the Disbursement Request within 
a reasonable time, the City Manager may proceed to pay the Disbursement Request. 



- 4 - 

 
4. Consideration of Incentives.  Nothing herein shall obligate the City to approve 

tax increment financing or any other incentives for the Developer’s proposed project.  
 
5. Developer’s Right of Termination.  The Developer may terminate this 

Agreement at any time in its sole discretion upon giving the City 10 days’ written notice; 
whereupon 10 days following the Developer’s delivery of said notice this Agreement shall be 
deemed terminated.  Upon receipt of such notice, the City shall cease incurring expenditures 
under this Agreement as soon as reasonably possible.  The City shall pay to the Developer, 
within 60 days after the Developer delivers notice of its termination under this Section, all 
Preliminary Funds remaining after the City’s payment of any Disbursement Requests submitted 
pursuant to this Agreement for work performed through the date of termination. 
 

6. City’s Right of Termination.  The City may terminate this Agreement upon 
giving the Developer 10 days’ written notice if (a) a redevelopment agreement is not executed 
within a reasonable time (as determined by the City in its reasonable discretion), or (b) all of the 
initial Preliminary Funds advanced hereunder have been spent and the Developer does not 
provide additional Preliminary Funds to the City.  Upon giving such notice under this Section, 
the City shall cease incurring expenditures under this Agreement.  The City shall pay to the 
Developer, within 60 days after the City delivers notice of its termination of this Agreement 
under this Section, all Preliminary Funds remaining after the City’s payment of any 
Disbursement Requests submitted pursuant to this Agreement for work through the date of 
termination. 
 

7. No Third Party Beneficiaries.  This Agreement constitutes a contract solely 
between the City and Developer.  No third party has any beneficial interest in or derived from 
this Agreement. 

 
8. Notices.  All notices and correspondence hereunder shall be in writing and shall 

be delivered by hand delivery, email, or first class mail, postage prepaid, to the parties as set 
forth below: 
 

If to the City: 
 

City of Sikeston 
105 East Center Street 
Sikeston, Missouri  63801 
Attention:  City Manager 
Email: jdouglass@sikeston.org 

 
If to Developer: 

 
Sikeston Development Co., LLC 
 
 
 

or to such other address with respect to either party as that party may, from time to time, 
designate in writing and forward to the other as provided in this paragraph. 

 
9. Miscellaneous. 

 
a. Severability.  If any provision of this Agreement is unenforceable, the remainder 

of this Agreement shall be enforced as if such provision were not contained herein. 
 

b. No Waiver.  Failure of any party hereto to enforce its rights hereunder at any 
time shall not be deemed a waiver of any such rights. 
 

c. Representations and Warranties.  The Developer and the City each represent 
that (i) this Agreement has been duly executed by them or on their behalf, as the case may be, 
pursuant to due authorization, and is not in violation of any such party’s governing documents, 
charter or ordinances, as the case may be, (ii) no consents are necessary for the execution, 
delivery, and performance of this Agreement by such party, and (iii) this Agreement is valid, 
binding and enforceable against such party in accordance with its terms. 

 
 d. Assignment.  This Agreement may not be assigned by either party without the 
written consent of the other. 

 



- 5 - 

e. Survival.  Notwithstanding the expiration or termination or breach of this 
Agreement by either party, the City’s obligations with respect to repayment of unexpended 
Preliminary Funds and copies of Disbursement Requests shall survive expiration, termination or 
breach of this Agreement by either party. 
 

10. Limitation of Liability.  Notwithstanding any provision hereof to the contrary, the 
City and its officials, agents, employees and representatives shall not be liable to the Developer 
for damages or otherwise if this Agreement is declared invalid or unconstitutional in whole or in 
part by the final (as to which all rights of appeal have expired or have been exhausted) 
judgment of any court of competent jurisdiction, and by reason thereof either the City is 
prevented from performing any of the covenants and agreements herein or the Developer is 
prevented from enjoying the rights and privileges contemplated hereunder. 
 
 

[Remainder of page intentionally left blank.]



- 6 - 

 
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused this Preliminary Funding 

Agreement to be duly executed as of the date first above written. 
 
 

CITY OF SIKESTON, MISSOURI 
 
 
 

By:  _______________________________ 
Mayor 

 
 
       SIKESTON DEVELOPMENT CO., LLC 
 
 
 

By:  _______________________________ 
 Manager 

 
 
 



1 

 

Council Letter 

 

 
Date of Meeting:   14-08-25 
  
Originating Department:  General Government 
 
To the Mayor and City Council:   
 
Subject:    Consideration of Resolution 14-08-02, Authorizing the City to engage the firms of Gilmore and 

Bell, P.C. as special legal counsel, and Peckham Guyton Alberts & Viets, Inc. (PGAV) as 
planning consultant in connection with a proposed tax increment financing project. 

 

Attachment(s): 
1. Resolution 14-08-02 
2. Gilmore & Bell, P.C. Letter of Engagement 
3. PGAV Agreement for Technical Services 
4. Tax Increment Financing Approval Schedule 

 
Action Options:     
1. Adopt Resolution 14-08-02 
2. Other action Council may deem appropriate 
 
Background:     
Resolution 14-08-02 authorizes the Mayor to execute the attached Gilmore and Bell, P.C. Letter 
of Engagement  for services as special legal counsel, and the Agreement for Technical Services 
with PGAV to perform studies and analysis required of proposed TIF projects. 

 
 

 

City of Sikeston 



RESOLUTION NO. 14-08-02 

 

 

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE CITY OF SIKESTON, 

MISSOURI TO ENGAGE GILMORE & BELL, P.C., AS SPECIAL 

LEGAL COUNSEL, AND PECKHAM GUYTON ALBERS & 

VIETS, INC., AS PLANNING CONSULTANT, IN CONNECTION 

WITH A PROPOSED TAX INCREMENT FINANCING 

PROJECT. 

 

WHEREAS, the Real Property Tax Increment Allocation Redevelopment Act, Sections 99.800 

to 99.865 of the Revised Statutes of Missouri, as amended (the “TIF Act”), authorizes municipalities to 

undertake redevelopment projects in blighted, conservation or economic development areas, as defined in 

the TIF Act; and 

 

 WHEREAS, the City desires to engage Gilmore & Bell, P.C. as special legal counsel in 

connection with a proposed redevelopment project located north of Highway 60 and west of the existing 

Wal-Mart Supercenter (the “Redevelopment Project”); and 

 

 WHEREAS, the City desires to engage Peckham Guyton Albers & Viets, Inc. (“PGAV 

Planners”) as planning consultant in connection with the Redevelopment Project;  

 

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

SIKESTON, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS: 

 

Section I.  The City hereby engages Gilmore & Bell, P.C. to serve as the City’s special legal counsel in 

accordance with the terms of the engagement letter attached hereto as Exhibit A, which the Mayor is 

authorized to sign on behalf of the City. 

 

Section II.  The City hereby engages PGAV Planners to serve as the City’s planning consultant in 

accordance with the terms of the Agreement for Technical Services attached hereto as Exhibit B, which 

the Mayor is authorized to sign on behalf of the City and the City Clerk is authorized to attest thereto. 

 

Section III.  Record of Passage: 

 

 Read this 25
th
 day of August 2014, discussed and voted upon as follows: 

 

 

Gilmore , Burch  , Depro  ,  

 

Teachout , Harris  , Graham ,  and Pullen,   

 

Thereby being   .  

 

 

      _____________________________________________ 

      Jerry Pullen, Mayor 

 

 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

 

 

________________________________ 

Charles Leible, City Counselor 

 

 

Attest/Seal       

 

 

________________________________ 

Carroll L. Couch, City Clerk 

 

 

 
 



314-436-1000 
FAX:  314-436-1166  

WWW.GILMOREBELL.COM 
 

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION 
ATTORNEYS AT LAW 

ONE METROPOLITAN SQUARE 
211 NORTH BROADWAY, SUITE 2350 

ST. LOUIS, MISSOURI  63102-2733 

 

 
KANSAS CITY, MISSOURI 

WICHITA, KANSAS  
LINCOLN, NEBRASKA 
OMAHA, NEBRASKA 

 
 
 

August 21, 2014 
 
 
Mr. Jonathan Douglass 
City Manager 
City of Sikeston 
105 E. Center Street 
Sikeston, Missouri  63801 
 

Re: Engagement Letter for Special Counsel Services for the City of Sikeston, Missouri 
 
Dear J.D.: 
 

This will confirm our engagement to serve as special counsel to the City of Sikeston in 
connection with the consideration of economic development incentives in Sikeston. The purpose of this 
letter is to set forth our responsibilities and fees with respect to the proposed engagement.  

 
SCOPE OF SERVICES 

 
Gilmore & Bell will provide the following services, if directed by the City: 

 
1. Prepare or assist in the preparation of requests for proposals from potential developers, 

and advise the City regarding compliance with legal requirements pertaining to the 
bidding process.  Assist in analyzing proposals for predevelopment proposals to the 
extent requested by the City. 

 
2. Review and comment on redevelopment plans, existing conditions studies, tax impact 

studies and other documents not prepared by Gilmore & Bell. 
 
3. Prepare or review all legal proceedings relating to the approval of redevelopment plans. 
 
4. Prepare or review documents relating to the creation of transportation development 

districts and/or community improvement districts. 
 

5. Assist the City in negotiating and drafting redevelopment agreements and related 
documents between the City and developers or property owners. 

 
6. Prepare applicable resolutions and ordinances, public notices to local taxing bodies, and 

other documents as may be requested by the City. 
 



Mr. Jonathan Douglass 
August 21, 2014 
Page 2 
 
 

  

7. Advise the City on all legal matters incident to the approval of any economic 
development incentives. 

 
8. Attend such conferences and meetings as may be requested by the City in connection 

with the above services. 
 
 

ATTORNEY-CLIENT RELATIONSHIP 
 
 Upon execution of this engagement letter, the City will be our client and an attorney-client 
relationship will exist between us.  We assume that all other parties to any transaction will retain such 
counsel as they deem necessary and appropriate to represent their interests in any transaction.  We further 
assume that all other parties understand that in this transaction we represent only the City and we are not 
acting as an intermediary among the parties.  Our services are limited to those contracted for herein.  Our 
representation of the City will not affect, however, our responsibility to render objective legal opinions as 
required by the City. 
 
 

FEES AND EXPENSES 
 

Our fees associated with the Special Counsel services pursuant to this engagement will be 
$295/hour for the remainder of 2014, and such rate as may be determined by Gilmore & Bell thereafter 
but in any event no more than 105% of the hourly rate charged in the prior year. 

 
In addition, we will seek reimbursement for our out-of-pocket expenses incurred in connection 

with the provision of our services, such as travel, postage, deliveries, photocopying, printing and similar 
expenses.   
 

We will submit invoices for payment of costs incurred on a monthly basis or at such other time as 
may be agreed to by the City and Gilmore & Bell.   

 
 

RECORDS 
 
 At your request, papers and property furnished by you will be returned promptly upon receipt of 
payment for outstanding fees and client charges.  Our own files, including lawyer work product, 
pertaining to the transaction will be retained by us.  For various reasons, including the minimization of 
unnecessary storage expenses, we reserve the right to dispose of any documents or other materials 
retained by us after the termination of the engagement. 

 
 

CONFLICTS 
 
 As you are aware, our firm represents many political subdivisions, underwriters and others.  It is 
possible that during the time that we are representing the City, one or more of our present or future clients 
will have transactions with the City. We do not believe any such representation will adversely affect our 
ability to represent the City as provided in this letter, either because such matters will be sufficiently 
different from the scope of services described above so as to make such representation not adverse to our 



Mr. Jonathan Douglass 
August 21, 2014 
Page 3 
 
 

  

representation of the City, or because the potential for such adversity is remote or minor and outweighed 
by the consideration that it is unlikely that advice given to the other client will be relevant to any aspect of 
the scope of services described above.  Execution of this letter will signify the City’s consent to our 
representation of others consistent with the circumstances described in this paragraph.   

 
 

CONCLUSION 
 
 If the foregoing terms are acceptable to you, please so indicate by returning a signed copy of this 
engagement letter.  We look forward to working with you. 
 

Very truly yours, 
 

 
 
Mark D. Grimm 

 
MDG:jcg 
 
 
ACCEPTED AND APPROVED: 
 
Date:        CITY OF SIKESTON, MISSOURI 
 
 
 

By:       
 Jerry Pullen, Mayor  

 
 
 



Sikeston 60 West TIF Agreement 
08/14/2014 Page 1 of 9 

AGREEMENT FOR TECHNICAL SERVICES 
 

BETWEEN THE CITY OF SIKESTON, MISSOURI AND 
 

PECKHAM GUYTON ALBERS & VIETS, INC. 
 
 

THIS AGREEMENT, is entered into on the date and by execution shown hereafter, by and between the 
City of Sikeston, Missouri (hereinafter referred to as the “City”) and Peckham Guyton Albers & Viets, 
Inc., (hereinafter referred to as "PGAV"). 
 
WITNESSETH: 
 
Whereas, the City is seeking to determine potential development and/or redevelopment of certain 
properties within the City to generally include the area identified on Exhibit A of this Agreement 
hereinafter referred to as the “Study Area”; and 
 
Whereas, the City is considering implementing a Tax Increment Financing Redevelopment Area for the 
Study Area under the provisions of the Real Property Tax Increment Allocation Redevelopment Act (the 
TIF Act - R.S. MO Sections 99.800 to 99.865); and 
 
Whereas, other applicable statutes such as the Community Improvement District Act and/or 
Transportation Development District Act may also be considered as part of the redevelopment program 
for the Study Area; and 
 
Whereas, the City is intending PGAV to assist in the preparation and implementation of the TIF 
Redevelopment Plan and to conduct other planning analyses and studies as may be necessary to assist or 
induce the development of the Study Area; and 
 
Whereas, PGAV is duly experienced in providing said services, 
 
Now, therefore the parties hereto do mutually agree as follows: 
 
I. SCOPE OF SERVICES 

 
 PGAV will provide the services as outlined in Exhibit B of this Agreement. 
 
II. INFORMATION TO BE PROVIDED BY CITY 

 
PGAV’s proposed scope of work as outlined in Exhibit B assumes certain information and access 
to staff will be provided as follows: 
 
1. Data and/or contact persons representing the selected developer who may provide infor-

mation regarding proposed plans or projects that are contemplated in the Study Area; 
 

2. Such Geographic Information Systems (“GIS”) mapping information PGAV requires in order 
to create map exhibits for the Redevelopment Plan including, but not necessarily limited to, 



Sikeston 60 West TIF Agreement 
08/14/2014 Page 2 of 9 

parcel boundaries, road centerlines, City boundary, infrastructure, floodplain, water features, 
etc. 

 
3. Data which the City has or which may be readily acquired without extensive research which 

may assist in the establishment of blighting conditions in the Study Area, including infor-
mation regarding, but not necessarily limited to, code violations, crime data, fire data, and 
infrastructure problems; 

 
4. Data provided by a recognized financial advisor, bond underwriter, or other sources that can 

be used to fulfill the statutory requirement regarding evidence of commitment to finance 
Redevelopment Plan and Project costs; 
 

5. Compilation of the sales taxes collected within the proposed Study Area for the preceding 
calendar year (subject to PGAV entering into an appropriate confidentiality agreement re-
garding disclosure of such data as required by State law); 

 
6. A written boundary description for the area selected as the final boundary of the Redevelop-

ment Area prepared by a Land Surveyor registered in the State of Missouri (Note that PGAV 
may acquire this information via subcontract with an engineering firm of the City’s choice 
or chosen by PGAV which would be treated as a reimbursable cost under this Agreement 
or alternatively the developer may provide this information); 

 
7. The services of the City Attorney (and Special Counsel/Bond Counsel, if any) for review of the 

draft redevelopment plan and cost benefit analysis prepared by PGAV required by the TIF Act 
and for counsel, review and assistance in establishing and monitoring a project schedule, in-
cluding verification of compliance with the TIF Act of the timing and performance by City 
staff of published notices and certified mailings.  Review comments on materials submitted 
by PGAV to these parties for review shall occur within 5 business days of receipt by the City 
Attorney or Special Bond Counsel; and 
 

8. In addition, the City will provide the following items necessary for notification compliance for 
implementation of the Redevelopment Plan: 

 
a. Printing and mailing of the taxing district notification letters; 

b. Actual placement of newspaper public notices (including associated costs); and 

c. Printing and mailing of the notices to the person in whose name taxes were paid. 

III. TIMING OF PERFORMANCE 
 

The work on all tasks as provided for herein will begin upon execution of this Agreement (which shall 
constitute “notice to proceed” unless otherwise provided in written or electronic form by the City) and 
will be conducted based on a mutually agreed upon schedule developed by PGAV and the City. This 
schedule will be dictated by the timing of various factors including, but not necessarily limited to, the 
receipt of proposals from prospective developers, meeting dates established by the Board of Aldermen, 
and the requirements of the TIF Act.  It is anticipated that this schedule will be modified as a result of 
various factors during the course of the planning and implementation process for the TIF program.  

 



Sikeston 60 West TIF Agreement 
08/14/2014 Page 3 of 9 

IV. COMPENSATION 
 
The fee for the completed services will be as stated below.  All fees as stated are exclusive of reimbursable 
expenses which are defined below. 
 
A. The following work tasks as outlined in Exhibit B of this Agreement will be conducted for either the 

lump sum amount not to exceed Thirty-one Thousand Five Hundred Dollars ($31,500) or on an 
hourly basis for and amount not to exceed Seven Thousand Five Hundred ($7,500) dependent of the 
tasks as indicated below: 

 
 

Task Item Fixed 
Fee 

Amount 

Hourly 
Cap 

Amount 
A. Initial Qualifications Analysis $2,500  
B. TIF Redevelopment Plan $29,000  
C. TIF & CID/TDD Revenue Analysis & Cost Benefit Analysis  $7,500 
D. Assistance at Meetings Included Included 

Total $31,500 $7,500 

 
The hourly rates to apply for tasks to be conducted on an hourly basis as indicated above shall be 
charged in accord with the rates as stated below: 
 

PROJECT STAFF HOURLY 
RATE 

Vice President/Senior Consultant $200 
Director, PGAV Planners $175 
Associate Director, PGAV Planners $175 
Senior Project Manager/Senior Architect $160 
Project Architect/Landscape Architect $120 
Project Manager/GIS Manager & Project Planner $110 
Planner/CAD Technician/Landscape Architect $100 
Administrative/Technical Assistance $90 

 
PGAV may submit invoices for partial completion of services for any Task per the above schedule for 
payment. 
 

B. Reimbursable expenses will consist of reasonable travel expenses to and from Sikeston, local mileage, 
long distance telephone charges, express delivery charges, photographic expenses, the cost of print-
ing or other reproduction of documents, fees or charges for documents owned by others, and other 
"out-of-pocket" expenses required to provide the services described.  Such expenses will be billed at 
their direct cost to PGAV. 

 
V. TERMINATION OF AGREEMENT 
 
If the work associated with Section I, Exhibit B, Task C, results in a finding that the Study Area does not, 
in the opinion of PGAV, qualify for redevelopment as contemplated herein, or if for any reason the City 
determines that the project should not proceed, the City will inform PGAV in writing that it wishes to 
terminate this Agreement.  The date of said termination shall occur upon receipt of the written notice of 



Sikeston 60 West TIF Agreement 
08/14/2014 Page 4 of 9 

termination by PGAV via the U.S. Postal Service or facsimile (followed by receipt of an original signature 
copy). 
 
If the City determines that the project should not proceed after it has been initiated, payment to PGAV 
shall be made for the amount of work associated with the completed portions of Tasks described in 
Exhibit B of this Agreement. Payment for partial completion of these Tasks shall be made to PGAV in 
accordance with the hourly rate schedule provided in Section IV, plus the cost of reimbursable expenses. 
 

 
VI. SCOPE OF SERVICES LIMITATIONS 
 
The fee for providing the contracted services are based on the following assumptions: 
 
A. That the number of parcels envisioned to be included in the area to be redeveloped will not be altered 

(either reduced or increased) after the initial qualifications analysis is conducted and the City has 

given PGAV notice to proceed with preparation of the Redevelopment Plan; 

 

B. That the version of the Redevelopment Plan as submitted for the TIF Commission hearing will not 

have substantial revision in the form of boundary changes which are parcel inclusions or exclusions 

and/or that the number of Redevelopment Project Areas will not exceed three (3); 

 

C. That the redevelopment project as described in the Redevelopment Plan and which is the subject of 

the Cost Benefit Analysis will not have substantial and/or multiple changes which impact the finan-

cial spreadsheets developed for the Cost Benefit Analysis and may invoke changes in the Redevelop-

ment Plan cost tables (such as changes in the number of Redevelopment Project Areas stipulated 

above or major revisions to the development plan on which the Redevelopment Plan and Project(s) 

are based; 

 

D. That the number of developer proposals received in the City’s RFP solicitation does not exceed more 

than three; and 

 

E. That the TIF Commission does not request multiple “what if” runs of the Cost Benefit Analysis, does 

not request adjunct studies (market or economic impact analysis, etc.) or require other data research. 

Actions such as those outlined, will increase the cost of the work and will result in a request for additional 
fee. These services shall be considered additional work beyond the scope of this Agreement.  The City 
may request the provision of such services by PGAV at an additional cost to be negotiated and provided 
for in the form of an addendum to this Agreement. 
 
VII.  PROJECT STAFFING & MANAGEMENT 
 
A. PGAV hereby agrees to provide the qualified professional, technical, and clerical staff available within 

the firm to conduct the work in accordance with the tasks as outlined in Exhibit B of this Agreement.  
 



Sikeston 60 West TIF Agreement 
08/14/2014 Page 5 of 9 

B. If, in the opinion of PGAV and the City, a particular assignment requires specialized expertise not 
available within the PGAV staff, the accomplishment of such tasks may be achieved through subcon-
tract with firms or individuals subject to prior written approval of the City. 

 
VIII. OWNERSHIP OF DOCUMENTS 
 
PGAV agrees that any and all reports prepared, and conclusions reached hereunder, are for the confiden-
tial information of the City and that neither PGAV nor any member of the PGAV staff will disclose any 
of the same with any person whatsoever, other than the City or their authorized representatives, except 
when called upon to testify in relation to such report or conclusion under oath in a judicial forum, or as 
may be otherwise required by law. Except to the extent that documents, reports or other information are 
prepared under the provisions of this Agreement and submitted to the City or other public entities 
wherein they become subject to Federal or State “sunshine law” provisions, the City will have sole own-
ership of all reports, maps, etc. prepared under this Agreement, including rights of copying and distribu-
tion. 
 
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Parties hereto have caused this Agreement to be executed this _______ 
day of _____________, 2014. 
 
 
ATTEST:        CITY OF SIKESTON 
 
 
 
____________________________   _______________________________ 
Carroll Couch        Jerry Pullen 
City Clerk        Mayor 
 

 
ATTEST:        PECKHAM GUYTON ALBERS & VIETS, INC. 
 
 
 
_____________________________   ________________________________ 
Mike Weber        John W. Brancaglione 
Director, PGAV Planners     Vice President  
   
  



Sikeston 60 West TIF Agreement 
08/14/2014 Page 6 of 9 

 

  

EXHIBIT A 
STUDY AREA BOUNDARY 

 
   
       Study Area Boundary 

 

 

N 



Sikeston 60 West TIF Agreement 
08/14/2014 Page 7 of 9 

EXHIBIT B 
PROPOSED SCOPE OF WORK   

  

A. TIF Redevelopment Plan 
 

1. Qualification Analysis   
 

a. Based on a group of properties envisioned for designation as the area to be developer or 
redeveloped identified in Exhibit A as the Study Area, PGAV will conduct an investigation 
of existing conditions to evaluate the potential for designation as a “blighted area” in ac-
cord with the provisions of the TIF Act.  PGAV will also conduct an investigation of exist-
ing conditions to evaluate the properties noted above for potential for designation as a 
“blighted area” in accord with the CID Act.  This evaluation will include, but not neces-
sarily be limited to, a review of current conditions and factors present based on the crite-
ria as set forth in the TIF and CID Acts. Note that under the provisions of the CID Act, if 
the Area qualifies as a “blighted area” under the TIF Act it will automatically qualify for 
CID purposes.  Therefore, this task will be a single unified effort. 

  
b. PGAV will meet with the City, the developer, and/or other parties that the City may des-

ignate, to review the findings of the investigation and evaluation described above. 
 

2. Redevelopment Plan  
 
PGAV will prepare a Redevelopment Plan for the designated redevelopment project area that 
addresses the following elements of a Redevelopment Plan under the TIF Act: 
  
a. Plan objectives; 

 
b. General description of the program to be undertaken to accomplish the objectives; 

 
c. Estimated redevelopment project costs; 

 
d. Anticipated sources of funds to pay the costs; 

 
e. Evidence of the commitments to finance the project costs; 

 
f. Anticipated type and term of the sources of funds to pay costs; 

 
g. Anticipated type and terms of the obligations to be issued; 

 
h. Most recent equalized assessed valuation of the Redevelopment Area; 

 
i. An estimate as to the equalized assessed valuation after redevelopment; 

 
j. General land uses to apply in the Redevelopment Area; and 

 



Sikeston 60 West TIF Agreement 
08/14/2014 Page 8 of 9 

k. Such other items necessary to establish a Redevelopment Area pursuant to Section  
99.805 R.S. Mo., as amended, including (except as provided for in Section VI of this Agree-
ment): 

 
1) Development of a master address list for mailing notification letters to taxing dis-

tricts and property owners, and development of newspaper notices required for com-
pliance with TIF Act notification provisions unless otherwise prepared by the City’s 
legal counsel. (Note: the City will be responsible for developing the notification let-
ters, printing and mailing the notification letters, and placement of the published 
notices in the newspaper); 

 
2) The required narrative, tabular, graphic data and map exhibits necessary to consti-

tute the Redevelopment Plan document; 
 

3) Development of a project schedule to be used as the ongoing agenda for program and 
plan implementation; and 

 
4) Coordination of program activities with other participants, including key City staff, 

City Attorney (and Special TIF Counsel/Bond Counsel if any), Investment 
Banker/Bond Underwriter, and potential developers. 

 
B. Revenue Analysis for TIF and/or TDD or CID and Cost/Benefit Analysis 
 

1. Using methodology that PGAV has developed and implemented on many similar projects, 
PGAV will prepare estimates of the various taxes to be generated from the implementation 
of the redevelopment project.  These estimates will cover local taxes from real property, sales 
(including CID and/or TDD revenues, if appropriate), utility, and personal property by the 
phases of the development program and full build-out.  These estimates will form the basis 
for determining potential financing of certain eligible development costs to be financed pub-
licly using TIF assistance that may be authorized by the City.  As a component of the revenue 
projections, PGAV will work with the City and New Madrid County to obtain the most recent 
equalized assessed value and sales volume for the previous calendar year within the proposed 
Redevelopment Area. 
 

2. A cost/benefit analysis will be provided as a separate document for use by the City.  The cost-
benefit analysis will show the potential fiscal impact of the plan on each taxing district that 
is wholly or partially within the boundaries of the Redevelopment Area.  The analysis will 
document the following potential impacts per the TIF Act: 

 
a. If the project is not built; 
 
b. If the project is built pursuant to the redevelopment plan; and 
 
c. The fiscal impact on affected political subdivisions. 

 



Sikeston 60 West TIF Agreement 
08/14/2014 Page 9 of 9 

3. Neither the Revenue Analysis or the Cost/Benefit Analysis are intended to or shall be con-
strued by the City, the Developer, or third parties to satisfy the provisions of TIF Act as con-
tained in R.S. MO 99.810, 1 (5) relative to determination that “the project as proposed is 
financially feasible”.  Such information documenting whether the project, as proposed, is fi-
nancially feasible is to be provided by the Developer. PGAV assumes no responsibility for the 
production or the evaluation of this information. Furthermore the Revenue Analysis and/or 
the Cost/Benefit Analysis as provided for above are intended solely to demonstrate the ele-
ments and information as described above.  These items are not intended to be a substitute 
for the responsible reviews of private lending institutions who may be contemplating or have 
conditionally committed to project financing. 
 

4. For the purposes of this scope of work, PGAV will prepare a separate estimate of the revenue 
to be captured by a CID/TDD for an area that is assumed to be the same as that of the Rede-
velopment Area as outlined above. Some of this revenue will be captured as TIF revenue and 
will also be accounted for in the Cost/Benefit Analysis as noted in the description of task D.2 
above. 
 

E.  Assistance at Meetings 
 
The fee for conducting the work as outlined in the Section IV, Compensation of this proposal is based 
on attending not more than seven (7) meetings including but not limited to the Qualifications Anal-
ysis meeting, the TIF Commission meetings, the public hearings, and the Board of Alderman meetings 
related to the adoption of the TIF Redevelopment Plan.  PGAV will also meet with City staff, City 
Attorney (and Special Counsel/Bond Counsel, if any) and the selected developer as deemed necessary 
by PGAV and the City to perform the services required by the Agreement. 
 

 









1 

 

Council Letter 

 

 
Date of Meeting:   14-08-25 
  
Originating Department:  General Government 
 
To the Mayor and City Council:   
 
Subject:  First Reading of Bill 5966 Terminating Tax Increment Financing within 

Redevelopment Project Area (RPA) of the 60/61 Redevelopment Area.  
 

Attachment(s): 
1. Bill 5966 

 
Action Options:     
1. Conduct first reading of Bill 5966 
2. Other action Council may deem appropriate 
 
Background:     
In 2000, City Council approved the “Redevelopment Plan and Project 60/61”, designating three 
distinct project areas for development using tax increment financing.  Work on Redevelopment 
Project Area 3, was never undertaken.  Council is being asked to terminate tax increment 
financing within this area. 
 
A second reading and Council action on Bill 5966 will be requested during Council’s September 
8, 2014, 

 
 

 

City of Sikeston 



BILL NO.     5966                                                       ORDINANCE NO.5966 
 

 

AN ORDINANCE TERMINATING TAX INCREMENT FINANCING WITHIN 

REDEVELOPMENT PROJECT AREA 3 OF THE 60/61 REDEVELOPMENT 

AREA; DISSOLVING THE ACCOUNT OF THE SPECIAL ALLOCATION 

FUND RELATED THERETO; AND AUTHORIZING CERTAIN ACTIONS 

RELATING THERETO. 

 

WHEREAS, the Real Property Tax Increment Allocation Redevelopment Act, Sections 99.800 

to 99.865 of the Revised Statutes of Missouri, as amended (the “Act”), authorizes municipalities to 

undertake redevelopment projects in blighted, conservation or economic development areas, as defined in 

the Act; and 

 

WHEREAS, on June 5, 2000, the City Council adopted Ordinance No. 5328, approving the 

“Redevelopment Plan and Project, 60/61 Redevelopment Area” (as amended, the “Redevelopment Plan”) 

and designating the redevelopment area described therein (the “Redevelopment Area”) as a 

“redevelopment area” under the Act; and  

 

WHEREAS, the Redevelopment Plan describes a portion of the Redevelopment Area, generally 

consisting of the portion of the Redevelopment Area located west of Business Route U.S. 61 (South 

Kingshighway), as “RPA 3”; and 

 

WHEREAS, the Redevelopment Plan also describes a redevelopment project for RPA 3 (the 

“RPA 3 Redevelopment Project”); and 

 

WHEREAS, on June 5, 2000, the City Council adopted Ordinance No. 5332, approving the RPA 

3 Redevelopment Project and adopting tax increment financing within RPA 3; and 

 

 WHEREAS, the City Council hereby finds that the RPA 3 Redevelopment Project was never 

undertaken and, therefore, it is in the best interest of the City and the other affected taxing districts to 

terminate tax increment financing within RPA 3.  

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

SIKESTON, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS: 

 

Section 1.  The City Council hereby terminates tax increment financing within RPA 3.  

 

Section 2.  The City’s Treasurer or other appropriate official is hereby directed to dissolve the 

RPA 3 Account of the Special Allocation Fund.  The City Council hereby declares all revenues in the 

RPA 3 Account of the Special Allocation Fund, after payment of any administrative expenses related 

thereto, as surplus so that such funds will be paid to the taxing districts from which they originated as 

provided in Section 99.820 of the Act.  The City’s Treasurer or other appropriate official shall pay the 

surplus funds to the County Collector and other appropriate entities, as applicable, for distribution to the 

appropriate taxing districts in the manner provided in the Act.   

 

 Section 3.  The officers, agents and employees of the City are hereby authorized and directed to 

execute all documents and take such necessary steps as they deem necessary and advisable to carry out 

and perform the purpose of this Ordinance. 

 

Section 4.  The sections of this Ordinance shall be severable.  If any section of this Ordinance is 

found by a court of competent jurisdiction to be invalid, the remaining sections shall remain valid, unless 

the court finds that the valid sections are so essential to and inseparably connected with and dependent 

upon the void section that it cannot be presumed that the City Council has or would have enacted the 

valid sections without the void ones, unless the court finds that the valid sections, standing alone, are 

incomplete and are incapable of being executed in accordance with the legislative intent. 

 

Section 5.  Record of Passage: 
 

A.  Bill number 5966 was introduced to the City Council and read the first time on this 25
th
 day 

of August, 2014. 

 

B.  Bill number 5966 was read for the second and final time and discussed on this 8
th
 day of 

September, 2014, and final passage thereon was voted as follows: 

 

Burch _______, Depro ________, Gilmore ________, Pullen  , 

 

Graham________, Harris _________, Teachout _________, 



 - 2 - 

thereby being _________. 

 

C. Ordinance 5966 shall be in full force and effect from and after Wednesday, October 8, 2014.   

 

 

 

  

Mayor Jerry Pullen 

 

 

  

Approved as to form 

Chuck Leible, City Attorney 

 

SEAL/ATTEST 

 

 

  

Carroll L. Couch, City Clerk 

 



 

Council Letter 

 
Date of Meeting:   14-08-25 
  
Originating Department:  Public Works Department 
 
To the Mayor and City Council:   
 

Subject:   Authorization to Seek Repairs to 1998 Vac-Con Truck from EJ Equipment, Inc. of 
Manteno, Illinois 
 

Attachments: 
 

1. Estimate #0063097 for Repairs Totaling $67,273.65 
2. Estimate #0063224 for Repairs Totaling $39,101.49 

 

Action Options:     
 

1. Authorize Repairs 
2. Other action Council may deem appropriate 

 

Background:   
 
One of the challenges ahead of Public Works is the age of our fleet of equipment and trucks.  Over the 
next ten years, we anticipate having to replace approximately $2,000,000 in equipment; many pieces 
needing replacement in the near future. 
 
One of the major pieces of equipment needing immediate attention is our 1998 Vac-Con truck.  This 
vehicle (that we refer to as the ‘sewer truck’) is used for cleaning stormwater pipes.  It has attachments 
and pumps to both spray water and vacuum.  The equipment is no longer functioning properly, and 
needs to be replaced.   
 
Due to the need to replace snow plow outfitted dump trucks first, it does not appear financially feasible 
right now to replace the Vac-Con truck which as an estimated replacement value of $315,000.  So we 
have instead investigated the options of having the truck reconditioned:  replacing vital parts, bearings, 
hoses and fittings, and reconditioning/replacing the primary pumps and fans. 
 
The only authorized service provider available in our area is EJ Equipment from the St. Louis area.  They 
have prepared two estimates.  The first is to recondition all of the water/vacuum equipment including the 
replacement of the primary water pump and vacuum.  This estimate totals $67,273.65.  The second 
estimate is for the same items, however, with the water pump and vacuum being rebuilt, rather than 
replaced.  This second estimate totals $39,101.49. 
 
Unfortunately, until they tear into the equipment, we do not know if the pump and vacuum can be rebuilt 
successfully.  For this reason, we are supplying both estimates for your review and approval.  If the items 
can be rebuilt, then we will proceed accordingly at the lower price.  If we are not able to rebuild the pump 
and vacuum, then we will have to have them replaced at the higher estimate of $67,273.65.   
 
We anticipate that these repairs will extend the life of this Vac-Con truck 5-8 years. 

 
 

 

City of Sikeston 





















 

Council Letter 

 
Date of Meeting:   14-08-25 
  
Originating Department:  Public Works Department 
 
To the Mayor and City Council:   
 

Subject:   Authorization to Re-Appropriate Funds with existing budget 
 
 

Action Options:     
 

1. Authorize the Re-Appropriation  
2. Other action Council may deem appropriate 

 

Background:   
 
Within the Code Enforcement/Building Inspection Division, the vehicles of the four officers are all in need 
of replacement.  Our senior code officer is currently driving a surplus DPS vehicle on a daily basis.  Our 
goal is to replace one vehicle per year for the next four years.  Rather than Ford Rangers, we would like 
utilize full-size pickup trucks.  For the senior code officer, I want to provide a four-door truck so that code 
officers can ride together at times for training purposes. 
 
The approved budget for the replacement of this first vehicle is $10,000.  We have spent the last month 
searching for a vehicle that fits our needs for that budget.  We have looking for a white four-door truck 
that is less than 10 years old with less than 100,000 miles.  After looking in the communities of Sikeston, 
Cape Girardeau, Dexter and Malden, and looking online, we have only found one vehicle. 
 
We have found a 2006 Chevrolet Truck with 60,000 miles that has a prior-salvage title, with a price of 
$11,500 at a dealer in Malden, MO.  This is $1,500 over our approved budget. 
 
In coincidental discussions this week, we learned that DPS came under budget on the rehabilitation of a 
used truck that they have, and that they would be willing to transfer $1,500 of their savings to assist DPW 
with the purchase of this used truck. 
 
We have discussed this internally between the department heads, the city manager, and the city 
treasurer, and everyone has approved the re-appropriation, contingent upon City Council Approval.   

 
 

 

City of Sikeston 



1 

Council Letter 

 

 
Council Letter:  14-08-25 

  
Originating Department:  Administrative Services Department 
 
To the Mayor and City Council: 
 
Subject:   Request for Proposal of Broker Services for Ancillary Employee Benefits 
 
Attachments: 
 None 
 
Action Options: 
 1. Authorize Staff to Proceed with the Bidding of Broker Services Ancillary Employee 

Benefits  
 2. Other action as Council may deem appropriate. 
 
Background: 

Currently, City of Sikeston employees have life insurance through Kansas City Life 
Insurance Company (KC Life) and Healthy Alliance Life Insurance Company (HALIC).  With KC 
Life, coverage is based upon salary and the City pays half of the basic cost. The HALIC policy 
is for $10,000 of coverage for the employee only.  The City pays 80% of that plan.   

 
Staff would like to consider bidding for one life insurance policy that would provide more 

flexibility.  The City could pay 100% of the basic premium and it would automatically cover all 
employees.  The cost should be no more than the two separate premiums we are currently 
paying.  Employees would have the ability to increase to higher levels of coverage if desired, at 
their cost. 

 
City employees do not have an opportunity to purchase dental or vision insurance.  This 

could also be bid, with the employee paying the entire premium.   
 
Staff is requesting permission to solicit requests for proposals for broker services for 

ancillary employee benefits.  Once the proposals have been received, staff will meet with the 
Professional Consulting Committee and following review, a recommendation will be made to 
the City Council for award. 

 
 

 

  

City of Sikeston 



1 

 

Council Letter 

 

 
Date of Meeting: 08-25-14 
 
Originating Department:  Municipal Court Division  
 
To the Mayor and City Council: 
 

Subject:  Repeal of Court’s Domestic Violence Shelter Surcharge Fee 
 
Attachments: 
 None 
 
Action Options: 

1. Direct Staff to draft bill to repeal Municipal Court’s $2 Domestic Violence Shelter Surcharge 
2. Other actions as deemed appropriate. 
 

Background:   
In 2010 the City adopted legislation (City Code 135.310-135.360) implementing a $2.00 

Domestic Violence Shelter Surcharge on violations of municipal ordinances.  Per State statute, 

monies collected via this surcharge are restricted in use and may only be paid to domestic violence 

shelters that serve Sikeston residents. Currently the only shelter meeting these criteria is the House of 

Refuge. 

During a routine audit of Municipal Court by the State Auditor’s Office, the auditor raised 

questions regarding the feasibility of continuing collection of this surcharge. Decreased caseloads 

coupled with installment payment of fines resulted in the collection of $3,953 in surcharge fees during 

calendar year 2013. Surcharge collections during the first six months of 2014 totaled, $1,452. Based 

on these numbers, projected receipts for the full year will be $2,904. The 5% administration fee, $145, 

the City is allowed to retain will not sufficiently cover the cost of collection, distribution and general 

administration of the surcharge program. Last year, the House of Refuge did not apply for funding 

through this program.  

Newly adopted State law authorizes the Domestic Violence Shelter Surcharge to be increased 

to $4.00. The City, therefore, is faced with the choice of eliminating the surcharge based on the cost 

of collection, or increasing the surcharge to $4.00. Before making a recommendation, City Staff 

reviewed the House of Refuge’s annual budget (as provided in their funding application) to determine 

the impact of the City’s surcharge fee. The House of Refuge’s 2013 budgeted revenues were 

estimated to be $206,966. Revenue from the domestic violence shelter surcharge’s net proceeds 

($3,755.35) is 1.8% of the Shelter’s total annual revenue.   

At this time Staff is requesting Council authorization to draft legislation to repeal the City’s 

domestic violence surcharge fee. If permitted to proceed with this recommendation the ordinance will 

City of Sikeston 



 Page 2 

 

authorize the City to remit all surcharges assessed prior to the repeal and collected following the 

repeal to the Shelter. The Shelter’s Board Chairman, Terri Wallace, has been advised of Staff’s 

recommendation.  She requested monies collected after the repeal be paid to the Shelter on a semi-

annual basis.  



1 

 

Council Letter 

 

 
Date of Meeting:   14-08-25 
 
Department:  Governmental Services 
  
To the Mayor and City Council:   
 
Subject:     Briefing, 2014 Boards and Commissions Appointments 
  
Attachments:  

1.  Boards and Commissions Appointment Summary 
2.  2014 Citizens Resource Bank Applicants List 
3.  2014 Boards and Commissions Appointee List 

 
Action Options:     
 Briefing:  Action will be requested during the September 8 meeting 
 
Background:     

On September 8, Council will be asked to take action on the appointment or reappointment 
of residents to 32 positions on 16 boards and commissions. To assist you in this process, a 
summary of each board/commission and its responsibilities is provided below. 

 
Attachment #1 is an overview of each board/commission for which an appointment is 

needed. This summary includes attendance data and a listing of citizens seeking a Council 
appointment.  City records have been reviewed to identify current appointees and applicants with 
outstanding taxes.  These individuals were notified by mail and asked to resolve the matter prior to 
September 1, 2014.  Current outstanding amounts are noted on attachments #2 and #3. 

 
OVERVIEW, SIKESTON BOARDS AND COMMISSIONS  

 
Autonomous (executive) boards and commissions on which appointments will be made 

include the following: 
 
Board of Adjustments:  This is a quasi-judicial body which makes rulings on appeals 

resulting from decisions made by a zoning officer or to grant relief from the literal enforcement of 
zoning ordinances in certain hardship cases. This board meets on an as-needed basis. 

 
Board of Appeals:  This board hears appeals relative to the enforcement of the 

International Building Code, as adopted by the City. It also meets on an as-needed basis. 
 
Board of Municipal Utilities Commission: This commission oversees general operations 

of the Board of Municipal Utilities: electric generation and distribution; water supply, treatment and 
distribution; and operation of the sanitary sewer system and wastewater treatment. It meets at 4 
PM on the second Tuesday of each month. 

 

 
 

 

City of Sikeston 



 Page 2 

 

Housing Authority Commission: The Housing Authority is a municipal corporation under 
contract with the Federal government to provide decent, safe, and sanitary non-luxurious housing 
at an affordable cost to low income families and individuals. It meets at noon on the second 
Monday of each month. 

 
Industrial Development Authority: The IDA is a not-for-profit corporation that promotes 

and solicits industrial and economic development projects. Locally this has primarily been done 
through the issuance of bonds.  It meets on an as-needed basis. 

 
Land Clearance Redevelopment Authority Commission:  Created by Sikeston's voters, 

the Commission is charged with identifying "blighted" areas, developing, and implementing a plan 
to provide well-organized residential neighborhoods of decent homes. It meets at 11:30 AM on the 
third Monday of the month.  

 
Advisory boards/commissions on which appointments will be made include the 
 
Enhanced Enterprise Zone Board: This board advises Council on the designation of 

enhanced enterprise zones.  After designation of a zone, the board reviews and assesses zone 
activities, and submits required State reports. It meets on an as-needed basis. 

 
Park Board:  This board advises Council on issues related to park services and facilities. 

This includes the development of short and long-term plans and identification of funding needs. It 
meets at 5:15 PM on the second Monday of the month. 

 
Planning & Zoning Commission:  The Commission provides recommendation on all 

zoning issues and subdivision approvals.  It is also charged with developing the City's plan for 
physical development, including the use of land, location of streets, public grounds and public 
utilities. It meets on an as-needed basis. 

 
Public Safety Advisory Board:  This board recommends programs to enhance good 

community relations and monitors community concerns.  It meets at 6:30 PM on the third Monday 
of every other month. 

 
Rental Ordinance Appeals Board:  Created as part of the City's effort to preserve the 

quality of Sikeston's housing inventory and to protect neighborhoods from neglect and 
deterioration, the Appeals Board hears and makes determination on appeals resulting from the 
application and enforcement of the City's Rental Property Standards.  It meets on an as-needed 
basis. 

 
Strategic Plan Implementation Commission:  The Commission assists with the 

implementation of the community goals identified in the 2009 "Vision for Tomorrow" Strategic Plan, 
and communicates the plan's progress to the community.  It meets at 11 AM on the third Thursday 
of each month. 

 
Tax Increment Finance Commission:  This Commission is convened to study the 

economic viability of proposed development projects seeking to use tax increment financing.  It 
meets on an as-needed basis.  

 
Tourism Advisory Board:  This board works with the Convention & Visitors Bureau to 

promote and market the local tourism/hospitality industry. It meets at 4 PM, on the fourth Thursday 
of every other month. 



 Page 3 

 

 
Traffic Committee:  The Committee hears requests and makes recommendation to 

Council on traffic-related matters (speed limits, no-parking zones, erection of traffic signs.)  It meets 
on an as-needed basis. 

 
SEMO University, Sikeston Campus Advisory Council:  Established under the funding 

agreement between the City and SEMO University, this Advisory Council provides input to the 
SEMO University Board of Regents on local curriculum.  It meets on the last Wednesday of each 
quarter at 10:30 AM. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
































	Agenda

	1st & 2nd Reading, Bill #5965, Approval of 2014 Tax Rate

	2nd Reading, Bill #5964, Increase in BMU Electrical Rates

	2nd Reading, Bill #5961, Manufactured Homes

	Resolution 14-08-01, Authorizing Preliminary Funding Agreement

	Resolution 14-08-02, Authorizing the City to Engage Gilmore & Bell and PGAV as Planning Consultants for Proposed TIF Project

	Bill #5966, Termination of Redevelopment Project Area 3 of 60/61 TIF District

	Authorization to Repair 1998 Vac-Con Sewer Truck

	Authorization to Re-Appropriate Funding for Purchase of Used DPW Vehicle

	Request to Bid Broker Services for Ancillary Employees Benefits

	Domestic Violence Shelter Surcharge Fee

	2014 Boards & Commissions Appointments



