
WAUPACA COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
2022 Miscellaneous Materials Bid Summary

Concrete Culvert Pipes

Crushed Stone

Grass Seed

Erosion Control

Pavement Grinding

Pavement Reclamation

Ready-Mixed Concrete

Trucking of Materials

Curb and Gutter

Plastic Culvert

Tree Trimming

Asphaltic Mixture Materials and Surface Treatments

Bituminous Paving Mix Material

Concrete Sand

Silt Fence Installation



2022 CONCRETE CULVERT BID 

3/1/2022

 

Bidder 12" 15" 18" 24" 30" 36" Comments

County 

Materials
RCCP 

Class V

(Green Bay, WI) Endwall No Bid

 



2022 CRUSHED STONE BIDS

3/1/2022

Go Green 

Recycling LLC
  MCC, Inc.

  Faulks Bros 

Const, Inc. Northeast Asphalt 

Milestone 

Materials Bazile's Hills, Inc. American Asphalt

Shawano Cty 

Highway Lycon

Dense 

Graded Base 

Course             

1 1/4"

$ Per Ton $5.60 $7.90 $7.90 $8.40 / $5.50 / $7.85 $6.55
Self Loaded      

$6.20
$7.85

Quarry Fremont New London Readfield Marion/Larsen/Shawano
Boulder Hill 

Somers Pit
Town of Wyoming Shawano

Dense 

Graded Base 

Course       

3/4"

$ Per Ton $5.60 $7.90 $7.90 $8.60 / $5.90 / $7.85 $6.55
Sel Loaded      

$6.40

3/4" Recycled 

Blended Base        

$6.75 / $7.00

$7.85

Quarry Fremont New London Readfield Marion/Larsen/Shawano
Boulder Hill 

Somers Pit
Town of Wyoming Thiel / Q-Pit Shawano

Stone        

Chips       

5/16" $ Per Ton

$10.70 Call

Quarry New London Readfield

Breaker      

Run

Size 3" 6" 4" / 2.75"

6" Larsen $5.20              

3" Larsen $5.30              

5" Shawano $7.60

4" Not Sized

$ Per Ton $5.75 $7.90 $7.80 $6.65 Self Loaded $6.80

Quarry Fremont New London Readfield Tn of Wyoming Shawano

Clear Stone - 

3/4"
$ Per Ton $6.60 $9.00 $9.50 / $9.10 / $9.10 $9.85

Quarry Fremont New London Readfield /Foley/ K Pit Shawano

 

Buckshot - 

Pea Gravel $ Per Ton
$13.30 $6.00 $8.20

Quarry K-Pit Marion Colrue

Screenings $ Per Ton $5.00 $5.65 $9.10 $8.30 / $11.00

Quarry Fremont New London Readfield Shawano / Larsen

 



2022 CRUSHED STONE BIDS

3/1/2022

Go Green 

Recycling LLC
  MCC, Inc.

  Faulks Bros 

Const, Inc. Northeast Asphalt 

Milestone 

Materials Bazile's Hills, Inc. American Asphalt

Shawano Cty 

Highway Lycon

Heavy Rip 

Rap, 18" - 24" $ Per Ton

$11.75 $16.95 $17.50 $30.00

Quarry Fremont New London Readfield Larsen

Medium Rip 

Rap, 5"-8" $ Per Ton
$16.95 $17.50

Quarry New London Readfield

Road Gravel K-Pit Call Brandon @ 1/2" Base Coarse

3/4" 262-443-9059 for all sites Shawano

$8.00 $7.85

Marion price is self load

unless plant is at site

Call Larsen & Shawano

3 days in 

advance for >500T

Call well in advance for

rip rap orders



2022 GRASS SEED

3/1/2022

Bidder
Premium Lawn 

Seed / lb

WCHD per batch   

(1900#)

ALG Supply  $3.99 3.39/LB

Granton, WI Sun & Shade

Prices in effect through June 2022

Jay-Mar $4.40 $2,397.50

Plover, WI 25# Bags $110.00

Prices in effect through August 15, 2022

Deer Creek Seed

Almond, WI $2.47

Prices in effect through February 15, 2022



2022 EROSION CONTROL BID 3/1/2022  
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Brock White

Green Bay No Bid

Hanes Geo

Components No Bid

Menomonee Falls

Farrell Equip.

and Supply $24.00 $27.00 $25.00 $12.00 $395.00 NA $0.32 NA NA NA $1.58 $1.04 $362.00

Weston, WI 14"x 26" All Sizes Non-Stock Non Stock

Freight Additional Freight Add.

Reinders 

Sussex No Bid



2022 PAVEMENT GRINDING  & LOADING BIDS 3/1/2022

Bidder Make / Model HP Rate / Width / Depth $/Hour Mobilization

Cleanup 

per Hour

W.K. Construction Wirtgen W250 1000 / 8' or 12' / 12" $1,055.00 $975.00 $565.00

Company, Inc. Wirtgen W120F 250 / 4' / 12" $735.00 $850.00 $565.00

(2 -3 day response)

Northeast Asphalt Wirtgen W250i 990 / 8' / 14" $835.00 $790.00 $200.00

Wirtgen W50 120 / 20" / 8" $390.00 $370.00 NA

Wirtgen W120CFI 345/ 3' or 4' / 13" $560.00 $520.00 $160.00

Pavement Maintenance Wirtgen W250 1000 / 8'  / 12" $750.00 $1,200.00 $600.00

Inc Wirtgen W220Fi 800 / 8' / 12" $750.00 $1,200.00 $600.00

Wirtgen W150 400 / 2', 3', 4' / 12" $475.00 $1,000.00 $600.00

MCC Inc Wirtgen W210I 755 / 7' 3"  / 13" $775.00 $525.00 $350.00

(5 day response) Wirtgen W35 61 / 14" / 4" $300.00 $250.00 $350.00

Tri-County Paving

Inc. Wirtgen W220 766 / 8' / 22" $600.00 $1,200.00 $550.00

(14 day response)

(2-3 day response)

(7 day response)



2022 PAVEMENT RECLAMATION BIDS

3/1/2022

Bidder Make / Model HP Rate / Width / Depth $/Hour Mobilization

W.K. Construction Company, Inc. Wirtgen WR250 700 / 8' / 16" $743.00 $800.00

(2 - 3 day response)

Northeast Asphalt Terex RS950B 950 / 8'/ 16" $560.00 $600.00

Wirtgen WR250 766 / 8' / 22" $560.00 $600.00

Pavement Maintenance Inc Wirtgen WR250 800 / 8' / 12" $380.00 $650.00

MCC, Inc. Wirtgen W2500 650 / 8' / 16" $485.00 $400.00

(5 day response)

Tri-County Paving, Inc. Wirtgen W250 766 / 8' / 22" $550.00 $1,750.00

(14 day response)

(2-3 days response)

(No response specified)



2022 READY-MIXED CONCRETE BID SUMMARY

3/1/2022

Bidder 7 Bag Mix 9 Bag Mix Additional Charges Per SY

(0-20m) (20-40m) (0-20m) (20-40m) Macrofiber Mesh Microfiber Mesh Hot Water Winter Service Small Load Chg

MCC Inc. $131.00 $131.00 $143.00 $143.00 $18.00 $9.00 $4.25 $8.50 $200.00

Nov 1st - May 1st 4 cu yds

Carew Concrete $129.00 $133.00 $139.00 $143.00 $20.00 $9.00 $8.50 $9.00 $175.00

Nov 1st - Mar 31 4.25 cu yds

Lycon $138.00 $138.00 $148.00 $148.00 $16.50 $9.00 $10.00 $10.00 $100.00

No certificate of insurance on file Nov 1st - April 15th 4 cu yds

Red-D-Mix $129.00 $129.00 $139.00 $139.00 $7.00 $9.00 $5.00 $10.00 $150.00

Nov 1st-March 31st 4 cu yds



2022 TRUCKING OF MATERIALS BIDS

Bidder

Quad-Axle 

Truck

Semi-Truck 

and Dump
Comments

(Hourly price with operator)

Faulks Brothers Waupaca $115.00

MCC NewLondon $115.00

3/1/2022



2022 CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER, SIDEWALK AND DRIVEWAY BIDS

Bidder

Type A  - 

24" Curb 

and 

Gutter

Type D - 

30" Curb 

and 

Gutter

Type D - 

36"         

6" Sloped 

Curb and 

Gutter

Type D - 

36" 

Mountable 

Curb and 

Gutter

4" 

Sidewalk

6" 

Sidewalk

Curb Ramp, 

Detectable 

Warning 

Field, 

Natural 

Patina

6" 

Driveway

6" 

Driveway 

HES

Concrete 

Steps

UOM LF SF SF SF SF SF SF

Jim Fischer Inc. $29.75

Sommers Construction $34.00

3/1/2022



2022 PLASTIC CULVERT BIDS

3/1/2022

Bidder 15" 18" 24" 30" 36" 48" 60"

Farrell Equipment culvert $11.05 $15.15 $26.23 $37.85 $46.60 $80.30 $126.74

Valid through 12/31/2022

Green Bay Highway Products culvert $11.39 $15.22 $23.74 $34.51 $45.38 $76.01 $129.04

Valid through 12/31/2022

.



2022 TREE TRIMMING BID

Bidder

Bucket Truck 

& Operator

Bucket Truck, 

Operator, & 

Ground Man

Boom 

Working 

Height-FT

Comments

Hourly price with operator(s)

Midstate Tree Service New London $140.00 $180.00 80-115

3/1/2022

BC 1800 Chipper Rental $45/Hour



2022 Asphaltic Mixture Materials and Surface Treatments

3/1/2022 Fahrner Flint Hills Meigs

Emulsified 

Asphalt 

Material Pr Per Gal Applied Type HFRS-2
$0.37 CRS-2 $2.20 $2.4128

Type HFRS-2P $0.37 CRS-2P $2.45 $2.6328

Price/Gallon Type CSS-1H D50(Tack) $1.120 FOB $1.27

Time Allocated 

to Unload 

Transport

Hours NA Unlimited Unlimited

Demurrage 

Rate
Per Hour $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Refinery 

Location
NA Rosemount, MN Portage, WI

Truck Terminal 

Location

NA
Stevens Point, WI       

Dubuque, IA
Portage, WI

*Prices quoted are for 

application ONLY; 

material bid by Flint Hills

No warranty gauranteeing 

product.  Product does not 

meet bid specifications.

*Application charges of     

$0.25/gallon are included 

will be invoiced separately 

by Meigs Advantage, LLC



2022 Hotmix Production

3/1/2022

Northeast Asphalt MCC Inc American Asphalt

2MT Price/Ton $62.00 $51.10

58-28S Plant Location Seymour/Mackville Thiel Pit

3LT Price/Ton $50.80 / $46.90 / $50.35 $51.25 $48.50

58-28S Plant Location Larsen/Marion/Shawano Seymour/Mackville Thiel Pit

3MT Price/Ton $51.80 / $47.15 / $51.65 $53.00 $49.65

58-28S Plant Location Larsen/Marion/Shawano Seymour/Mackville Thiel Pit

4LT Price/Ton $52.95 / $48.30 / $52.95 $57.50 $49.20

58-28S Plant Location Larsen/Marion/Shawano Seymour/Mackville Thiel Pit

4MT Price/Ton $54.90 / $48.95 / $53.90 $54.90 $51.60

58-28S Quarry Larsen/Marion/Shawano Seymour/Mackville Thiel Pit

5LT Price/Ton $58.60 / NA / $58.40 $66.65

58-28S Quarry Larsen/Marion/Shawano Seymour/Mackville

5MT Price/Ton $59.55 / NA / $59.45 $66.65 $58.74

58-28S Quarry Larsen/Marion/Shawano Seymour/Mackville Thiel Pit

Cold Patch Price/Ton $104.75 $75.60

Production Quarry Larsen Arnott

9.5MM SC250

Cold Patch Price/Ton $90.00 $78.76

Production Quarry Mackville Arnott

HFE1000 Polymer

 

 



2022 Concrete Sand (Winter Sand/Salt Production)

3/1/2022

Bidder

Price Per Ton-

Washed

Price Per Ton-

Dry Screened

Sand / Salt 

Mixture

Comments

Quarry Quarry Quarry

Faulks Bros $6.75

K-Pit

Fill Sand

Lycon $4.45 $2.45

Colrue Colrue

Preuss Sand Pit $4.00

Across from N1303 CTH K

N7934 Roland Rd.  Ogdensburg



2022 Silt Fence Installation

3/1/2022

Bidder Price Per LF Comments

Highway Landscapers $3.00

Trench-It Environmental $2.25


